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Danville Area Community College 
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Mission Statement 

Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 
quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences that 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 

Non-Discrimination Statement 
Danville Area Community College does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, disability 

or age in its programs and activities.  Inquiries may be directed to Jill A. Cranmore, Vice President, Human 
Resources, Affirmative Action Officer, Title IX Coordinator, and Section 504/ADA Coordinator, Danville Area 

Community College, 2000 E. Main St., Martin Luther King Memorial Way, Danville, IL  61832-5199,         
217-443-8756, or j.cranmore@dacc.edu. 



 
 
 
 
 
 
  
  

 
 
Danville Area Community College will continue to be nationally recognized leader in student 
success and an active partner in building and maintaining academic excellence and the 
economic vitality of the communities it serves. 

 
 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, 
employees, community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 
Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 
Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual 
growth of those we serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing 
world.   
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Vision Statement 



BOARD OF TRUSTEES 

Community College District No. 507 

Regular Meeting 

Danville Area Community College 

Vermilion Hall Room 302 

Thursday, December 18, 2025 

5:30 p.m. 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order

2. Pledge of Allegiance

3. Roll Call

4. Adoption of Agenda

5. Recognition of Visitors

6. Inside the College: Game Design Students

7. Financial Update

8. President’s Report

9. Public Comment

11. Unfinished Business

12. New Business

A. Board Consideration of Human Resources Report

B. Board Consideration of Approval of Travel Expenditures for Trustees

C. Board Consideration of Resolution to Establish Danville Area Community College Police 
Department

D. Board Consideration of New Board Policy

1. Board Policy # 1020.1 – College Trustee Standards and Ethics

E. Board Consideration of Worker’s Compensation Insurance for 2026

F. Board Discussion of Space Utilization Study

G. Board Consideration of Voluntary Separation Program
H. Board Consideration of Approval of Bids for Masonry Work

13. Information

A. Trustee Comments

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 

enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should 

so request before approval of the agenda. 

10. Consent Agenda

A. Board Consideration of Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting of November 20, 2025

B. Financial Report

C. Clery Security Report



Danville Area Community College 

Board Meeting Agenda, Page 2 

December 18, 2025 

B. Communications

14. Adjournment

DECEMBER 

18 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting; 5:30PM; Vermilion Hall Room 302 

24-31 Winter Break – College Closed 

JANUARY 

1-2 Winter Break – College Closed 

5 Campus Offices Reopen 

8 Vermilion County High School Wrestling Tournament; Mary Miller Gym 

12 Spring Semester Begins 

16-24 Vermilion County Principals’ Assoc. High School Boys & Girls Basketball 

Tournament & Cheerleading Competition; Mary Miller Gym 

          19 Martin Luther King, Jr. Holiday Observed – Campus Closed 
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Inside the College:   Game Design Students 
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Financial Update 
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FY26 FY25 FY24/FY23
OPERATING FUNDS APPROVED YTD % YTD YTD Variance

(EDUCATION; OPERATIONS & MAINTENANCE) BUDGET 11/30/2025 OF TOTAL 11/30/2024 % Fav (Unfav)

REVENUES

1   Property Tax Revenue 7,295,000 3,036,981 42 % 2,903,983 42% % 132,998
2   Personal Property Replacement Tax (PPRT) 600,000 163,229 27 % (A) 187,975 17% % (24,746)
3   ICCB Base Operating Grants 1,488,374 710,283 48 % (B) 749,558 47% % (39,275)
4   ICCB Equalization Grant 2,359,970 983,321 42 % (B) 707,592 42% % 275,729
5   CTE Vocational Cr Hr Reimbursement 191,370 0 0 % (B) 95,685 50% % (95,685)
6   Tuition 7,980,000 6,085,963 76 % (C) 5,583,302 79% % 502,661
7   Fees 2,380,000 1,888,179 79 % (C) 1,558,976 66% % 329,203
8   Less:  Institutional Scholarships/Waivers (2,700,000) (2,131,006) 79 % (C) (1,921,291) 74% % (209,715)
9   Interest Income 15,000 1,245 8 % (D) 7,101 47% % (5,856)

10   Transfers from Other Funds 1,450,000 0 0 % (D) 0 0% % 0
11   Facility Rent Revenue/Chargebacks/Other 480,286 70,369 15 % (D) 49,440 19% % 20,929

13 TOTAL OPERATING REVENUES 21,540,000 10,808,564 50 % 9,922,321 48% % 886,243

EXPENDITURES BY OBJECT

14   Salaries 13,483,837 5,692,134 42 % 5,567,570 43% % (124,564)
15   Employee Benefits 2,952,473 1,234,583 42 % 1,173,004 41% % (61,579)
16   Contractual Services 1,058,196 476,079 45 % 433,943 50% % (42,136)
17   Materials & Supplies 1,919,249 1,099,599 57 % (E) 1,169,955 60% % 70,356
18   Meetings, Travel, Conferences 412,617 117,673 29 % (D) 122,767 31% % 5,094
19   Fixed Charges 313,403 237,508 76 % (D) 215,879 65% % (21,629)
20   Utilities 1,200,000 420,458 35 % (F) 429,904 37% % 9,446
21   Capital Outlay 159,000 0 0 % (D) 17,224 0% % 17,224
22   Transfers to other Funds/Other 41,225 19,622 48 % (D) 21,392 71% % 1,770

23 TOTAL OPERATING EXPENDITURES 21,540,000 9,297,656 43 % 9,151,638 44% % (146,018)

24 NET REVENUE/(EXPENDITURE) 0 1,510,908 770,683 740,225

NOTES:

(A) Majority of revenue is received in the second half of the fiscal year.
(B) Amounts received from ICCB will not be even.
(C) Revenue is primarily received at the beginning of each semester and institutional waivers/scholarships are awarded

near the beginning of the semester. Variance from prior year is also due to the timing of registration.
(D) This revenue or expense item does not occur evenly over the year.
(E) Instructional material and supply spending is accelerated prior to the beginning of each semester.
(F) Payments on utility bills are approximately two months in arrears.  Invoice for July service has a

billing date of August and a payment due date of September.

Target - 42%

DANVILLE AREA COMMUNITY COLLEGE

FINANCIAL STATEMENT OF REVENUE AND EXPENDITURES
FOR  THE OPERATING FUNDS

 FY26 - Year to Date - July 1, 2025 - November 30, 2025
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President’s Report 

4



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 9 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Public Comment 
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 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 10A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of Minutes of the  
Regular Board Meeting of November 20, 2025 
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MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF NOVEMBER 20, 2025 
On November 20, 2025, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall Room 302, at Danville Area Community 
College.       
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Wolfe called the meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE   
Presidential Scholar Draycee Nelson led the Board and those in attendance in reciting the Pledge 
of Allegiance.   
 
ITEM 3:  ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present:  Sandra Finch, Caroline Harby, Dylan Haun (via phone), 
Terry Hill, Lisa Martin, Maruti Seth, Greg Wolfe, and Student Trustee Cole Crawley.  
 
Others present:  President Dr. Randall Fletcher, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Tammy 
Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Lara Conklin, Brian Hensgen, Doug Hunter, Kathy Hunter, Todd 
Flessner, Dean Graves, Mrs. Graves, Draycee Nelson, Katie Mickle, and Chief Nathan Howie. 
 
Media present:  Steve Brandy, Vermilion County First. 
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Wolfe asked if there were any changes requested to the agenda.  With no changes requested, 
upon motion by Ms. Finch, and a second by Ms. Harby, the agenda was approved as presented.  
The motion passed by unanimous voice vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.  
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
Dr. Fletcher introduced the following:  Tammy Betancourt, Vice President, Finance/Chief 
Financial Officer; Jill Cranmore, Vice President, Human Resources & Labor Relations; Lara 
Conklin, Executive Director, College Relations; Brian Hensgen, Assistant Vice President, 
Student Services; Doug Hunter, Professor, Mechatronics; Kathy Hunter, Professor, Information 
Systems; Todd Flessner, Professor, Manufacturing Equipment Technology; Dean Graves, 
Professor, Automotive; Mrs. Graves; Draycee Nelson, Presidential Scholar; Katie Mickle, 
Coordinator, Administrative Services; and Nathan Howie, Chief, Security. 
 
ITEM 6: REPORT ON ICCTA/ACCT GOVERNANCE INSTITUTE TRAINING, 

NAPERVILLE, IL, NOVEMBER 13-15, 2025 
Chairman Wolfe and Dr. Fletcher provided a report on the ICCTA/ACCT Governance Institute 
Training in Naperville, IL on November 13-15, 2025. 
 
ITEM 7: FINANCIAL UPDATE 
The Financial Statement of Revenue and Expenditures ending October 31, 2025 was included 
in the Board agenda book.  
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ITEM 8: PRESIDENT’S REPORT  
Dr. Fletcher reported that headcount is up 4.75% for the 60th day enrollment for fall of 2025.  He 
attended the Hoopeston Economic Development meeting on Tuesday and will be attending a 
business and industry tour in Hoopeston in early 2026.   
 
Dr. Fletcher thanked Professor Dana Wheeler and her culinary students for providing the 
Thanksgiving meal for employees.   
 
Dr. Fletcher recently met with Tracy Wahlfeldt from Vermilion Advantage to discuss strategies 
moving forward in 2026.  The College is very active and will continue to partner with economic 
programs.     
 
ITEM 9:   PUBLIC COMMENT 
There was no public comment. 
 
ITEM 10: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE REGULAR 
BOARD MEETING OF OCTOBER 30, 2025 

B.  FINANCIAL REPORT 
  C.  CLERY SECURITY REPORT   
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Ms. Finch, the Board approved the items on the 
Consent Agenda.  The motion passed by roll call vote: 8 yeas, 0 nays.  

    
ITEM 11: UNFINISHED BUSINESS   
 
ITEM 12:  NEW BUSINESS 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 
Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources processes being 
met.  
 
Upon motion by Mr. Seth, and second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the Human Resources 
Report.  The motion passed by roll call vote: 8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

B. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 
EXPENDITURES 

Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel Expense Control Act,” travel 
expenses for members of the Board of Trustees must be approved at an open meeting of the 
Board. 
 
A total of $941.32 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over the last month.  The 
expenses were $669.52 for the ACCT National Legislative Summit on October 21-25, 2025 in 
New Orleans, LA for Mr. Greg Wolfe; and $271.80 for the ICCTA Meeting on November 13-15, 
2025 in Naperville, IL for Mr. Greg Wolfe. 
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Upon motion by Ms. Martin, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved travel expenditures 
for trustees over the last month.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION PROVIDING FOR 
THE ISSUE OF NOT TO EXCEED $1,500,000 GENERAL 
OBLIGATION COMMUNITY COLLEGE BONDS, SERIES 2025, OF 
THE DISTRICT FOR THE PURPOSE OF PAYING CLAIMS 
AGAINST THE DISTRICT, PROVIDING FOR THE LEVY OF A 
DIRECT ANNUAL TAX SUFFICIENT TO PAY THE PRINCIPAL 
AND INTEREST OF SAID BONDS, AND AUTHORIZING THE SALE 
OF SAID BONDS TO THE PURCHASER THEREOF 

The College currently has an outstanding debt of $1,500,000 which will be used upgrade 
technology and purchase equipment to provide state-of-the-art capital resources in our 
classrooms and supporting services.   
 
To meet the principal and interest obligations of this debt, the College must pursue issuing 
Technology and Equipment Funding Bonds in the amount of $1,500,000.     
 
A tax levy will be necessary to provide the funds to meet the principal and interest payment 
schedule of the Bonds.  According to the estimated EAV trends and the planned payment 
schedule, the bond issuance will result in an overall debt service tax rate that aligns more closely 
with historical levels. 
 
The Resolution in the Board packet authorizes the issuance of the bonds, describes the 
procedures for issuing the bonds, sets forth the details of the bonds including the purchaser and 
the interest rate, and levies a tax sufficient to pay the debt service on the bonds.      
 
Upon motion by Mr. Seth, and a second by Ms. Martin, the Board approved the Resolution 
providing for the issue of not to exceed $1,500,000 General Obligation Community College 
Bonds, Series 2025, of the District for the purpose of paying claims against the District, 
providing for the levy of a direct annual tax sufficient to pay the principal and interest on said 
bonds, and authorizing the sale of said bonds to the purchaser thereof.  The motion passed by roll 
call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR A 2025 WHEELCHAIR 
ACCESSIBLE MINIBUS 

The College is in need of purchasing a wheelchair accessible minibus.   
 
Bids were advertised in the News Gazette and Commercial News (including the Internet) for the 
purchase of a 2025 Wheelchair accessible minibus (12 passenger plus 2 wheelchair positions) 
with various specifications. 
 
Bid packets were sent to the following suppliers and opened at 10:00 AM on November 13, 
2025, with the following results: 
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$113,291.00  Midwest Transit Equipment, Kankakee, IL 
$125,877.60  Masters Transportation, Inc., Belton, MO 
NO BID  Courtesy Ford, Danville, IL 
NO BID  Vermilion Chevrolet, Tilton, IL 
NO BID  Toyota of Danville, Tilton, IL 
NO BID  Patriot Motors, Danville, IL 
NO BID  Napleton’s Auto Park, Urbana, IL 
NO BID  Illini Nissan, Champaign, IL 
NO BID  Heartland Ford, Covington, IN 
NO BID  Champaign Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram, Champaign,  
 
Funding for the minibus will be from operating funds. 
 
Upon motion by Ms. Martin, and a second by Mr. Hill the Board approved the purchase of a 
2025 Wheelchair accessible minibus from Midwest Transit Equipment in the amount of  
$113,291.00.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

E. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF PURCHASE OF ELECTRONIC 
SCOREBOARD 

The College entered into a lease with the City of Danville to operate and manage the Winter Park 
east and west softball fields through December 31, 2034.  As a college-level softball team, 
having an operating, modern scoreboard at the facility is needed for games, recruiting, and 
marketing of the College. 
 
Bids were advertised in the News Gazette and Commercial News (including the Internet) for the 
purchase of a 7-inning LED electronic scoreboard. 
 
Bids packets were sent to the following suppliers and opened at 10:00 AM on November 5, 
2025, with the following results: 
   
$33,663.00  Gymnasium Matters, LLC, Hawthorn Woods, IL 
$37,242.00  Watchfire, Danville, IL 
$44,787.00  Daktronics, Brookings, SD 
NO BID  OES, London, Ontario, Canada 
NO BID  BSN Sports, Dallas, TX 
NO BID  Duke Mcginnis/Camilla Hester, Valley Cottage, NY 
  
Funding for the electronic scoreboard will be from Technology/Equipment Bond proceeds. 
 
Upon motion by Ms. Finch, and a second by Ms. Harby, the Board denied the purchase of an 
electronic scoreboard from Gymnasium Matters, LLC in the amount of $33,663.  The motion 
failed by roll call vote:  1 yea, 6 nays (Haun, Seth, Hill, Finch, Harby, Wolfe), 1 abstain 
(Crawley). 
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F. BOARD DISCUSSION OF COLLEGE TRUSTEE STANDARDS AND 

ETHICS 
The College Trustee Standards and Ethics details standards of practice, emphasizing the Board’s 
role in creating a student-focused learning environment, establishing college policies, and 
ensuring sound fiscal management.  The document also includes a code of ethics, stressing the 
importance of informed decision-making, harmonious collaboration among board members, and 
prioritizing the community’s well-being over personal gain.  Overall, the standards and code 
collectively serve as a comprehensive guide for trustees, promoting accountable, ethical, and 
effective governance within a community college setting. 
 
The standards are for discussion only at the November meeting, with possible action at the 
December meeting. 
 

G. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF MAKING WRITTEN CLOSED  
SESSION MINUTES OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 

Public Act 85-1355 requires community college boards to review the written minutes of closed 
sessions in order to determine which written minutes may be, in whole or in part, made a part of 
the public record. 
 
We have reviewed the minutes of the Closed Sessions of: 
March 24, 1987 August 22, 2024 January 29, 2025 
September 26, 2000 September 12, 2024 April 16, 2025 
October 24, 2000 September 16, 2024 April 24, 2025 
May 23, 2006 October 3, 2024 May 19, 2025 
April 26, 2011 October 11, 2024 May 22, 2025 
January 24, 2019 October 24, 2024 June 17, 2025* 
June 22, 2023 November 6, 2024 June 26, 2025* 
March 28, 2024 November 12, 2024 July 9, 2025* 
June 27, 2024 November 21, 2024 August 21, 2025* 
 
It is recommended that the above written Closed Session minutes remain closed to the public and 
that no written Closed Session minutes from above be made open to the public at this time.   
 
*Minutes not yet approved by the Board 
     
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Seth, the Board approved the written minutes so 
noted to remain closed to the public.  Further, no lawsuit has been filed, and no valid court order 
has been received requiring the release of any audio recordings of any closed meeting and, 
therefore, pursuant to the statutory requirements, none will be released at this time.  The motion 
passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
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H. CLOSED SESSION FOR DELIBERATIONS CONCERNING SALARY 

SCHEDULES FOR ONE OR MORE CLASSES OF EMPLOYEES; 
SECURITY PROCEDURES, SCHOOL BUILDING SAFETY AND 
SECURITY, AND THE USE OF PERSONNEL AND EQUIPMENT TO 
RESPOND TO AN ACTUAL, A THREATENED, OR A REASONABLY 
POTENTIAL DANGER TO THE SAFETY OF EMPLOYEES, 
STUDENTS, STAFF, THE PUBLIC, OR PUBLIC PROPERTY; AND 
APPROVAL OF THE WRITTEN CLOSED SESSION MINUTES OF 
JUNE 17, 2025; JUNE 26, 2025; JULY 9, 2025; AND AUGUST 21, 2025 

The Board went into Closed Session at 6:15 p.m. 
 
OPEN SESSION 
The Board returned to Open Session at 7:27 p.m. 
 
ITEM 13: INFORMATION 

A. TRUSTEE COMMENTS  
There were no Trustee comments. 

B. COMMUNICATIONS 
 
ITEM 14: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Wolfe adjourned the meeting at 7:28 p.m. 
 
 
       
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  
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 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 10B 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Financial Report 
December 18, 2025 
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 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 10C 
 
 
 
 
 
  

Board Consideration of Clery Security Report 
December 18, 2025 
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AGENDA ITEM:  10C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF CLERY SECURITY REPORT 
 
DATE:   December 18, 2025 
 
RESOURCE:  Jill Cranmore, Dr. Randall Fletcher 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: The College received no Clery crime reports for Danville Area Community 

College’s main campus in the past month.        
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION:   May we ask the Board to approve the Clery Security Report above.           
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Unfinished Business 
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New Business 
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BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12A 

Board Consideration of Human Resources Report 

49



AGENDA ITEM:  12A 

AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 

DATE:  December 18, 2025 

RESOURCE:  Jill Cranmore, Dr. Randall Fletcher 

SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 

SUMMARY: Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources 
processes are being met.   

1. New Employees – Full-Time

(Notice of Full-Time Administrative Contract)

Johnson, Bradley – Tractor /Trailer Training Specialist, Tractor/Trailer
Effective Date:  December 15, 2025 through June 30, 2026
Rate of Pay:  $42,230.00 annually

(Notice of Full-Time Classified Contract)

Cruz, Tania, Disability & Testing Specialist, Assessment Center
Effective Date:  December 15, 2025 through June 30, 2026
Rate of Pay:  $36,773.00 annually

2. Transfer

McCoy, Rachel – Administrative Assistant, Business & Technology
Effective Date:  January 1, 2026 through June 30, 2026
Rate of Pay:  $40,555.00 annually

3. Promotion

Pryle, Holly – Assistant Registrar & Catalog Manager, Admissions & Records
Effective Date:  January 1, 2026 through June 30, 2026
Rate of Pay:  $48,000.00 annually

4. Title & Salary Change

Learnard, Kaylee – Coordinator, Corporate & Community Education
Effective Date:  January 1, 2026 through June 30, 2026
Rate of Pay:  $50,000.00 annually
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5. Resignations 
 
Danner, Michael – Tractor Trailer Training Specialist, Tractor/Trailer 
Effective Date:  January 7, 2026 
 
McCord, Terry – Criminal Justice Instructor, Arts & Sciences 
Effective Date:  December 31, 2025 
 

6. New Employees - Part-Time 
      

(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Haddix, Danielle – Diagnostic Medical Sonography Instructor, Sonography 
Effective Date:  November 18, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $46.05 per hour 
 
Johnson, Erica – Substitute Lab Instructor, Nursing 
Effective Date:  December 1, 2025 through May 15, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $50.27 per hour 
 
Student Employees 
 
Combs, Travis – Student Employee, Athletics 
Effective Date:  November 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
 
Feuerborn, Cameron – Student Employee, College Relations 
Effective Date: December 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
 
Kirkpatrick, Brooke – Student Employee, Career Services 
Effective Date:  December 2, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
 
Lawson, Isaac - Student Employee, Athletics 
Effective Date:  November 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
 
Medina, Emily – Student Employee, Hoopeston Higher Learning Center 
Effective Date:  November 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
 
Raikes, Beau – Student Employee, Athletics 
Effective Date:  November 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
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Spencer, Alan - Student Employee, Athletics 
Effective Date:  November 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
 
Torres, Karissa - Student Employee, Assessment Center 
Effective Date:  December 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
 
Whorrall, Tiffany – Student Employee, Culinary Arts 
Effective Date:  December 8, 2025 through June 30, 2026 
Rate of Pay:  $15.00 per hour 
 

7. Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Fall Semester 2025 
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Administrative and Professional Staff Contract 

With 

Community College District No. 507 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford Counties, Illinois 

2000 East Main Street 

Danville, IL  61832 

 

This Contract is made and entered into, by and between Bradley Johnson, (hereinafter referred to as the "Employee") and the Board of 

Trustees, Danville Area Community College, No. 507 (hereinafter referred to as the "Board").  The Board and the Employee hereby 

voluntarily agree as follows: 

 

I.  WITNESSETH, that in consideration of an annual base salary for Fiscal Year (2025-2026) of $42,230.00 less any legal 

authorized deductions, including but not limit to required SURS deduction paid by the employee, said Employee agrees to well 

and faithfully perform the duties of Tractor/Trailer Training Specialist, Tractor/Trailer, and such other duties connected with 

Community College District No. 507 as may be assigned by the Danville Area Community College Board or its duly authorized 

representative.  For each full month of employment such salary will be paid in semi-monthly installments on the pay period dates 

as established and published by the Payroll Department.  For each partial month of employment, payment will be prorated. It is 

understood that as an administrative employee, you will serve at the pleasure of the Danville Area Community College Board of 

Trustees.  

 

II. That in exchange for the foregoing consideration and the mutual promises and covenants  contained in this Contract, the Board 

and the Employee Hereby Further Agree as follows: 

 

A. That this term shall commence on the 15th day of December, 2025, and terminate on the 30th day of June 2026, and 

shall include all the service days designated on the official College calendar as it now appears or may hereafter be 

amended, that occur on or within these two dates.    

 

B. That there shall be deducted from the salary of said Employee an amount equal to the pay for one day of service for each 

day of service during the employment agreement term in which it is not performed, unless absence from duty with pay is 

specifically authorized by Board Policy, or unless absence from duty is occasioned by illness or injury qualifying as sick 

leave within the provisions of the Board's established sick leave policy. 

 

C. That if said Employee resigns, is lawfully discharged, or is released before the completion of said term, final settlement 

shall be made so the total amount which the Employee shall have received shall be an amount equal to the product of the 

number of days of service multiplied by the amount considered as pay for one day of service.  Days of service actually 

performed shall be deemed to include sick leave days and authorized absence days for which pay has been authorized 

prior to the date of release, discharge, or termination.   

 

D. That by acceptance of this Contract the Employee hereby agrees to be governed by the policies of the Danville Area 

Community College Board to perform the duties as assigned by authorized College Administrators. 

 

III. It is hereby further mutually agreed that this contract shall be without force and effect unless it is in possession of the Board, 

bearing the signature of the Employee and the Secretary of the Board on or before the 31st day of December 2025. 

 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, we have hereunto subscribed our names on dates as hereinafter stated. 

 

 

 

______________________  _________________________________________________ 

Date     Employee 

 

 

 

                                 

Date     Secretary 

Board of Trustees 

Community College District No. 507 
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Administrative and Professional Staff Contract 

With 

Community College District No. 507 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford Counties, Illinois 

2000 East Main Street 

Danville, IL  61832 

 

This Contract is made and entered into, by and between Kaylee Learnard, (hereinafter referred to as the "Employee") and the Board of 

Trustees, Danville Area Community College, No. 507 (hereinafter referred to as the "Board").  The Board and the Employee hereby 

voluntarily agree as follows: 

 

I.  WITNESSETH, that in consideration of an annual base salary for Fiscal Year (2025-2026) of $50,000.00 less any legal 

authorized deductions, including but not limit to required SURS deduction paid by the employee, said Employee agrees to well 

and faithfully perform the duties of Coordinator, Corporate and Community Education, and such other duties connected with 

Community College District No. 507 as may be assigned by the Danville Area Community College Board or its duly authorized 

representative.  For each full month of employment such salary will be paid in semi-monthly installments on the pay period dates 

as established and published by the Payroll Department.  For each partial month of employment, payment will be prorated. It is 

understood that as an administrative employee, you will serve at the pleasure of the Danville Area Community College Board of 

Trustees.  

 

II. That in exchange for the foregoing consideration and the mutual promises and covenants  contained in this Contract, the Board 

and the Employee Hereby Further Agree as follows: 

 

A. That this term shall commence on the 1st  day of January, 2026, and terminate on the 30th day of June 2026, and shall 

include all the service days designated on the official College calendar as it now appears or may hereafter be amended, 

that occur on or within these two dates.    

 

B. That there shall be deducted from the salary of said Employee an amount equal to the pay for one day of service for each 

day of service during the employment agreement term in which it is not performed, unless absence from duty with pay is 

specifically authorized by Board Policy, or unless absence from duty is occasioned by illness or injury qualifying as sick 

leave within the provisions of the Board's established sick leave policy. 

 

C. That if said Employee resigns, is lawfully discharged, or is released before the completion of said term, final settlement 

shall be made so the total amount which the Employee shall have received shall be an amount equal to the product of the 

number of days of service multiplied by the amount considered as pay for one day of service.  Days of service actually 

performed shall be deemed to include sick leave days and authorized absence days for which pay has been authorized 

prior to the date of release, discharge, or termination.   

 

D. That by acceptance of this Contract the Employee hereby agrees to be governed by the policies of the Danville Area 

Community College Board to perform the duties as assigned by authorized College Administrators. 

 

III. It is hereby further mutually agreed that this contract shall be without force and effect unless it is in possession of the Board, 

bearing the signature of the Employee and the Secretary of the Board on or before the 31st day of January 2026. 

 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, we have hereunto subscribed our names on dates as hereinafter stated. 

 

 

 

______________________  _________________________________________________ 

Date     Employee 

 

 

 

                                 

Date     Secretary 

Board of Trustees 

Community College District No. 507 
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Administrative and Professional Staff Contract 

With 

Community College District No. 507 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford Counties, Illinois 

2000 East Main Street 

Danville, IL  61832 

 

This Contract is made and entered into, by and between Holly Pryle, (hereinafter referred to as the "Employee") and the Board of Trustees, 

Danville Area Community College, No. 507 (hereinafter referred to as the "Board").  The Board and the Employee hereby voluntarily 

agree as follows: 

 

I.  WITNESSETH, that in consideration of an annual base salary for Fiscal Year (2025-2026) of $48,000.00 less any legal 

authorized deductions, including but not limit to required SURS deduction paid by the employee, said Employee agrees to well 

and faithfully perform the duties of Assistant Registrar & Catalog Manager, Admissions & Records and such other duties 

connected with Community College District No. 507 as may be assigned by the Danville Area Community College Board or its 

duly authorized representative.  For each full month of employment such salary will be paid in semi-monthly installments on the 

pay period dates as established and published by the Payroll Department.  For each partial month of employment, payment will be 

prorated. It is understood that as an administrative employee, you will serve at the pleasure of the Danville Area Community 

College Board of Trustees.  

 

II. That in exchange for the foregoing consideration and the mutual promises and covenants  contained in this Contract, the Board 

and the Employee Hereby Further Agree as follows: 

 

A. That this term shall commence on the 1st day of January, 2026, and terminate on the 30th day of June 2026, and shall 

include all the service days designated on the official College calendar as it now appears or may hereafter be amended, 

that occur on or within these two dates.    

 

B. That there shall be deducted from the salary of said Employee an amount equal to the pay for one day of service for each 

day of service during the employment agreement term in which it is not performed, unless absence from duty with pay is 

specifically authorized by Board Policy, or unless absence from duty is occasioned by illness or injury qualifying as sick 

leave within the provisions of the Board's established sick leave policy. 

 

C. That if said Employee resigns, is lawfully discharged, or is released before the completion of said term, final settlement 

shall be made so the total amount which the Employee shall have received shall be an amount equal to the product of the 

number of days of service multiplied by the amount considered as pay for one day of service.  Days of service actually 

performed shall be deemed to include sick leave days and authorized absence days for which pay has been authorized 

prior to the date of release, discharge, or termination.   

 

D. That by acceptance of this Contract the Employee hereby agrees to be governed by the policies of the Danville Area 

Community College Board to perform the duties as assigned by authorized College Administrators. 

 

III. It is hereby further mutually agreed that this contract shall be without force and effect unless it is in possession of the Board, 

bearing the signature of the Employee and the Secretary of the Board on or before the 31st day of January 2026. 

 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, we have hereunto subscribed our names on dates as hereinafter stated. 

 

 

 

______________________  _________________________________________________ 

Date     Employee 

 

 

 

                                 

Date     Secretary 

Board of Trustees 

Community College District No. 507 
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BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12B 

Board Consideration of Approval of 
Travel Expenses for Trustees 
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AGENDA ITEM: 12B 

AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 
EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 

MEETING DATE: December 18, 2025 

RESOURCE: Dr. Randall Fletcher 

SUBMITTED FOR: APPROVAL 

SUMMARY: Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel 
Expense Control Act,” travel expenses for members of the Board of 
Trustees must be approved at an open meeting of the Board.   

A total of $466.08 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over 
the last month.  The expenses were for the ICCTA/ACCT Governance 
Leadership Institute on November 13-15, 2025 in Naperville, IL for Mr. 
Greg Wolfe. 

ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to approve the travel expenditures for Trustees. 
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BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12C 

Board Consideration of Resolution to Establish 
Danville Area Community College Police Department 
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AGENDA ITEM:  12C 

AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION TO ESTABLISH 
DANVILLE AREA COMMUNITY COLLEGE POLICE DEPARTMENT

DATE:  December 18, 2025 

RESOURCE: Dr. Randy Fletcher, President 

SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 

SUMMARY: The College would like to transition the DACC Campus Security to the DACC 
Police Department.  A thorough review of the process of onboarding a police 
department function to the existing college organizational infrastructure has 
been conducted.  Campus safety and security are the primary factors in seeking 
this change from the current campus security model.     

ACTION  
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to approve the Resolution to Establish a Danville Area 

Community College Police Department.       
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BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12D 

Board Consideration of New Board Policies 

1. Board Policy #1020.1 – College Trustee Standards and Ethics
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AGENDA ITEM: 12D 

AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF NEW BOARD POLICY 
1. BOARD POLICY #1020.1 – COLLEGE TRUSTEE STANDARDS

AND ETHICS

MEETING DATE: December 18, 2025 

RESOURCE: Dr. Randall Fletcher 

SUBMITTED FOR: APPROVAL 

SUMMARY: The College Trustee Standards and Ethics Board policy details standards 
of practice, emphasizing the Board’s role in creating a student-focused 
learning environment, establishing college policies, and ensuring sound 
fiscal management.  The policy also includes a code of ethics, stressing the 
importance of informed decision-making, harmonious collaboration 
among board members, and prioritizing the community’s well-being over 
personal gain.  Overall, the standards and code collectively serve as a 
comprehensive guide for trustees, promoting accountable, ethical, and 
effective governance within a community college setting.   

ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to approve Board Policy #1020.1 – College Trustee 

Standards and Ethics.   
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Board Policies and Procedures Manual 

Index | Section 1000 – Board of Trustees 

College Trustee Standards and Ethics  1020.1 

The provided standards outline the expected conduct and responsibilities for college trustees. It 
details standards of practice, emphasizing the board's role in creating a student-focused learning 
environment, establishing college policies, and ensuring sound fiscal management. The document 
also includes a code of ethics, stressing the importance of informed decision-making, harmonious 
collaboration among board members, and prioritizing the community's well-being over personal 
gain. Overall, the standards and code collectively serve as a comprehensive guide for trustees, 
promoting accountable, ethical, and effective governance within a community college setting. 

Standards of Practice for Danville Area Community College Board of Trustees: 

A. The primary focus of the board is to create a learning environment that welcomes and promotes
the success of a diverse student body.

B. Trustees will follow all college policies, and board decisions and interactions should reflect the
vision, mission, and values of the college.

C. Trustees commit to developing and maintaining positive relations with fellow board members,
respecting opinions, and working together to achieve common goals.

D. The board derives authority from and is accountable to the community; trustees will seek the
well-being of the entire community and represent it in board decisions, without using their
position for personal benefit or to obtain employment for themselves, family members, or close
associates.

E. The board’s primary function is to establish policies for college administration, respecting the
delegation of authority to the college president to initiate policy recommendations, administer
academic programs, conduct college business, and implement board actions.

F. Authority rests with the entire board, expressed through policies and actions in official
meetings, as individuals have no legal authority to determine policies, programs, or procedures.

G. Trustees will demonstrate a commitment to informed, ethical decision-making by reviewing
board materials, attending scheduled meetings, and requesting data and information through
established protocols.
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H. The board shall fulfill fiduciary responsibility for sound budgetary and fiscal management by 
reviewing financial reports and following established procedures, and trustees will demonstrate 
personal accountability and transparency in submitting reimbursement requests for expenses. 
 

I. Deliberations in closed session are confidential and not for public release or discussion without 
prior board approval by majority vote; trustees will maintain confidentiality to establish and 
maintain trust. 

 
J. Trustees will communicate and promote the needs of the community to the college and the 

needs of the college to the community, respecting established communication roles and 
procedures, demonstrating a unified voice, and following up through appropriate channels. 

 
K. The board is responsible for creating and maintaining a spirit of cooperation and a mutually 

supportive relationship with its president, promoting a healthy working relationship through 
respectful, supportive, open, and honest communication, and referring contacts from 
employees, students, and community residents to the president.  Trustees will notify the 
president if they wish to meet informally or formally with employees and students. 

 
L. Trustees will devote time to activities that enhance knowledge of the college, the community 

college system, and higher education issues, engaging in ongoing professional development 
and participating in college events as appropriate. 

 
Trustee Code of Ethics for a Governing Board Member: 

 
1. Devote time, thought, and study to the duties and responsibilities of a community college 

trustee member so that effective and credible service can be rendered. 
 

2. Work with fellow board members in a spirit of harmony and cooperation despite differences of 
opinion that arise during vigorous debates. 

 
3. Base personal decisions upon all available facts, vote honest convictions unswayed by partisan 

bias, and abide by and uphold the final majority decision of the board. 
 

4. Always remember that as an individual, there is no legal authority outside board meetings, and 
conduct relationships with college staff, the community, and media based on this fact. 

 
5. Resist every temptation and outside pressure to use the position as a community college board 

member to benefit oneself or any other individual or agency apart from the total interest of the 
community college district. 

 
6. Recognize that it is as important for the board to understand and evaluate the educational 

programming of the college community as it is to plan for the business of college operation. 
 

7. Bear in mind under all circumstances that the primary function of the board is to establish the 
policies by which the college is to be administered. 

 
8. Welcome and encourage active cooperation by citizens, organizations, and the media in the 

district with respect to establishing policy on current college operations and proposed future 
developments. 
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9. Support the state and national community college trustees’ associations. 

 
10. Strive toward excellence in trustee work to sustain the most effective community college board 

service to the community, in a spirit of teamwork and devotion to public education. 
 

In accordance with Robert’s Rules of Order, the Board of Trustees may, after investigation and 
upon written findings of fact, adopt, by majority vote, a resolution of censure with respect to any 
trustees who violate the provisions of Board Policies 1000 – College Trustee Standards and Ethics, 
1020.1 – Conflict of Interest, 1010, and other policies that may be deemed relevant. 
 
 
Adopted:  12-18-25 
 
___________________________________ 
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 BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12E 
 
 
 
 
 
  

Board Consideration of Worker’s  
Compensation Insurance for 2026 
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AGENDA ITEM:  12E 

AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF WORKER’S COMPENSATION 
INSURANCE FOR 2026 

DATE:  December 18, 2025 

RESOURCE: Tammy Betancourt 

SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 

SUMMARY: Worker’s Compensation insurance is determined by our estimated annual 
payroll, experience mod rate, Foreign and Domestic Terrorism coverage 
and catastrophe coverage.  The January 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025 
premium for Worker’s Compensation insurance was $53,616, including 
coverage for all states.  Having coverage in all states provides the College 
the flexibility to hire part-time employees from any state to work from home 
(specifically part-time instructors).  This coverage was obtained through 
Zenith Insurance. 

The proposed premium from Zenith Insurance for 2026 is $59,183.  While 
this increase of $5,567 is approximately 10.4% from 2025 it is important to 
note that worker’s compensation premiums are based on estimated payroll, 
as well as experience mod rates. Estimated payrolls increased 4.3% and the 
experience mod rate increased from .83 to .84.  In addition, higher loss ratios 
for schools for Zenith has caused their overall rate structure to increase by 
9.14%. It’s also important to note that the worker’s compensation payroll is 
audited in January or February of each year and the premium is adjusted 
based on that actual payroll. 

Zenith was our carrier from 2018 to 2021 and again in 2024 and 2025. We 
have had excellent service and response times. 

Worker’s Compensation insurance premiums are paid using Liability, 
Protection, Settlement (Tort) Funds.  

ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve the premium of $59,183 to Zenith 
Insurance for Worker’s Compensation insurance coverage from January 1, 
2026 to December 31, 2026. 
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BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12F 

Board Discussion of Space Utilization Study 
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BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12G 

Board Consideration of Voluntary Separation Program 
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AGENDA ITEM:  12G 

AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF VOLUNTARY SEPARATION PROGRAM    

DATE:  December 18, 2025 

RESOURCE:  Dr. Randy Fletcher, President 
Tammy Betancourt, Vice President of Finance/CFO 
Jill Cranmore, Vice President of Human Resources/Labor Relations 

SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 

SUMMARY: With rising costs and declining revenue, the College needs to consider any and 
all options to strengthen our financial position. An employee voluntary-
separation program is being proposed as one option, among many, to lower 
operating costs. 

ACTION  
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to approve the proposed employee voluntary-separation 

program.     
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BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12H 

Board Consideration of Bids 
for Concrete and Masonry Repairs for 

Prairie, Cannon, Lincoln, and Vermilion 
Hall Handicap Ramp and Steps 
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AGENDA ITEM: 12H 

AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR CONCRETE AND 
MASONRY REPAIR F O R PRAIRIE, CANNON, LINCOLN 
AND VERMILION HALL HANDICAP RAMPS AND STEPS 

DATE:  December 18, 2025 

RESOURCE: Douglass Adams 

SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 

SUMMARY: Danville Area Community College has partnered with Bailey 
Edward Design of Champaign, Illinois, to complete a repair and 
restoration project for the repair of concrete steps and handicap-
accessible ramps at multiple campus locations, including Prairie 
Hall, Lincoln Hall, Vermilion Hall, and Cannon Hall. These repairs 
are needed to ensure that campus accessibility remains safe, code 
compliant, and visually consistent with campus standards. 

Scope of Work: 
• Remove existing handrails at affected locations.
• Clean, repair, and prepare handrails for reinstallation.
• Perform selective repairs and replacements to masonry, brick,

and concrete on all designated ramp and step areas.
• Restore all components to a safe, code-compliant, and

aesthetically improved condition.
• Reinstall cleaned and repaired handrails upon completion of

structural work.

DACC held a public bid opening December 10, 2025 and the 
following are the bid results. 

Contractor  Base bid Alternate#1 Alternate#2 Alternate#3 Alternate#4 Total 

English Brothers Company $249,370.00  $17,300.00  $45,300.00  $8,200.00  $13,800.00 
 $ 
333,970.00 

McDowell Builders, Inc $288,554.00  $18,020.00   62,372.00  $9,823.00  $15,122.00 
 $ 
393,891.00 

Berglund Construction 
Company $370,000.00  $25,000.00  $50,000.00  $15,000.00  $18,000.00 

 $ 
478,000.00 

Petry Kuhne Company $378,000.00  $18,400.00  $57,200.00  $9,900.00  $15,900.00 
 $ 
479,400.00 
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Funding for this project will come from 2021 Deferred Maintenance 
Bond Proceeds and PHS Tax Levies.  

ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider the low base bid plus alternate bids 

1 through 4 from English Brothers Company in the amount of 
$333,970.00.
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