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Mission Statement  
 

Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 
quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences that 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 
 
 

Non-Discrimination Statement 
Danville Area Community College does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, disability 

or age in its programs and activities.  Inquiries may be directed to Jill A. Cranmore, Vice President, Human 
Resources, Affirmative Action Officer, Title IX Coordinator, and Section 504/ADA Coordinator, Danville Area 
Community College, 2000 E. Main St., Martin Luther King Memorial Way, Danville, IL  61832-5199, 217-443-

8756, or jcranmore@dacc.edu. 

      
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
  
  

 
 
Danville Area Community College will continue to be nationally recognized leader in student 
success and an active partner in building and maintaining academic excellence and the 
economic vitality of the communities it serves. 

 
 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, 
employees, community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 

Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 

Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual 
growth of those we serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing 
world.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Vision Statement 



BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
Community College District No. 507 

Regular Meeting 
HOOPESTON HIGHER LEARNING CENTER, ROOM 101 

Thursday, November 21, 2019 
5:30 p.m. 

 

 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order 

2. Pledge of Allegiance 

3. Roll Call 

4. Adoption of Agenda 

5. Recognition of Visitors 

6. DACC Higher Learning Center – Hoopeston Report 

7. Report on ICCTA Seminar and Board of Representatives Meeting, November                           

8-9, 2019 

8. Financial Update 

9. President’s Report 

10. Public Comment 

 

12.    Unfinished Business 

13.  New Business 

 A. Board Consideration of Acceptance of FY2019 College Comprehensive Annual    

Financial Audit Report (External Exhibit) 

 B. Board Consideration to Accept the Annual Post-Issuance Tax Compliance                

Report for the Danville Area Community College District No. 507, Counties of   

Vermilion,  Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford and State of Illinois 

 C. Board Consideration of Making Written Closed Session Minutes Open to the            

Public 

 D. Board Consideration of Bids for WiFi Network Equipment 

 E. Board Consideration of Bids for a Coordinate Measure Machine 

  

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 
enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should 
so request before approval of the agenda. 
 

11. Consent Agenda  

A. Board Consideration of the Minutes of the Board Audit Committee Meeting                

of October 23, 2019; and Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting of                       

October 24, 2019 

B. Financial Report 

C. Human Resources Report 
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14. Information 

 A. Communications 

NOVEMBER 2019 

 22 DACC’s Got Talent, 7:30 p.m., Bremer 

          28-29 Thanksgiving Holidays – College Closed 

DECEMBER 2019 

   6 Holiday Party, Knights of Columbus 

 19 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

 25 Christmas Day Holiday – College Closed 

          26-31 Holiday Break – College Closed 

15. Adjournment 
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DACC Higher Learning Center – Hoopeston Report 
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Report on ICCTA Seminar and Board of  

Representatives Meeting, November 8-9, 2019 
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Financial Update 



     

FY20 FY19
OPERATING FUNDS FULL YR YTD % YTD YTD

(EDUCATION; OPERATIONS & MAINTENANCE) PROP BUDG 10/31/2019 OF TOTAL 10/31/2018 %

REVENUES

1   Property Tax Revenue 4,935,000 1,233,750 25 % (A) 1,173,000 25%
2   Personal Property Replacement Tax (PPRT) 525,000 169,907 32 % (B) 87,929 17%
3   ICCB Base Operating Grants 1,562,848 632,929 40 % (C) 463,218 30%
4   ICCB Equalization Grant 2,438,530 609,632 25 % (C) 342,126 17%
5   CTE Vocational Cr Hr Reimbursement 170,000 0 0 % (C) 0 0%
6   Tuition 7,725,230 4,483,108 58 % (D) 4,636,705 64%
7   Fees 1,576,960 904,887 57 % (D) 837,578 56%
8   Less:  Institutional Scholarships/Waivers (2,560,000) (1,330,675) 52 % (D) (1,173,626) 69%
9   Interest Income 35,000 16,811 48 % (E) 17,538 159%

10   Transfers from Other Funds 500,000 15,681 3 % (E) 13,118 3%
11   Facility Rent Revenue/Chargebacks/Other 199,500 90,894 46 % (F) 29,548 14%

12 TOTAL OPERATING REVENUES 17,108,068 6,826,924 40 % 6,427,134 39%

EXPENDITURES BY OBJECT

13   Salaries 11,069,307 3,656,991 33 % 3,409,599 32%
14   Employee Benefits 2,348,055 744,101 32 % 759,520 32%
15   Contractual Services 611,870 147,905 24 % (E) 177,827 30%
16   Materials & Supplies 1,666,615 929,911 56 % (G) 827,524 55%
17   Meetings, Travel, Conferences 316,541 45,673 14 % (E) 34,736 14%
18   Fixed Charges 207,680 151,170 73 % (E) 150,815 61%
19   Utilities 810,000 234,420 29 % (H) 273,616 34%
20   Capital Outlay 26,000 80,144 308 % (F) 13,500 0%
21   Transfers to other Funds/Other 52,000 12,001 23 % (E) 7,402 10%

22 TOTAL OPERATING EXPENDITURES 17,108,068 6,002,316 35 % 5,654,539 34%

23 NET REVENUE/(EXPENDITURE) 0 824,608 772,595

NOTES:

(A) Amounts are recorded quarterly at the end of each quarter.
(B) Majority of revenue is received in the second half of the fiscal year.
(C) Amounts received from ICCB will not be even.
(D) Revenue is primarily received at the beginning of each semester and institutional waivers/scholarships are awarded

    near the beginning of the semester.
(E) This revenue or expense item does not occur evenly over the year.
(F) Includes donation from the Foundation for mechantronics equipment. In-kind revenue and expense are recorded.
(G) Instructional material and supply spending is accelerated prior to the beginning of each semester.
(H) Payments on utility bills are approximately two months in arrears.  Invoice for July service has a

   billing date of August and a payment due date of September.

DANVILLE AREA COMMUNITY COLLEGE

FINANCIAL STATEMENT OF REVENUE AND EXPENDITURES
FOR  THE OPERATING FUNDS

       FY20 - Year to Date - July 1, 2019 - October 31, 2019
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President’s Report 
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Public Comment 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 11A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of the Minutes of the  
Board Audit Committee Meeting of October 23, 2019;  

and Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting of October 24, 2019 



MINUTES OF BOARD AUDIT COMMITTEE MEETING – October 23, 2019 
On October 23, 2019, the Audit Committee of the Board of Trustees of Community College 
District 507, in the Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State 
of Illinois, held a meeting in the President’s Conference Room, Vermilion Hall 206, at 
Danville Area Community College. 
 
Mr. Harby called the meeting to order at 1:03 p.m. 
 
Trustees present:  Dave Harby, Dr. Ron Serfoss (1:05 p.m.), and Bill Black (1:17 p.m.) 
 
Others present:  President Stephen Nacco; Board Secretary Kerri Thurman; Dave Kietzmann, 
Executive Vice President, Instruction and Student Services; Tammy Betancourt, Vice 
President, Finance/Chief Financial Officer; Debbie Knight, Controller; and representatives 
from Wipfli LLP, Sara McKenna and Matt Schueler.                                  
 
Media present:  None 
 
The purpose of the meeting was the presentation of the Danville Area Community College 
audit by Wipfli LLP for the year ended June 30, 2019. 
 
The Committee, representatives from Wipfli, and those representing the Business Office 
discussed the audit in detail.        
 
The Audit Committee and Dr. Nacco thanked Tammy Betancourt, Debbie Knight, and their 
department for their dedication and hard work in making the audit a success.  They also 
thanked Wipfli for the audit and the service the College received. 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to bring before the Committee, the meeting was adjourned at 
2:05 p.m. 
 
  
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING of October 24, 2019 
On October 24, 2019, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall Room 302 at Danville Area Community 
College.       
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Dave Harby called the meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
Ms. Santasia Elliott, Presidential Scholar, led the Board and those in attendance in reciting 
the Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag.       
 
ITEM 3: ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present: Dave Harby, Terry Hill, Dr. Ron Serfoss, John 
Spezia, and Student Trustee Holley Hambleton.  Trustees absent:  Bill Black, Tracy Cherry, 
Greg Wolfe (arrived at 6:14 p.m.) 
 
Others present:  President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave 
Kietzmann, Mike Cunningham, Tammy Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Lara Conklin, Stacy 
Ehmen, Terri Cummings, Kathy Sturgeon, Mark Barnes, Tammy Howard, Jamie Moreland, 
Heidi Young and family, St. Kitts/Nevis Sugar Boys Basketball Team and Trainer, Kristin 
Holt, Natalie Lenhart, Santasia Elliott, Linda Trammell, Da’Keema Simmons, Chemika 
Hamphill, Tarneisha Young, Donna Thomas, William Norman, and Lacie Martin. 
 
Media present:  None.    
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Harby asked if there were any changes requested to the agenda.  With no changes 
requested, upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the agenda was approved 
as presented.  The motion passed by unanimous voice vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
Dr. Nacco introduced the following members of the College Cabinet:  Dave Kietzmann, 
Executive Vice President, Instruction and Student Services; Jill Cranmore, Vice President, 
Human Resources; Tammy Betancourt, Vice President, Finance and Chief Financial 
Officer; Mike Cunningham, Vice President, Administrative Services; Lara Conklin, 
Executive Director, College Relations; Stacy Ehmen, Vice President, Student Services; 
Terri Cummings, Dean, Business and Technology; and Kathy Sturgeon, Dean, Math, 
Science and Health Professions; Also present: Mark Barnes, Director, Computer 
Networking and End User Services; Tammy Howard, Director, Medical Imaging; Jamie 
Moreland, Instructor, Echocardiography; Heidi Young, Instructor, Clinical Coordinator, 
Radiologic Technology, and family; St. Kitts/Nevis Sugar Boys Basketball Team, Coach, 
and Trainer; Santasia Elliott, Presidential Scholar; Kristen Holt and Natalie Lenhart, 
Radiologic Technology Students; Linda Trammell, Da’Keema Simmons, Chemika 
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Hamphill, Tarneisha Young, Donna Thomas, William Norman and Lacie Martin, Business 
Communications Students.  
 
Media present:  None.   
 
ITEM 6: INTRODUCTION OF BUSINESS COMMUNICATIONS STUDENTS 
Students from the Business Communications class were in attendance to observe a formal 
meeting.  Each student introduced themselves to the Board. 
 
ITEM 7: MATH, SCIENCE AND HEALTH PROFESSIONS REPORT 
Ms. Kathy Sturgeon presented a report on Math, Science and Health Professions.  The 
division hosted Health Professions Day for recruiting with a follow-up marketing mailing.  
Nearly 150 local sophomores and six alumni participated.  Dual enrollment offerings have 
increased at Danville High School and Milford.   

 
A review of policies and procedures was conducted in order to offer the Fitness Center free 
to students who do not need credit hours.  Additionally, Fitness Center Community 
Enrollment was introduced allowing public members to earn credit at local gyms.   

 
The Division hosted Transitional Mathematics Summits, developed the MOU and Master 
Syllabus for the offerings, collected curriculum maps from each school, and organized a 
Local Portability Panel. 

 
Ms. Sturgeon reported that the MASS Tutoring Center has been renamed to the MASS 
Learning Center due to the Center offering additional services beyond tutoring.  Each 
semester the number of students and how often they visit has increased.  The Center opened 
in the Spring of 2014 and had 341 tutoring sessions and this past Spring, that number was 
1,410. 

 
The DACC Nursing Program began utilizing simulation as a teaching modality in May of 
2016 and it has been integrated into every nursing course.  By the end of this Fall 2019 
semester, there will have been a total of 80 simulation sessions.  Ms. Sturgeon expressed 
appreciation to the Board for the support in creating the lab as well as to the generous 
donors who have generously supported the addition of equipment.   

 
Ms. Tammy Howard reported that the curriculum for Radiologic Technology was 
implemented this past summer.  The purpose of the change is to become more competitive 
with other local programs so that job opportunities increase for the students.  Rad Tech 
students Natalie Lenhart and Kristen Holt introduced themselves and shared their 
experiences in the program.   

 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked Ms. Sturgeon, Ms. Howard, and the Rad Tech students 
for their reports. 
 
ITEM 8: FINANCIAL UPDATE 
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Ms. Tammy Betancourt gave a financial update to the Board.  The Financial Statement of 
Revenue and Expenditures ending September 30, 2019 was included in the Board agenda 
book. 
 
ITEM 9: PRESIDENT’S REPORT 
Dr. Nacco shared the DACC Flash with the Board and highlighted the events from the 
month since the last meeting.       
 
ITEM 10: PUBLIC COMMENT 
 
ITEM 11: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE PUBLIC 
HEARING OF SEPTEMBER 26, 2019; REGULAR BOARD 
MEETING OF SEPTEMBER 26, 2019; AND MINUTES OF THE 
SPECIAL BOARD MEETING OF OCTOBER 11, 2019 

B. FINANCIAL REPORT 
C. HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 
D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY #4039 – 

OVERTIME. 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved the items on the 
Consent Agenda.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays.    
 
ITEM 12: UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
ITEM 13: NEW BUSINESS 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 
EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 

Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel Expense Control Act,” 
travel expenses for members of the Board of Trustees must be approved at an open meeting 
of the Board. 
 
A total of $571.39 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over the last month for 
expenses for the ICCTA Seminar and Board of Representatives Meetings on September 13-
14, 2019 in Springfield for Mr. Dave Harby ($150.00) and Mr. Greg Wolfe ($421.39). 

 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the travel 
expenses as listed above.  The motion passed by roll call vote: 5 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

B. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF COLLEGE HEALTH 
INSURANCE 

As health insurance costs continue to rise, the College continues to experience increased 
costs in providing comprehensive, affordable health insurance for our employees and their 
families. The health insurance industry continues to become more and more complex each 
year and the contributing factors to the increase on costs continue to expand and grow. 
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In 2017, the Board entered into an agreement with ONI Risk Partners to provide consulting 
services to assist in evaluating current insurance plans and providing options available to 
the College to ensure we are providing health insurance for our employee that is financially 
sustainable to the College. 
 
During bargaining sessions with Classified Staff two-and-a-half years ago and with the 
Faculty Association this year, the College promised to do its best to find a way to make 
healthcare for families more affordable without 1) shifting an undue burden over to 
individual recipients; and 2) busting the DACC Budget. 
 
The Insurance Committee requested that ONI once again work on our behalf to find 
comparable, affordable plans. ONI obtained proposals for our health insurance coverage for 
calendar year 2020. They received rates from Health Alliance and Blue Cross Blue Shield 
for fully insured plans. The Insurance Committee is comprised of 14 members: 4 
administrators, 5 classified staff, 4 faculty, and 1 confidential staff. 
 
The Insurance Committee met with ONI and unanimously voted to accept a proposal from 
Blue Cross Blue Shield. The plan is designed with significant savings that allow the 
College to offer an annual plan that appears to be budget neutral. The savings in premium is 
transferred to the dependent and spousal premium rates. 
 
The College continues to offer a Base Plan and a High Deductible Health Plan. The 
employee only premium remains unchanged with the College paying the full premium. In 
2019, the Health Alliance family plans offered were $1,659 or $2,116 per month. In 2020, 
the recommended Blue Cross Blue Shield family plan will be $599 or $848 per month. The 
deductibles and out-of-pocket maximum are both lower with the Blue Cross Blue Shield 
plan and offer a national network of providers. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Sefoss, and a second by Mr. Wolfe, the Board approved Blue Cross 
Blue Shield as the College’s health insurance provider effective January 1, 2020.  The 
motion passed by a roll call vote:  6 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR COMPUTER 
EQUIPMENT 

Bids were advertised for computer equipment approved on the FY20 Capital Equipment 
list. Bids were requested for 245 Lenovo ThinkCentre M920s Tower computers, 19 Lenovo 
ThinkStation P330 Towers, 25 Lenovo ThinkCentre M920t Towers, 18 Lenovo ThinkPad 
P52 Laptops, and 80 NEC 22” Windscreen Desktop Monitors. 
This equipment was approved on the FY-20 Capital Equipment List and funding will be 
through Technology/Equipment Bonds. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the low bid from 
Connection in the amount of $288,737.39.  The motion passed by roll call vote: 6 yeas, 0 
nays. 
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D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF TENURE RECOMMENDATION 
1. HEIDI YOUNG, CLINICAL COORDINATOR, RADIOLOGIC 

TECHNOLOGY 
Full-time faculty members completing their third academic year of probation must be 
granted tenure, extended another year of probation, or dismissed. Dave Kietzmann and the 
respective supervisor have evaluated her performance and personnel files to ensure that her 
credentials are in order. This outstanding faculty member is an asset to the instructional 
programs at Danville Area Community College. It is our honor and privilege to recommend 
so many newer and talented faculty members for tenure status. This individual is a superior 
classroom teacher who will serve DACC well into the future. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, the Board approved the tenure 
recommendation for Ms. Heidi Young, Clinical Coordinator, Radiologic Technology. The 
motion passed by roll call vote: 6 yeas, 0 nays.  
  
ITEM 14: INFORMATION 

A. COMMUNICATIONS 
 

ITEM 15: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 6:31 p.m. 
       
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  
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FINANCIAL REPORT 
November 21, 2019 
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Human Resources Report 

November 21, 2019 
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Human Resources 
(Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources processes 
being met.) 
 
 

1. New Employees 
 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 

 
 Erke, Kelly – Nursing Skills Lab Instructor, Math, Science and Health Professions 
 Effective Date:  November 3, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of pay:  $42.11 per hour 
 
   2. Student Employees 

 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Harshman, Samuel – Student Employee, Business & Technology 
Effective Date:  October 28, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Juvinall, Victoria – Student Employee, Math, Science and Health Professions 
Effective Date:  October 18, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Wills, Kelley – Student Employee, Illinois Small Business Development  
Effective Date:  October 15, 2019 through December 31, 2019 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 

 
3.  Salary Adjustment 

 
 Fellers, Angel – Office Assistant, Math, Science and Health Professions 
 Effective Date:  December 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $33,778.04 annually 

 
4. Resignation 

 
Boyd, Cydney – Adult Education Specialist, Adult Education & Literacy 
Effective Date:  November 27, 2019 
 

5. Recommendation for Health Insurance for Year 2020 
 

Health Insurance will be offered to the following:  Aline Nelson and Marcia Wright 
 
   5. Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Fall Semester 2019 
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Unfinished Business 
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New Business 
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Board Consideration of Acceptance of FY2019  

College Comprehensive Annual Financial  
Audit Report (External Exhibit) 

 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



Agenda Item:   13A 
 
Agenda Title: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF ACCEPTANCE OF FY2019 

COLLEGE COMPREHENSIVE ANNUAL FINANCIAL AUDIT 
REPORT (EXTERNAL EXHIBIT) 

 
Meeting Date: November 21, 2019 
 
Resource:  Tammy Betancourt 
 
Submitted for:  Action 
 
Summary:  The Board of Trustees Audit Committee (Mr. Harby, Dr. Serfoss, 

and Mr. Black) met on October 23, 2019 with the Auditors, Sara 
McKenna and Matt Schueler, of Wipfli, LLP.  The purpose of the 
meeting was to review and discuss the audited Comprehensive 
Annual Financial Report for the fiscal year ended June 30, 2019.  
Also in attendance from the DACC Staff were Dr. Nacco, Debbie 
Knight, Tammy Betancourt, Dave Kietzmann, and Kerri Thurman. 

 
  The Committee will report to the Board regarding the Audit 

Committee meeting.    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Recommendation: May we ask the Board to consider accepting the Fiscal Year 2019 

Comprehensive Annual Financial Audit Report.   
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Board Consideration to Accept the Annual  
Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report for  

the Danville Area Community College District  
No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois,  

Champaign, and Ford and State of Illinois 
 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 13B 
 
AGENDA TITLE:      Board Consideration to Accept the Annual Post-Issuance Tax 
 Compliance Report for Danville Area Community College District 
 No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and  
 Ford and the State of Illinois. 
  
DATE:                        November 21, 2019 
 
RESOURCE:              Tammy Betancourt 
 
SUBMITTED FOR:   Action 
 
SUMMARY:              When the District issued Tax Advantaged Obligations (e.g. Tax- 

Exempt Bonds and/or Debt Certificates), the District covenanted 
generally to take all action necessary to comply with the applicable 
federal tax rules and regulations relating to those obligations, including 
covenants necessary to preserve the excludability of interest in those 
obligations from gross income for federal income taxation purposes. 

 
 A Bond Record-Keeping Policy was adopted by the Board of Trustees 

on December 14, 2010 and amended on September 23, 2014 as part of 
the resolution process for the issuance of certain Tax Advantaged 
Obligations.  This Bond-Record Keeping Policy designated the 
Treasurer as the Compliance Officer for Tax Advantaged Obligations 
compliance purposes.  Our bond counsel, Chapman and Cutler, LLP 
has recommended that the Compliance Officer prepare and submit an 
Annual Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report to ensure that the 
Board of Trustees is aware of the District’s compliance with Tax 
Advantaged Obligation covenants. 
 
Attached is the Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report which sets forth  
a summary demonstrating the District’s compliance with applicable 
covenants and expectations.  
 
Also attached are expenditures for the fiscal year 2019 from the 
various bond issuances.  All of the expenditures were previously 
approved by the Board either through the bid process when required or 
via the normal monthly disbursement approval process. 

 
 
 
ACTION May we ask the Board to accept the annual Post-Issuance 
REQUESTED: Tax Compliance Report for Danville Area Community 
 College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar 
 Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and the State of Illinois. 
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Board Consideration of Making Written Closed  

Session Minutes Open to the Public 
 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  13C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF MAKING WRITTEN CLOSED 

SESSION MINUTES OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 
 
DATE:   November 21, 2019 
 
RESOURCE: Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: Action 
 
SUMMARY: Public Act 85-1355 requires community college boards to review the 

written minutes of closed sessions in order to determine which written 
minutes may be, in whole or in part, made a part of the public record. 

 
We have reviewed the minutes of the Closed Sessions of: 
 
March 24, 1987 May 23, 2006 June 27, 2019 
September 26, 2000 April 26, 2011 September 26, 2019 
October 24, 2000 January 24, 2019 October 11, 2019 
April 26, 2005 March 28, 2019 November 13, 2019* 
May 24, 2005 May 23, 2019  
    
I am recommending that the written minutes for the Closed Sessions held 
on: 
 
March 24, 1987 April 26, 2005 April 26, 2011  
September 26, 2000 May 24, 2005 January 24, 2019 
October 24, 2000 May 23, 2006 November 13, 2019* 
   
remain closed to the public. 
 
*Minutes not yet approved by the Board 
 
I am also recommending that the written minutes for the Closed Session 
held on:  
 
March 28, 2019 June 27, 2019 October 11, 2019 
May 23, 2019 September 26, 2019 
 
be made open to the public.   

 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to approve the written minutes so noted to remain 

closed to the public and the written minutes so noted to be opened to the 
public.  Further, we note that no lawsuit has been filed, and no valid court 
order has been received requiring the release of any audio recordings of 
any closed meeting and, therefore, pursuant to the statutory requirements, 
we recommend that none be released. 



 
SUMMARY 

MINUTES OF CLOSED SESSIONS 
Not yet opened to the public 

November 21, 2019 
 
March 24, 1987 
Closed Session held to discuss the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, 
performance, or dismissal of an employee. 
 
September 26, 2000 
Closed Session held to discuss the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, 
performance, or dismissal of an employee and to discuss collective negotiating matters. 
 
October 24, 2000 
Closed Session held to discuss the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, 
performance, or dismissal of an employee and for approval of the minutes of the Closed Session 
of September 26, 2000. 
 
April 26, 2005 
Closed Session for deliberations concerning collective negotiating matters and approval of the 
Closed Session minutes for the meetings of May 25, 2004; July 27, 2004; August 11, 2004; 
August 23, 2004; August 24, 2004; and October 4, 2004. 
 
May 24, 2005 
Closed Session held for deliberations concerning collective negotiating matters; deliberations 
concerning salary schedules for one or more classes of employees; deliberations concerning the 
appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance or dismissal of a specific 
employee; and approval of the written Closed Session minutes for the meeting of April 26, 2005. 
 
May 23, 2006 
Closed Session for deliberations concerning salary schedules for one or more classes of 
employees; deliberations concerning the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, 
performance or dismissal of a specific employee; probable litigation; and approval of the written 
Closed Session minutes for the meeting of April 25, 2006. 
 
April 26, 2011 
Closed Session for the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance, or 
dismissal of specific employees; deliberations concerning collective negotiating matters; and  
approval of written Closed Session minutes for the meetings of September 2, 2010; September 
15, 2010; and November 3, 2010. 
 
January 24, 2019 
Closed Session for the Appointment, Employment, Compensation, Discipline, Performance, or 
Dismissal of Specific Employees of the Public Body. 
 
March 28, 2019 
Closed Session for Deliberations Concerning Collective Negotiating Matters; Deliberations 
Concerning Salary Schedules for One or More Classes of Employees; and Approval of the 



Summary 
Minutes of Closed Sessions 

Not yet opened to the public 
November 21, 2019 

 
Written Closed Session Minutes of November 7, 2018; December 13, 2018; and January 24, 
2019. 
 
May 23, 2019 
Closed Session for Deliberations Concerning Collective Negotiating Matters; Deliberations 
Concerning Salary Schedules for One or More Classes of Employees; and Approval of the 
Written Closed Session Minutes of March 28, 2019. 
 
June 27, 2019 
Closed Session for Deliberations Concerning Collective Negotiating Matters; Deliberations 
Concerning Salary Schedules for One or More Classes of Employees; and Approval of the 
Written Closed Session Minutes of May 23, 2019. 
 
September 26, 2019 
Closed Session for Discussion of the Purchase or Lease of Real Property for the Use of the Public 
Body; and Approval of the Written Closed Session Minutes of June 27, 2019. 
 
October 11, 2019 
Closed Session for Discussion of the Purchase or Lease of Real Property for the Use of the Public 
Body. 
 
November 13, 2019* 
Closed Session to Discuss the Annual Evaluation of the President and Approval of the Written 
Closed Session Minutes Dated September 26, 2019 and October 11, 2019. 
 
 
 
       *Minutes not yet approved by the Board 
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Board Consideration of Bids for  

WiFi Network Equipment 
 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  13D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR WIFI NETWORK EQUIPMENT 
 
DATE:   November 21, 2019 
 
RESOURCE:  Mark Barnes, Kerri Thurman, Mike Cunningham  
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the News Gazette and Commercial News (including the 

internet) for WiFi Network Equipment.  This equipment will be installed to replace 
old network equipment and upgrade our WiFi.  Bid packets were sent to the 
following suppliers and opened at 10:30 AM on November 5, 2019 with the 
following results: 

 
 
$59,514.20  Sayers, Vernon Hills, IL 
$59,560.01  PCM-G, Herndon, VA 
$61,095.21  Alliance Technology Group, Chicago, IL 
$61,335.98  JPC IT Solutions, Sioux Falls, SD 
$61,500.00  Insight, Tempe, AZ 
$63,748.65  Presidio, Peoria, IL 
NO BID  Sentinel Technologies, Springfield, IL 
NO BID  CDW-G, Vernon Hills, IL  
NO BID  Microage, Glenview, IL 
NO BID  SKC Communications, Shawnee Mission, KS 
NO BID  Strategic Custom Solutions, Minneapolis, MN 
NO BID  WZC Networking, Novi, MI 
NO BID  Scansource, Greenville, SC 
NO BID  Current Technologies, Crawfordsville, IN 
  
 
 
This equipment was approved on the FY-20 Capital Equipment List and funding 
will be through Technology/Equipment Bonds. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from Sayer in the amount of 

$59,514.20 to purchase WiFi Networking Equipment. 
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Board Consideration of Bids for  
a Coordinate Measure Machine 

 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  13E 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR A COORDINATE MEASURE 

MACHINE  
 
DATE:   November 21, 2019 
 
RESOURCE:  Todd Flessner, Terri Cummings, Mike Cunningham  
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the News Gazette and Commercial News (including the 

internet) for a Coordinate Measure Machine.  This machine is used to measure, 
inspect, and provide reports of machined workpieces to evaluate student 
performance.  Bid packets were sent to the following suppliers and opened at 10:00 
AM on November 5, 2019 with the following results: 

 
$25,905.00  Immersive Engineering, West Bloomfield, MI 
$26,450.00  Advanced Technologies Consultants, Northville, MI 
$26,450.00  Verisurf Software, Anaheim, CA 
$32,650.00  Hexagon Metrology, Danville, IL 
NO BID  Haas Factory Outlet, Elk Grove Village, IL  
 
 
This equipment was approved on the FY-20 Capital Equipment List and will be 
funded through a Perkins Grant. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from Immersive Engineering in the 

amount of $25,905.00 to purchase a Coordinate Measure Machine. 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 14 
 
 
 
 
 
  

Information 
 

 
       

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 14A 
 
 
 

   

 
Communications 

 
 

       
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 


	packets-2019-11-21
	Mission Statement

	Title - Vision & Core Values with Diversity
	November 2019 Board Agenda 
	Title - DACC Higher Learning Center - Hoopeston Report
	Title - Report on ICCTA Seminar and Board of Representatives Meeting, November 8-9, 2019
	Title - Financial Update
	Financial Update
	Title - President's Report
	Title - Public Comment
	Title - Minutes
	MINUTES OF THE BOARD AUDIT COMMITTEE MEETING October 23, 2019
	MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OCTOBER 24, 2019
	Title - Financial Report
	Financial Report
	Title - Human Resources Report
	Human Resources Report

	Title - Unfinished Business
	Title - New Business
	13A 
Title - Board Consideration of Acceptance of FY2019 College Comprehensive Annual Financial Audit Report-External Exhibit
	13A 
Agenda Item - Board Consideration of Acceptance of FY2019 College Comprehensive Annual Financial Audit Report
	13B 
Title - Board Consideration to Accept the Annual Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report
	13B 
Agenda Item - Board Consideration to Accept the Annual Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report
	13B Post Issuance Tax Complian
ce Report 2019
	13C 
Title - Board Consideration of Making Written Closed Session Minutes Open to the Public
	13C 
Agenda Item - Board Consideration of Making Written Closed Session Minutes Open to the Public November 21, 2019
	13C 
Summary of Minutes of Closed Sessions - November 21, 2019
	13D 
Title - Board Consideration of Bids for WiFi Network Equipment
	13D 
Agenda Item - Board Consideration of Bids for WiFi Network Equipment
	13E 
Title - Board Consideration of Bids for a Coordinate Measure Machine
	13E 
Agenda Item - Board Consideration of Bids for a Coordinate Measure Machine
	Title - Information
	Title - Communications




