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Mission Statement  
 

Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 
quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences that 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 
 
 

Non-Discrimination Statement 
Danville Area Community College does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, disability 

or age in its programs and activities.  Inquiries may be directed to Jill A. Cranmore, Vice President, Human 
Resources, Affirmative Action Officer, Title IX Coordinator, and Section 504/ADA Coordinator, Danville Area 
Community College, 2000 E. Main St., Martin Luther King Memorial Way, Danville, IL  61832-5199, 217-443-

8756, or jcranmore@dacc.edu. 

      
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
  
  

 
 
Danville Area Community College will continue to be nationally recognized leader in student 
success and an active partner in building and maintaining academic excellence and the 
economic vitality of the communities it serves. 

 
 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, 
employees, community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 

Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 

Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual 
growth of those we serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing 
world.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Vision Statement 



 
BOARD OF TRUSTEES 

Community College District No. 507 
Regular Meeting 

DACC Board Room, Vermilion Hall 302 
Thursday, October 24, 2019 

5:30 p.m. 
 

 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order 

2. Pledge of Allegiance 

3. Roll Call 

4. Adoption of Agenda 

5. Recognition of Visitors 

6. Introduction of Business Communications Students 

7. Math, Science and Health Professions Report 

8. Financial Update 

9. President’s Report 

10. Public Comment 

 

12.    Unfinished Business 

13.  New Business 

 A. Board Consideration of Approval of Travel Expenditures for Trustees 

 B. Board Consideration of College Health Insurance 

 C. Board Consideration of Bids for Computer Equipment 

 D. Board Consideration of Tenure Recommendation 

  1.  Heidi Young, Clinical Coordinator, Radiologic Technology 

 

 

 

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 
enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should 
so request before approval of the agenda. 
 

11. Consent Agenda  

A. Board Consideration of the Minutes of the Public Hearing of September 26, 2019;  

Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting of September 26, 2019; and Minutes of the 

Special Board Meeting of October 11, 2019 

B. Financial Report 

C. Human Resources Report 

D. Board Consideration of Board Policy Revision 

1. Board Policy #4039 – Overtime 



 Danville Area Community College 
 Board Meeting Agenda, Page 2 
 October 24, 2019 

 

14. Information 

 A. Communications 

NOVEMBER 2019 

 8-9 ICCTA Board of Representatives Meeting, Lisle 

 11 Veterans Day Holiday – College Closed 

 21 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Hoopeston Higher Learning Center 

 22 DACC’s Got Talent, 7:30 p.m., Bremer 

          28-29 Thanksgiving Holidays – College Closed 

DECEMBER 2019 

 19 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

 25 Christmas Day Holiday – College Closed 

          26-31 Holiday Break – College Closed 

15. Adjournment 
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Introduction of Business Communications Students 
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Math, Science and Health Professions Report 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 8 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Financial Update 



     

FY20 FY19
OPERATING FUNDS FULL YR YTD % YTD YTD

(EDUCATION; OPERATIONS & MAINTENANCE) PROP BUDG 9/30/2019 OF TOTAL 9/30/2018 %

REVENUES

1   Property Tax Revenue 4,935,000 1,233,750 25 % (A) 1,173,000 25%
2   Personal Property Replacement Tax (PPRT) 525,000 10,956 2 % (B) 8,833 2%
3   ICCB Base Operating Grants 1,562,848 316,464 20 % (C) 231,609 15%
4   ICCB Equalization Grant 2,438,530 406,422 17 % (C) 342,126 17%
5   CTE Vocational Cr Hr Reimbursement 170,000 0 0 % (C) 0 0%
6   Tuition 7,725,230 3,979,403 52 % (D) 4,041,730 56%
7   Fees 1,576,960 820,524 52 % (D) 738,211 49%
8   Less:  Institutional Scholarships/Waivers (2,560,000) (1,187,735) 46 % (D) (988,239) 58%
9   Interest Income 35,000 11,675 33 % (E) 12,529 114%

10   Transfers from Other Funds 500,000 15,681 3 % (E) 13,118 3%
11   Facility Rent Revenue/Chargebacks/Other 199,500 83,885 42 % (F) 22,739 11%

12 TOTAL OPERATING REVENUES 17,108,068 5,691,025 33 % 5,595,656 34%

EXPENDITURES BY OBJECT

13   Salaries 11,069,307 2,470,735 22 % 2,423,428 22%
14   Employee Benefits 2,348,055 556,159 24 % 564,790 24%
15   Contractual Services 611,870 94,603 15 % (E) 129,145 22%
16   Materials & Supplies 1,666,615 812,675 49 % (G) 731,070 48%
17   Meetings, Travel, Conferences 316,541 21,118 7 % (E) 18,609 8%
18   Fixed Charges 207,680 144,396 70 % (E) 134,763 54%
19   Utilities 810,000 211,840 26 % (H) 150,786 19%
20   Capital Outlay 26,000 80,144 308 % (F) 0 0%
21   Transfers to other Funds/Other 52,000 6,060 12 % (E) 1,971 3%

22 TOTAL OPERATING EXPENDITURES 17,108,068 4,397,730 26 % 4,154,562 25%

23 NET REVENUE/(EXPENDITURE) 0 1,293,295 1,441,094

NOTES:

(A) Amounts are recorded quarterly at the end of each quarter.
(B) Majority of revenue is received in the second half of the fiscal year.
(C) Amounts received from ICCB will not be even.
(D) Revenue is primarily received at the beginning of each semester and institutional waivers/scholarships are awarded

    near the beginning of the semester.
(E) This revenue or expense item does not occur evenly over the year.
(F) Includes donation from the Foundation for mechantronics equipment. In-kind revenue and expense are recorded.
(G) Instructional material and supply spending is accelerated prior to the beginning of each semester.
(H) Payments on utility bills are approximately two months in arrears.  Invoice for July service has a

   billing date of August and a payment due date of September.

DANVILLE AREA COMMUNITY COLLEGE

FINANCIAL STATEMENT OF REVENUE AND EXPENDITURES
FOR  THE OPERATING FUNDS

       FY20 - Year to Date - July 1, 2019 - September 30, 2019
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President’s Report 
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Public Comment 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 11A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of the Minutes of the  
Public Hearing of September 26, 2019;  

Regular Board Meeting of September 26, 2019;  
and Special Board Meeting of October 11, 2019 



MINUTES OF PUBLIC HEARING of September 26, 2019  
On September 26, 2019, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in the 
Board Room, Vermilion Hall Room 302 at Danville Area Community College in order to 
conduct a Public Hearing on the FY2020 Budget.  
 
CALL TO ORDER  
Chairperson Harby called the meeting to order at 5:32 p.m.  
 
Trustees present: Tracy Cherry, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, Dr. Ron Serfoss, John Spezia, Greg 
Wolfe, and Student Trustee Holley Hambleton. Trustee absent: Bill Black 
 
Others present: President Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave Kietzmann, Jill 
Cranmore, Tammy Betancourt, Lara Conklin, Stacy Ehmen, Tonya Hill, Jerry Davis, Mark 
Barnes, Ronnie Johnson, and Harrison Lambert.  
 
Media present: None.  
 
On August 22, 2019, the Board approved making the FY2020 budget available for public 
inspection with appropriate notification provided to the public. The Budget has been available 
for public inspection in the President’s Office and also via the DACC website for the past 30 
days.  
 
PUBLIC COMMENT 
There were no comments, written testimony, or oral testimony from the public regarding the 
FY2020 Budget. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss and a second by Mr. Hill, the Public Hearing was adjourned at 5:34 
p.m. The motion passed by roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 nays.  
 
 

__________________________________________  
Chairperson, Board of Trustees  
 
 
__________________________________________ 
 Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 

 Approved: __________________________________ 



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING of September 26, 2019 
On September 26, 2019, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall Room 302 at Danville Area Community 
College.       
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Dave Harby called the meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
Mr. Harrison Lambert, Presidential Scholar, led the Board and those in attendance in 
reciting the Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag.       
 
ITEM 3: ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present: Tracy Cherry, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, Dr. Ron 
Serfoss, John Spezia, Greg Wolfe, and Student Trustee Holley Hambleton.  Trustee absent:  
Bill Black. 
 
Others present:  President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave 
Kietzmann, Tammy Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Lara Conklin, Stacy Ehmen, Tonya Hill, 
Jerry Davis, Mark Barnes, Ronnie Johnson, and Harrison Lambert. 
 
Media present:  None.    
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Harby asked if there were any changes requested to the agenda.  With no changes 
requested, upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the agenda was approved 
as presented.  The motion passed by unanimous voice vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
Dr. Nacco introduced the following members of the College Cabinet:  Dave Kietzmann, 
Executive Vice President, Instruction and Student Services; Tammy Betancourt, Vice 
President, Finance/Chief Financial Officer; Jill Cranmore, Vice President, Human 
Resources; Lara Conklin, Executive Director, College Relations; Stacy Ehmen, Vice 
President, Student Services; and Tonya Hill, Executive Director, Foundation.  Also present: 
Jerry Davis, Davis & Delanois; Mark Barnes, Director, Computer Network and End User 
Services; Ronnie Johnson, Instructor, Arts; and Harrison Lambert, Presidential Scholar.   
 
Media present:  None.   
 
PUBLIC HEARING 
Mr. Harby recessed the regular meeting at 5:32 p.m. for the purpose of conducting a Public 
Hearing on the FY2019 Budget.  
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RECONVENE  
Dr. Serfoss, upon completion of the Public Hearing, moved that the Board reconvene in 
regular session. The motion was seconded by Mr. Hill and passed by roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 
nays. Mr. Harby reconvened the Regular Board Meeting at 5:34 p.m. 
 
ITEM 6: DACC FOUNDATION REPORT 
Ms. Tonya Hill presented a report on DACC Foundation.  She gave highlights from the last 
year.  Ms. Hill reported that 20 new scholarships were added over the last year.  The 
Honors Program was last Friday with 550 attendees.  This year 500 scholarships were 
presented to students in the amount of $665,000.  The Food Pantry is utilized on a daily 
basis and the Student Emergency Fund is available to students in need.  Endowed 
scholarships were awarded to eight faculty members.  Many events and tours were held 
over the last year as well as professional development opportunities. 
 
The Foundation is in the whisper stage of a major gift campaign.  Ms. Hill shared the four 
initiatives in which the campaign will support:  Presidential scholarships, healthcare 
simulation lab, general scholarships, and renovation of the Jacobs Hall – Carnegie Library. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked Ms. Hill for her report and for all the Foundation does 
for students. 
 
ITEM 7: MARKETING REPORT 
Ms. Lara Conklin presented a report on Marketing.  She shared a PowerPoint presentation 
regarding digital marketing strategies for the College.  She noted that 42% of the world’s 
population uses social media and that YouTube is the preferred form of social media 
marketing worldwide with 83% of all consumers preferring it.  Ms. Conklin defined 
geotargeting, geofencing, retargeting, and over-the-top (OTT). 
 
Fall digital campaign components consisted of CLARUS Corporation (Community College 
Marketing Specialists); COMCAST Digital (Cable TV/Xfinity Online); Sinclair Digital 
(FOX/ABC/COZI/ME/CW); Hyfyn (WCIA) Digital (CBS); and Facebook (Advertising).  
The target audience for the fall campaign was residents in the service area (18-35), both 
traditional and non-traditional, unemployed and under-employed.  Ms. Conklin shared 
statistics from the fall campaign and samples of videos presented on various components.  
DACC’s social media presence includes Facebook, Twitter, LinkedIn, YouTube, and 
Instagram.   
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked Ms. Conklin for her report. 
 
ITEM 8: REPORT ON ICCTA SEMINAR AND BOARD OF 
REPRESENTATIVES MEETINGS, SEPTEMBER 13-14, 2019 
Mr. Wolfe and Mr. Harby attended the ICCTA Seminar and Board of Representatives 
Meeting on September 13-14, 2019.  They shared highlights from the meetings. 
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ITEM 9: FINANCIAL UPDATE 
Ms. Tammy Betancourt gave a financial update to the Board.  The Financial Statement of 
Revenue and Expenditures ending August 31, 2019 was included in the Board agenda book. 
 
ITEM 10: PRESIDENT’S REPORT 
Dr. Nacco shared the DACC Flash with the Board and highlighted the events from the 
month since the last meeting.       
 
ITEM 11: PUBLIC COMMENT 
 
ITEM 12: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE 
REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF AUGUST 22, 2019 

B. FINANCIAL REPORT 
C. HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 
D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY #3025 – 

TUITION WAIVERS; BOARD POLICY # 6017 – EMERGENCY 
PURCHASES – DISRUPTION OF VITAL COLLEGE SERVICES; 
AND BOARD POLICY #6020 – REIMBURSEMENT FOR 
TRAVEL AND FOOD/BEVERAGE EXPENSES 

Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, the Board approved the items on the 
Consent Agenda.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.    
 
ITEM 13: UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
ITEM 14: NEW BUSINESS 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION TO ADOPT 
FY2020 BUDGET AND RESOLUTION TO APPROVE TAX LEVY 

At the August Board of Trustees meeting the Board approved placing the tentative FY2020 
Budget on display for the required 30 days. The September 26 Board of Trustees meeting 
was also established as the date for the required Public Hearing. 
 
The budget presentation at the August meeting recommended an operational budget of 
$17,108,068. This is approximately 2.9% more that the FY19 Operating budget. With the 
adoption of a FY20 budget at the state level, including an increase of over $400,000 in our 
operating and equalization grants, the College will be able to move forward by investing in 
Human Resources to maintain quality student service, provide training needed to meet the 
employment demands of the community, provide training needed for assessment of student 
learning outcomes, add a gaming program for our students, cover software increases in 
Colleague and Blackboard, and add network monitoring software. 
 
Depending on the fluctuation in the Equalized Assessed Valuation, the tax levy rate is 
anticipated to be approximately 60.96 cents. The current rate is 60.70 cents. From FY98 
through FY01, the rate was 66 cents. The rate in FY18 was 62.55 cents. 
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Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the FY2020 
Budget with $28,639,498 total budgeted expenditures for all funds of the District, and the 
Resolution approving the Tax Levy.  The motion passed by signature vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

B. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION APPROVING 
THE TIMING OF RECOGNITION OF PROPERTY TAX 
REVENUE 

Governmental Accounting Standards Board (GASB) Statement #33 addresses accounting 
and financial reporting for nonexchange transactions. Revenue from property tax levies fall 
into this category. Since property tax levies are approved for a calendar year and the actual 
receipt of funds occur in more than one fiscal year, this GASB Statement #33 requires 
certain recognition guidelines to be followed, unless a resolution is approved by the Board 
stating what fiscal year the revenue should be allocated. 
 
This Resolution is asking the Board to recognize 100% of the 2019 levy revenue in Fiscal 
Year 2020. If approved, this action will formally allocate property tax revenue that is 
consistent with our past practice. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Ms. Cherry, the Board approved the Resolution 
recognizing 100% of the 2019 levy revenue in Fiscal Year 2020.  The motion passed by 
signature vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 
EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 

Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel Expense Control Act,” 
travel expenses for members of the Board of Trustees must be approved at an open meeting 
of the Board. 
 
A total of $239.86 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over the last month for 
expenses for the ICCTA Executive Committee Retreat at John A. Logan on August 1-3, 
2019 for Mr. Greg Wolfe. 
 
Upon motion by Ms. Cherry, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the travel 
expenses as listed above.  The motion passed by roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF ABATING TAXES 
HERETOFORE LEVIED FOR THE YEAR 2019 TO PAY DEBT 
SERVICE ON GENERAL OBLIGATION COMMUNITY 
COLLEGE BONDS, SERIES 2013A, OF COMMUNITY 
COLLEGE DISTRICT NO. 507, COUNTIES OF VERMILION, 
EDGAR, IROQUOIS, CHAMPAIGN AND FORD AND STATE OF 
ILLINOIS 

The College issued $2,995,000 of General Obligation Bonds on September 24, 2013, which 
included a tax levy sufficient to pay the principal of and interest on the Bonds based on the 
maturity schedule. However, the Bond and Interest Fund will have funds available to meet 
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the debt service, which will allow the College to abate the applicable 2019 tax levy. The 
funds are comprised of $100,000 to be received from the Foundation as a result of the 
donation from Mr. Julius W. Hegeler II and $27,287.50 of unspent 2013A bond proceeds. 
Bond counsel has advised that the available funds from the unspent 2013A bond proceeds 
may be used to meet the debt service requirements of this bond issue. The amount of the 
levy to be abated is $127,287.50.  
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and second by Ms. Cherry, the Board approved the Resolution 
abating taxes heretofore levied for the year 2019 to pay debt service on General Obligation 
Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 507, 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois. The 
motion passed by roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 nays.     
  

E. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF DACC 
TECHNOLOGY PLAN 

The proposed DACC Technology Plan for FY2020 to FY2022 is included in the Board 
packet. Technology provides useful and powerful tools allowing students, faculty and staff 
members to achieve their goals in higher education. The College’s guiding principles to 
keep technology in line with teaching principles and current student service needs provide a 
planning framework for the improvement, expansion and maintenance of technology 
resources utilized by all parties at the College. 
 
With the dependence on technology throughout the educational community constantly 
growing, the College, keeping in mind its fiduciary responsibility to the community, has 
established three-year capital equipment plans in order to provide a mechanism for 
examining future technological equipment needs. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the DACC 
Technology Plan for FY2020 to FY 2022.  The motion passed by roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 
nays.    
 

F. BOARD CONSIDERATION FOR PHS PROJECT TO REPLACE 
SECTIONS OF THE TECHNOLOGY CENTER ROOF 

Approval is being requested for a PHS Project to replace two sections of the Technology 
Center Roof. These sections total 28,000 sq. ft. of Technology Center roof area, which were 
installed in 1996 and the warranties have expired. 
 
It is proposed that Protection, Health, and Safety (PHS) funds be used for this project. The 
approved PHS levy over the next 5 years plus excess funds from previous PHS projects 
would fund replacement of this roof. 
 
The Illinois Community College Board no longer requires a resolution and certified minutes 
of the DACC Board meeting for projects utilizing Protection, Health, and Safety funds. Don 
Walton of Walton and Associates Architects has developed the specifications, scope of the 
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project, and an estimated cost of $460,000.00, including contingency, A/E fees, and a 3% 
per year inflation factor. 
 
When PHS funds become available, bidding will begin so that the roof can be replaced.   
 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and second by Ms. Cherry, the Board approved a PHS project to 
replace the Technology Center roof at an estimated cost of $460,000.00.  The motion 
passed by roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 nays     
 

G. BOARD CONSIDERATION FOR HUNTER ALIGNMENT 
SYSTEM UPGRADE EQUIPMENT 

Board approval is requested to purchase an Aligner with Premium Compact Cabinet & 24” 
Widescreen LCD monitor. This equipment will replace outdated equipment on the 
alignment machine used in the Auto Mechanics Program in the Technology Center. Hunter 
Alignment equipment is only available through local distributer Ben Tire Distributors 
located in Indianapolis, Indiana. 
 
This Hunter Alignment System was approved on the FY-20 Capital Equipment List and 
funding will be through the Perkins Grants. 
 
Upon motion by Ms. Cherry, and second by Mr. Wolfe, the Board approved the bid of 
$26,630.00 for Ben Tire Distributors, Indianapolis, Indiana for Hunter Alignment System 
Upgrade equipment for the Tech Center Auto Mechanics program.  The motion passed by 
roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 nays     
 
ITEM 15: INFORMATION 

A. COMMUNICATIONS 
 

ITEM 16:   CLOSED SESSION FOR DISCUSSION OF THE PURCHASE OR 
LEASE OF REAL PROPERTY FOR THE USE OF THE PUBLIC BODY; AND 
APPROVAL OF THE WRITTEN CLOSED SESSION MINUTES OF JUNE 27, 2019  
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Ms. Cherry, the following Resolution was 
adopted by roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 nays.  
 
BE IT RESOLVED, in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 120/2(c 5, 21) of the 
Open Meetings Act, the Board of Trustees of Community College District #507 shall enter 
a Closed Session for discussion of the purchase or lease of real property for the use of the 
public body; and approval of the written Closed Session minutes of June 27, 2019.  
 
The Board went into Closed Session at 7:20 p.m. 
 
OPEN SESSION  
The Board returned to Open Session at 7:33 p.m. 
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ITEM 17: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 7:34 p.m. 
       
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  



 
 
 
 
MINUTES OF SPECIAL MEETING – October 11, 2019 
On October 11, 2019, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the Counties 
of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford, in the State of Illinois, met in special 
session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall, Room 302 at Danville Area Community College, 
Danville, Illinois.     
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
The meeting was called to order at 7:30 a.m. 
 
ITEM 2: ROLL CALL 
Roll was called.  Trustees present:  Bill Black, Dave Harby, Dr. Ron Serfoss, John Spezia, Greg 
Wolfe, and Student Trustee Holley Hambleton.  Trustees absent:  Tracy Cherry (arrived at 7:31 
a.m.) and Terry Hill.     
 
Others present:  President Stephen Nacco; Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave Kietzmann, 
Mike Cunningham, and Jill Cranmore.     
 
Media present:   None. 
 
ITEM 3: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, the agenda was adopted.  The motion 
passed by unanimous voice vote:  5 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 4: PUBLIC COMMENT 
There was no public comment. 
 
ITEM 5: CLOSED SESSION FOR DISCUSSION OF THE PURCHASE OR LEASE 
OF REAL PROPERTY FOR THE USE OF THE PUBLIC BODY 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Black, the following resolution was adopted 
by unanimous roll call vote (5 yeas, 0 nays): 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 120/2 of the Open Meetings 
Act, the Board of Trustees of Community College District #507 shall enter a Closed Session for 
discussion of the purchase or lease of real property for the use of the public body.     
 
The meeting went into Closed Session at 7:31 p.m.   
 
Mr. Wolfe left the meeting at 7:59 a.m. 
 
The meeting returned to Open Session at 8:00 a.m.     
 
ITEM 6: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF OFFER TO PURCHASE 
FOR THE U.S. ARMY RESERVE BUILDING 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved the Offer to 
Purchase for the U.S. Army Reserve building.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  4 yeas, 1 
nay.  (Mr. Wolfe had to leave the meeting prior to the vote for business reasons; however, he 
asked Mr. Harby that his vote of yea be noted.) 
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ITEM 7: ADJOURNMENT   
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 8:01 a.m.                       
      

 
  
   
      _____________________________________ 
      Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
       
 
      _____________________________________ 
      Secretary, Board of Trustees      _
 
 
Approved: ___________________________                                                           
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Human Resources Report 

October 24, 2019 
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Human Resources 
(Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources processes 
being met.) 
 
1. New Employees 

 
 (Notice of Full-Time Classified Employment Contract) 
 
 Carten, Aja – Disability and Testing Specialist, Testing Center 
 Effective Date: October 21, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $31,714.00 annually 
 

(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
 Davis, Georgina – Perkins Co-Coordinator, Perkins 
 Effective Date:  July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $2,500.00 annually 
 
2. Student Workers 

 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Dye, Micah – Student Employee, Business & Technology 
Effective Date:  October 10, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Falanga, Maria – Student Employee, Library 
Effective Date:  September 25, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Loggins, Nicole – Student Employee, Business & Technology 
Effective Date:  October 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Rameno, Andrea – Student Employee, Child Development Center 
Effective Date:  September 17, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 
 
White, Kailey –Student Employee, Financial Aid Office 
Effective Date:  September 23, 2019 through June 2020 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 

3. Title Change 
 
 Barnes, Mark – Director, Information Technology 
 Effective Date:  November 1, 2019 
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4. Salary Adjustment  
 
 Brown, Wes, Middle College Coordinator, Adult Education & Literacy 
 Effective Date:  November 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $35,568.00 annually 
 
 Connor, Brandice – Literacy Coordinator, Adult Education & Literacy 
 Effective Date:  November 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $35,568.00 annually 
 

Hicks, Clayton - Assistant Baseball Coach/Coordinator of Strength and Conditioning/ 
Athletic Academic Supervisor, Athletics 

 Effective Date:  November 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $35,568.00 annually 
 
 Waller, Michael – Security Officer, Security 
 Effective Date:  November 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020 
 Rate of Pay:  $35,568.00 annually 
 
5. Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Fall Semester 2019 
 
6. Authorization for Employment 
 

 

 
 
 
 

AUTHORIZATION FOR EMPLOYMENT 
October 2019 

Name Position Beginning 
Date 

Ending 
Date 

Scheduled 
No. of Hours 

* 

Wage 

Chappell, Emily Liberal 
Arts/WC 

8/16/2019 6/30/2020 20 18.90 

Jarmer, Marla Liberal 
Arts/WC 

8/16/2019 6/30/2020 20 22.68 

White, Kaighla Liberal 
Arts/WC 

8/16/2019 06/30/2020 20 18.90 
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Board Consideration of Board Policy Revision   

1. Board Policy #4039 – Overtime 
 

  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  11D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY REVISION 

1. Board Policy #4039 – Overtime 
 
DATE:   October 24, 2019 
 
RESOURCE:  Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: 1. Board Policy #4039 – Overtime 
 

The proposed revision removes the requirement that accumulated 
compensatory time must be used within the same contract year.  The policy is 
being revised to comply with current procedures. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION:   May we ask the Board to approve the revision to Board Policy #4039 

– Overtime.         



 

 

 
 

Board Policies and Procedures Manual  

 

Index | Section 4000 – Human Resources 

 

Overtime              4039 

 

Overtime work shall be approved in advance by the appropriate supervisor and appropriately reported. 

 

The College may compensate employees who work more than their regularly scheduled forty (40) hour 

work week by providing compensatory time off at a rate of one and one-half hours for each overtime 

hour worked.  All accumulated time must be used within the same contract year in which it is 

accumulated.  No more than two (2) consecutive work days may be scheduled for compensatory time 

off. 

 

Choice of compensation shall be the privilege of the employee at the time overtime is assigned. 

 

For those represented by collective bargaining agreements, see respective collective bargaining 

agreement. 

 

 

Adopted:  7-28-92; Revised:     

__________________________________ 
 

http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?
http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?section=6000
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Unfinished Business 
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New Business 
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Board Consideration of Approval of  

Travel Expenses for Trustees 
     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 13A 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 

EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 
 
MEETING DATE: October 24, 2019 
 
RESOURCE: Dr. Stephen Nacco 
     
SUBMITTED FOR: APPROVAL 
 
SUMMARY: Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel 

Expense Control Act,” travel expenses for members of the Board of 
Trustees must be approved at an open meeting of the Board.   

 
A total of $571.39 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over 
the last month.  The expenses were for the ICCTA Seminar and Board of 
Representatives Meetings on September 13-14, 2019 in Springfield for 
Mr. Dave Harby ($150.00) and Mr. Greg Wolfe ($421.39).                 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve the travel expenses as listed above.       
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Board Consideration of College Health Insurance 

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 13B 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF COLLEGE HEALTH INSURANCE 
 
MEETING DATE: October 24, 2019 
 
RESOURCE: Tammy Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Dr. Stephen Nacco, and Insurance 

Committee 
     
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: As health insurance costs continue to rise, the College continues to 

experience increased costs in providing comprehensive, affordable health 
insurance for our employees and their families.  The health insurance 
industry continues to become more and more complex each year and the 
contributing factors to the increase in costs continue to expand and grow. 

 
 In 2017, the Board entered into an agreement with ONI Risk Partners to 

provide consulting services to assist in evaluating current insurance plans 
and providing options available to the College to ensure we are providing 
health insurance for our employees that is financially sustainable to the 
College. 

 
During bargaining sessions with Classified Staff two-and-a-half years ago 
and with the Faculty Association this year, the College promised to do its 
best to find a way to make healthcare for families more affordable without 
1) shifting an undue burden over to individual recipients; and 2) busting 
the DACC budget.   
  

 The Insurance Committee requested that ONI once again work on our 
behalf to find comparable, affordable plans.  ONI obtained proposals for 
our health insurance coverage for calendar year 2020.  They received rates 
from Health Alliance and Blue Cross Blue Shield for fully insured plans.  
The Insurance Committee is comprised of 14 members:  4 administrators, 
5 classified staff, 4 faculty, and 1 confidential staff. 

 
The Insurance Committee met with ONI and unanimously voted to accept 
a proposal from Blue Cross Blue Shield.  The plan is designed with 
significant savings that allow the College to offer an annual plan that 
appears to be budget neutral.  The savings in premium is transferred to the 
dependent and spousal premium rates. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
The College continues to offer a Base Plan and a High Deductible Health 
Plan.  The employee only premium remains unchanged with the College 
paying the full premium.  In 2019, the Health Alliance family plans 
offered were $1,659 or $2,116 per month.  In 2020, the recommended 
Blue Cross Blue Shield family plans will be $599 or $848 per month.  The 
deductibles and out-of-pocket maximum are both lower with the Blue 
Cross Blue Shield plan and offer a national network of providers. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve Blue Cross Blue Shield as the College’s 
health insurance provider effective January 1, 2020. 
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Board Consideration of Bids for  

Computer Equipment 
     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  13C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR COMPUTER EQUIPMENT 
 
DATE:   October 24, 2019 
 
RESOURCE:  Mark Barnes, Dave Kietzmann, Mike Cunningham  
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the News Gazette and Commercial News (including the 

internet) for computer equipment approved on the FY20 Capital Equipment list.  
Bids were requested for 245 Lenovo ThinkCentre M920s Tower computers, 19 
Lenovo ThinkStation P330 Towers, 25 Lenovo ThinkCentre M920t Towers, 18 
Lenovo ThinkPad P52 Laptops, and 80 NEC 22” Widescreen Desktop Monitors.  
Bid packets were sent to the following suppliers and opened at 10:00 AM on 
October 1, 2019 with the following results: 

 
$ 288,737.39  Connection, Merrimack, NH 
$ 301,693.16  Zones, Inc., Auburn, WA 
$ 304,445.00  JCP IT Solutions, Sioux Falls, DS 

 $ 309,560.58  Strickly Technology, Fort Fauderdale, FL 
$ 314,840.16  Microage, Glenview, IL 
$ 317,860.00  Arnolds, Danville, IL 
$ 319,027.52 *  DHE Computer Systems, Centennial, CO 
NO BID  Next Level Technology, Sioux Falls, SD 
NO BID  PCM-G, Herndon, VA 
NO BID  CDW-G, Vernon Hills, IL 
NO BID  HPI Technology Distributer, Lakewood, NJ 
NO BID  Joy Systems, Somerset, NJ 
 
* DHE Computer Systems did not complete official bid forms 
 

   
This equipment was approved on the FY-20 Capital Equipment List and funding 
will be through Technology/Equipment Bonds. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from Connection in the amount 

of $288,737.39 to purchase Computer Equipment.   



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 13D 

 
 
 
 
 

  
Board Consideration of Tenure Recommendation 

1. Heidi Young, Clinical Coordinator, Radiologic Technology 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



Agenda Item:  13D 
 
Agenda Title: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF TENURE RECOMMENDATION 

1. Heidi Young, Clinical Coordinator, Radiologic Technology 
 
Meeting Date: October 24, 2019 
 
Resource: Dr. Stephen Nacco, President 
  David L. Kietzmann, Executive Vice President for Instruction and Student Services 
   
Submitted for: Action 
 
Summary: Full-time faculty members completing their third academic year of probation must be 

granted tenure, extended another year of probation, or dismissed. Attached is the 
recommendation for approval of tenure status for the individual listed above. Dave 
Kietzmann and the respective supervisor have evaluated her performance and personnel 
files to ensure that her credentials are in order. This outstanding faculty member is an 
asset to the instructional programs at Danville Area Community College. It is our honor 
and privilege to recommend so many newer and talented faculty members for tenure 
status. This individual is a superior classroom teacher who will serve DACC well into the 
future.  

 
 
 
 

 
. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Recommendation: May we ask the Board to approve tenure status for Ms. Heidi Young. 
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