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Mission Statement  

 
Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 

quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences which 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 
          

  
 
        
 
 
         



 
 
 
  
  

Danville Area Community College will continue to be an active partner in building and maintaining 
academic excellence and economic vitality in the diverse communities it serves. This will be 
accomplished by: 

 
 Creating a learning culture where assessment of student academic achievement is valued and 

used across the institution, departments, and programs to improve learning; 
 Providing a friendly and dynamic environment in which to learn and grow; 
 Embracing the ever-changing world of technology; 
 Offering an affordable and convenient education for learners; 
 Promoting a global perspective of education; 
 Reflecting diversity and inclusiveness in our students, faculty, and staff; 
 Cultivating partnerships with the community to develop innovative and vital solutions to meet 

changing academic and economic needs; 
 Challenging students to explore their full potential through rigorous academics, diverse campus 

organizations, and innovative career experiences; and 
 Enhancing opportunities for student success through comprehensive services. 

 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, employees, 
community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 

Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 

Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual growth of those we 
serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing world.   
 

Vision Statement 



 

 
 
 

BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
Community College District No. 507 

Regular Meeting 
HOOPESTON HIGHER LEARNING CENTER, ROOM 101 

Thursday, October 26, 2017 
5:30 p.m. 

 

AGENDA 
1. Call to Order 

2. Pledge of Allegiance 

3. Roll Call 

4. Adoption of Agenda 

5. Recognition of Visitors 

6. Portrait Unveiling Ceremony 

7. DACC Higher Learning Center – Hoopeston Report 

8. Report on ACCT Annual Leadership Congress, September 25-27, 2017 

9. President’s Report 

10. Public Comment 

 

12. Unfinished Business 

13.    New Business 

A. Board Consideration of Acceptance of FY2017 College Comprehensive             

Annual Financial Audit Report (External Exhibit) 

B. Board Consideration of Resolution Abating Taxes Heretofore Levied for the        

Year 2017 to Pay Debt Service on General Obligation Community College        

Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 507, Counties of 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois 

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 
enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should 
so request before approval of the agenda. 
 

11. Consent Agenda  

A. Board Consideration of the Minutes of the Public Hearing of September 28, 2017; the 

Regular Board Meeting of September 28, 2017; and the Board Audit Committee 

Meeting of October 16, 2017 

B. Financial Report 

C. Human Resources Report 

D. Board Consideration of Authorization for Destruction of Verbatim Recording of 

Closed Session Dated April 26, 2016 (Written Minutes of the Named Meeting were 

Approved by the Board on May 24, 2016)    

5:00 – Meet and Greet with 
Carle Regional Health Center 

Board Members 
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C. Board Consideration to Accept the Annual Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report    

for the Danville Area Community College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, 

Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford and State of Illinois 

D. Board Consideration of Bids for Computer Equipment 

E. Board Consideration of College Health Insurance  

14. Information 

 A. Communications 

 
OCTOBER 2017 
  27 Spring/Winter Online registration begins 

  30 Spring/Winter On-campus registration begins 

 NOVEMBER 2017 
    3 Food Drive Friday for the DACC Food Pantry 

    3 Family Science Night; 5:30-8:00 p.m., Mary Miller Gym 

    4 Eastern Illinois Foodbank Foodmobile Distribution, 8 a.m. to 1 p.m., Tech Center 

  10 Veterans Day Holiday – College Closed 

  15 Financial Aid Workshops, 4:30-6:30 p.m., Lincoln Hall Room 205 

  16 International Food Festival, 11:00 a.m.-1:00 p.m. 

  16 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

  22 Engineering Advisory Meeting, 12:00-3:00 p.m., Bremer 

         23-24 Thanksgiving Holiday – College Closed 

 DECEMBER 2017 
1 Food Drive Friday for the DACC Food Pantry 

1 Holiday Party, Turtle Run 

         12-18 Final Exams 

   14 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

   15 Nursing Pinning Ceremony, 2:00 p.m., Bremer Theater 

         25-31 Christmas Break – College Closed 

 JANUARY 2018 
     1 New Year’s Day Holiday – College Closed 

          10-12 Faculty/Staff In-Service Days 

   15 M.L. King’s Birthday Holiday – College Closed 

   16 Spring Classes Begin 

   28 Farm Toy Show 

   30 Academic Challenge, 9:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m., Mary Miller 

   31 Eagle Day, 9:00 a.m. and 12:00 p.m., Mary Miller 

15. Adjournment 
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Portrait Unveiling Ceremony 
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DACC Higher Learning Center – Hoopeston Report 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 8 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Report on ACCT Annual Leadership Congress,  

September 25-27, 2017 
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President’s Report 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 10 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Public Comment 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 11A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of the Minutes of the  
Public Hearing of September 28, 2017; the  

Regular Board Meeting of September 28, 2017; and the  
Board Audit Committee Meeting of October 16, 2017 



MINUTES OF PUBLIC HEARING of September 28, 2017 
On September 28, 2017, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
the Board Room, Vermilion Hall, Room 302 at Danville Area Community College in order 
to conduct a Public Hearing on the 2017 Fiscal Year Budget. 
 
CALL TO ORDER 
Chairperson Harby called the meeting to order at 5:35 p.m. 
 
Trustees present:  Bill Black, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, Tonya Hill, Dr. Ron Serfoss, Greg 
Wolfe, and Student Trustee Sadie Edwards.  Trustee absent:  John Spezia.     
 
Others present:  President Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave 
Kietzmann, Mike Cunningham, Jill Cranmore, Tammy Clark-Betancourt, Lara Conklin, 
Jerry Davis, Stephanie Yates, Jeff Rush, Jarjorie Larson, Amanda English, Jessica Price, 
Kevin Dawson, Toby Peck, and Daria Hogren.                                      
 
Media present:  None. 
 
On August 24, 2017, the Board approved making the FY2018 budget available for public 
inspection with appropriate notification provided to the public.  The Budget has been 
available for public inspection in the President’s Office and also via the DACC website for 
the past 30 days.     
 
PUBLIC COMMENT 
There were no comments, written testimony, or oral testimony from the public regarding 
the FY2018 Budget. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe and a second by Mrs. Hill, the Public Hearing was adjourned at 
5:40 p.m.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING of September 28, 2017 
On September 28, 2017, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall, Room 302 at Danville Area 
Community College.   
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Dave Harby called the meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
Ms. Daria Hogren, Presidential Scholar, led the Board and those in attendance in reciting 
the Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag.     
 
ITEM 3: ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present:  Bill Black, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, Tonya Hill, Dr. 
Ron Serfoss, Greg Wolfe, and Student Trustee Sadie Edwards.  Trustee absent:  John 
Spezia. 
 
Others present:  President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave 
Kietzmann, Tammy Clark-Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Mike Cunningham, Lara Conklin, 
Jerry Davis, Stephanie Yates, Jeff Rush, Marjorie Larson, Amanda English, Jessica Price, 
Kevin Dawson, Toby Peck, and Daria Hogren.                                                                                                   
 
Media present:  None.    
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Harby asked if there were any changes requested to the agenda.  With no changes 
requested, upon motion by Mr. Black, and a second by Mrs. Hill, the agenda was approved 
as presented.  The motion passed by unanimous voice vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
Dr. Nacco introduced the following members of the Administrative Council:  Dave 
Kietzmann, Executive Vice President of Instruction and Student Services; Tammy Clark-
Betancourt, Vice President, Finance/Chief Financial Officer; Jill Cranmore, Vice President, 
Human Resources; Mike Cunningham, Vice President, Administrative Services; and Lara 
Conklin, Executive Director, College Relations.  Also present:  Jerry Davis, Davis & 
Delanois; Stephanie Yates, Director, Customized Training; Jeff Rush, Coordinator, 
Instructional Media; Marjorie Larson, Instructor, Math; Amanda English, Corporate 
Training Facilitator, Watchfire Signs; Jessica Price, Corporate EHS Coordinator, 
thyssenkrupp Presta; Kevin Dawson, Vice President, Human Resources, Viscofan; Toby 
Peck; and Daria Hogren, Presidential Scholar.   
 
Media present:  None.   
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PUBLIC HEARING 
Mr. Harby recessed the regular meeting at 5:35 p.m. for the purpose of conducting a Public 
Hearing on the FY2018 Budget. 
 
RECONVENE 
Mr. Wolfe, upon completion of the Public Hearing, moved that the Board reconvene in 
regular session.  The motion was seconded by Mrs. Hill and passed by roll call vote:  7 
yeas, 0 nays.  Mr. Harby reconvened the Regular Board Meeting at 5:40 p.m. 
 
ITEM 6: CORPORATE AND COMMUNITY EDUCATION – CUSTOMIZED  
  TRAI NING REPORT 
Ms. Stephanie Yates shared information regarding Customized Training at DACC.  She 
reported 4,559 employees representing 89 companies were trained in FY2017.  She also 
stated that even with the absence of the DCEO ETIP grant and Incumbent Worker Funding 
in FY2017, training enrollment remained steady.  Quality, Safety, and Leadership training 
continues to be strong programs for DACC.  The most significant decrease is in the 
healthcare professions where they are trending toward shorter workshops that fall outside of 
ICCB eligibility. 
 
Ms. Yates shared a few program highlights from FY2017.  She reported that 40 employees 
from 14 different companies attended an Open Enrollment Leadership Certificate Series; 
Customized Statistical Analysis training was held at Watchfire Signs; Customized customer 
service training was held for Walgreens Accounting; and two sessions were held of FMEA, 
Root Cause Analysis, a Lean Certificate Series and Six Sigma Green Belt certifications to 
assist with continuous improvement goals of industry partners. 
 
Goals for 2018 for Customized Training are to offer more options for industry for hands-on 
computer skills training and customer service skills for industries. 
 
Ms. Yates then introduced Ms. Amanda English, Corporate Training Facilitator for 
Watchfire Signs; Ms. Jessica Price, Corporate EHS Coordinator for TK Presta; and Mr. 
Kevin Dawson, Vice President of Human Resources for Viscofan.  Ms. English, Ms. Price, 
and Mr. Dawson shared with the Board how customized training has benefitted each of 
their companies. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked Ms. Yates for her report and the presenters for their 
partnerships with the College. 
 
ITEM 7: REPORT ON ICCTA SEMINAR AND BOARD OF  
  REPRESENTATIVES MEETING, SEPTEMBER 8, 2017 
Mr. Harby shared information from attending the ICCTA meetings on September 8, 2017 at 
Heartland Community College. 
 
ITEM 8: REPORT ON ACCT ANNUAL LEADERSHIP CONGRESS,  
  SEPTEMBER 25-28, 2017 
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Mr. Harby and Mr. Wolfe attended the ACCT Annual Leadership Congress and will share 
their reports at the October 26, 2017 Board meeting. 
 
ITEM 9: PRESIDENT’S REPORT 
Dr. Nacco shared the DACC Flash with the Board and highlighted the events from the 
month since the last meeting.     
 
ITEM 10: PUBLIC COMMENT 
There was no public comment.   
 
ITEM 11: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE 
REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF AUGUST 24, 2017; AND THE 
SPECIAL BOARD MEETING OF AUGUST 31, 2017 

B. FINANCIAL REPORT 
C. HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 
D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY REVISIONS 

1. BOARD POLICY #4001 – ADDITIONAL EDUCATION 
2. BOARD POLICY #4027 – HOLIDAYS  
3. BOARD POLICY #5002 – COMMUNITY USE OF COLLEGE 

FACILITIES 
4. BOARD POLICY #6005 – SUBMISSION OF GRANT 

PROPOSALS 
A request was made to remove Item 11D from the consent agenda to be discussed and 
voted on individually.  Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, 11A, 11B, 
and 11D were approved.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.    
 
ITEM 11: D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY REVISIONS 

1. BOARD POLICY #4001 – ADDITIONAL EDUCATION 
Currently the Additional Education policy allows for a spouse and/or eligible children of 
full-time employees to have standard tuition waived for DACC eligible courses.  All such 
benefits cease upon the death of an employee.  This policy recommendation would allow 
the spouse and eligible children to have standard tuition waived up to three (3) academic 
years following the death of an employee.  The policy recommendation also increases the 
age of a dependent child from 24 to 26 which is consistent with our insurance benefits for 
employee dependent children. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mrs. Hill, the Board approved the revision of 
Board Policy #4001 – Additional Education.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 
nays. 

2. BOARD POLICY #4027 – HOLIDAYS  
There are two recommended revisions to the policy.  DACC recognizes President’s Day in 
the approved academic calendar.  The current Board policy lists Abraham Lincoln’s 
birthday as a holiday.  Our recommendation is to replace Abraham Lincoln’s birthday with 
Presidents’ Day to reflect the current holiday observation.  The second recommendation is 



Board of Trustees 
Page 4 of 7 

September 28, 2017 
 

to eliminate Spring Holiday I and Spring Holiday II and replace them with Good Friday and 
a Floating Holiday.  This allows the College to be open on the Monday following Easter 
Sunday as an additional day for business to serve students and community members. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, the Board approved the revision 
of Board Policy #4027 – Holidays.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

3. BOARD POLICY #5002 – COMMUNITY USE OF COLLEGE 
FACILITIES 

A recommendation is being made to revise the fee structure of the Community Use of 
College Facilities policy.  After a few months of trying to implement the higher fee rates, 
we have experienced many complaints and concerns from users that the rates are too high.  
After careful consideration, a recommendation is being made to revise the fees which are, 
in most cases, 50% less.  Verbiage has also been included that allows for a maintenance fee 
deposit if necessary. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the revision of 
Board Policy #5002 – Community Use of College Facilities.  The motion passed by roll call 
vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

4. BOARD POLICY #6005 – SUBMISSION OF GRANT 
PROPOSALS 

The Office of Management and Budget’s (OMB) Uniform Administration Requirements, 
Cost Principles, and Audit Requirements for Federal Awards (commonly called “Uniform 
Guidance”) was officially implemented in December 2014.  Within this guidance were 
procurement policy changes, however, there was an option to delay the implementation of 
those requirements until June 30, 2017.  In order to ensure that the College was in 
compliance with all of the policies and procedures related to federal grant awards, the 
College engaged CliftonLarsonAllen to review all of the College’s policies and procedures 
related to federal grant awards.  The results of the engagement provided a set of 
comprehensive policies and procedures that meet the requirements of the Uniform 
Guidance.  Additionally, the title of the Board policy will be revised to Submission of Grant 
Proposals and Grants Management.   
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mrs. Hill, the Board approved the revision of 
Board Policy #6005 – Submission of Grant Proposals.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  
7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 12: UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
ITEM 13: NEW BUSINESS 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION TO ADOPT 
FY2018 BUDGET AND RESOLUTION TO APPROVE TAX LEVY 
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At the August Board of Trustees meeting the Board approved placing the tentative FY2018 
on display for the required 30 days.  The September 28 Board of Trustees meeting was also 
established as the date for the required Public Hearing. 
 
The budget presentation at the August meeting recommended an operational budget of 
$16,050,686.  This is approximately 3.2% more than the FY17 Operating budget.  Due to 
the budget impasse at the State level, the College had been forced to eliminate positions and 
make budget cuts wherever possible.  However, with funds being allocated for FY17 and 
FY18, the College will invest in Human Resources to maintain quality student service and 
provide training needed to meet the employment demands of the community. 
 
Depending on the fluctuation in the Equalized Assessed Valuation, the tax levy rate is 
anticipated to be approximately 61.74 cents.  The current rate is 62.35 cents.  From FY98 
through FY01, the rate was 66 cents.   
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mrs. Hill, the Board approved the FY2018 
Budget which included budgeted revenue of $27,934,614 and budgeted expenses of 
$26,196,613 and the Resolution approving the Tax Levy.  The motion passed by signature 
vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

B. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION APPROVING 
THE TIMING OF RECOGNITION OF PROPERTY TAX 
REVENUE 

Governmental Accounting Standards Board (GASB) Statement #33 addresses accounting 
and financial reporting for nonexchange transactions.  Revenue from property tax levies fall 
into this category.  Since property tax levies are approved for a calendar year and the actual 
receipt of funds occur in more than one fiscal year, this GASB Statement #33 requires 
certain recognition guidelines to be followed, unless a resolution is approved by the Board 
stating what fiscal year the revenue should be allocated.  The Resolution is asking the 
Board to recognize 100% of the 2017 levy revenue in Fiscal Year 2018.  If approved, this 
action will formally allocate property tax revenue that is consistent with our past practice. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mrs. Hill, the Board approved the Resolution 
recognizing 100% of the 2017 levy revenue in Fiscal Year 2018.  The motion passed by 
signature vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 
EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 

Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel Expense Control Act,” 
travel expenses for members of the Board of Trustees must be approved at an open meeting 
of the Board.   
 
A total of $1,681.72 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over the last month.  
$100.00 for the ICCTA Seminar at Heartland Community College on 9/8/17 for Mr. Dave 
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Harby; and $1,581.72 for the ACCT Leadership Congress in Las Vegas on 9/25-9/28/17 for 
Mr. Greg Wolfe.   
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the travel 
expenses as listed above.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.   
 

D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF AMENDMENT TO 
ELECTRONIC PROCESSING AGREEMENT WITH OFFICIAL 
PAYMENTS CORPORATION 

In conjunction with the continuation of essential spending guidelines and the search for cost 
saving measures, an option to save costs is passing on electronic processing service fees, or 
sometimes referred to as convenience fees, to the consumer (student, parent, etc.)  
Currently, these costs are approaching $30,000 annually.   
 
Consumers have multiple payment methods available including cash, check, e-check/ACH, 
and credit/debit card.  When consumers choose to pay with an e-check, debit card or credit 
card, the applicable card company charges a service fee.  Given that consumers have 
payment methods available to them that do not involve the charge of a service fee, the 
Enrollment Management Team agreed that the related cost of the choice to pay with an 
electronic payment method should not be absorbed by the College, but rather by the 
consumer who is making the payment choice. 
 
Our Ellucian partner for electronic payment processing is Official Payments Corporation 
and the proposed amendment to our contract is attached.  The fee that would be charged to 
the consumer for debit/credit card transactions would be 2.65% of the payment amount, 
with a minimum service fee of $2.95 per payment and for e-checks $1.75 per payment.   
 
It is anticipated that this change would not be effective until the Summer or Fall semester of 
2018 as there are technological and software programming changes that will need to occur. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Black, the Board approved the 
Amendment to the Electronic Transaction Processing Agreement with Official Payments 
Corporation, which would charge the consumer any applicable electronic processing 
service fees.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 14: INFORMATION 

A. COMMUNICATIONS 
 Letter from Dr. Jacobs expressing appreciation to Dr. Nacco and 

the Board of Trustees for naming the Carnegie Library in her 
honor. 

 
Mr. Harby noted the October 26 Board meeting will be held at the Hoopeston Higher 
Learning Center and the Board Retreat is scheduled for Saturday, November 4.  More 
details will follow regarding the Board Retreat. 
 



Board of Trustees 
Page 7 of 7 

September 28, 2017 
 

ITEM 15: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 7:00 p.m.        
 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  



MINUTES OF BOARD AUDIT COMMITTEE MEETING – October 16, 2017 
On October 16, 2017, the Audit Committee of the Board of Trustees of Community College 
District 507, in the Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State 
of Illinois, held a meeting in the President’s Conference Room, Vermilion Hall 206, at 
Danville Area Community College. 
 
Mr. Harby called the meeting to order at 9:00 a.m. 
 
Trustees present:  Bill Black, Dave Harby, and Dr. Ron Serfoss 
 
Others present:  President Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Tammy Clark-
Betancourt, Vice President, Finance/Chief Financial Officer; Debbie Knight, Controller; 
Dave Kietzmann, Executive Vice President of Instruction and Student Services; and 
representatives from CliftonLarsonAllen LLP, Mike Hillary, Whitney Yoder, and Sandy 
Cook.                                
 
Media present:  None 
 
The purpose of the meeting was the presentation of the Danville Area Community College 
audit by CliftonLarsonAllen LLP for the year ended June 30, 2017. 
 
The Committee, representatives from CliftonLarsonAllen, and those representing the 
Business Office discussed the audit in detail.      
 
The Audit Committee and Dr. Nacco thanked Tammy Clark-Betancourt, Debbie Knight, and 
their department for their dedication and hard work in making the audit a success.  They also 
thanked CliftonLarsonAllen for the audit and the service the College received. 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to bring before the Committee, the meeting was adjourned at 
10:05 a.m. 
 
  
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  
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FINANCIAL REPORT 
October 26, 2017 
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Human Resources Report 

October 26, 2017 
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Human Resources 
 
(Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources 
processes being met.) 

 
1. Ne w Employees 
  

 (Notice of Full-Time Classified Employment Contract) 
 

 Dieu, Donna – Building Service Attendant, Building Services 
 Effective Date: October 23, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $27,029.00 annually 
 
 Saylor, Diana - Building Service Attendant, Building Services 
 Effective Date: October 23, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay: $27,029.00 annually 
 
     2. Student Workers and Work Study Students 

 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Bogard, Brianna – Student Employee, America Reads 
Effective Date: October 10, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Bower, Michaela – Student Employee, Student Success Center 
Effective Date: September 29, 2017 through December 15, 2017 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Divan, James – Student Employee, Business & Technology 
Effective Date:  October 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 

     3. Education Salary Adjustment 
 
 Moreland, Jamie- Echocardiography Instructor, Math/Science & Health Professions 

Effective Date:  November 1, 2017 through June 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay:  $49,740.42 annually 

       
     4. Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Fall Semester 2017 



































 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 11D 
 
 
 
 
 

  
Board Consideration of Authorization for Destruction of  

Verbatim Recording of Closed Session Dated  
April 26, 2016 (written minutes of the named meeting  

were approved by the Board on May 24, 2016 
 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  11D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF AUTHORIZATION FOR 

DESTRUCTION OF VERBATIM RECORDING OF CLOSED 
SESSION DATED APRIL 26, 2016 (WRITTEN MINUTES OF THE 
NAMED MEETING WERE APPROVED BY THE BOARD ON MAY 
24, 2016) 

 
DATE:   October 26, 2017 
 
RESOURCE: Stephen Nacco 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: In accordance with the Open Meetings Act, as amended by Public Act 93-

523, a verbatim record has been kept of all meetings of the Board of 
Trustees of Community College District 507 that are closed to the public.  
The verbatim record is in the form of an audio recording.  The audio tape 
recordings of closed sessions are not subject to Board approval, nor are 
they open for public inspection or subject to discovery in any proceeding 
other than a court action to enforce the Open Meetings Act.  Tapes may be 
destroyed when at least 18 months have passed since the date of the 
meeting; the Board of Trustees has approved the written minutes of the 
closed meeting, regardless of whether the minutes have been released for 
public review; and there is no lawsuit pending regarding the legality of the 
closed sessions. 

 
 At least eighteen months have passed since the following meeting was 

held:  April 26, 2016.  Written minutes of the Closed Session were 
approved by the Board on May 24, 2016.    

 
  
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider authorizing the destruction of the 

verbatim recording of the Closed Session dated April 26, 2016. 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12 

 
 
 
 

  
 

Unfinished Business 
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New Business 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 BOARD AGENDA ITEM 13A 
 
 
 
 
 

  
Board Consideration of Acceptance of FY2017  

College Comprehensive Annual Financial  
Audit Report (External Exhibit) 

 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



Agenda Item:   13A 
 
Agenda Title: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF ACCEPTANCE OF FY2017 

COLLEGE COMPREHENSIVE ANNUAL FINANCIAL AUDIT 
REPORT (EXTERNAL EXHIBIT) 

 
Meeting Date: October 26, 2017 
 
Resource:  Tammy Clark-Betancourt 
 
Submitted for:  Action 
 
Summary:  The Board of Trustees Audit Committee (Mr. Black, Mr. Harby, 

and Dr. Serfoss) met on October 16, 2017 with the Auditors, Mike 
Hillary, Whitney Yoder, and Sandy Cook, of CliftonLarsonAllen, 
LLP.  The purpose of this meeting was to review and discuss the 
audited Comprehensive Annual Financial Report for the fiscal year 
ended June 30, 2017.  Also in attendance from the DACC Staff 
were Dr. Nacco, Debbie Knight, Tammy Clark-Betancourt, Dave 
Kietzmann, and Kerri Thurman. 

 
  The Committee will report to the Board regarding the Audit 

Committee meeting.    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Recommendation: May we ask the Board to consider accepting the Fiscal Year 2017 

Comprehensive Annual Financial Audit Report.   
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AGENDA ITEM: 13B 
 
AGENDA TITLE:      Board Consideration of Resolution Abating Taxes Heretofore Levied 
 for the Year 2017 to Pay Debt Service on General Obligation 
 Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community 
 College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois,  
 Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois 
                                      
DATE:                         October 26, 2017 
 
RESOURCE:               Tammy Clark-Betancourt 
 
SUBMITTED FOR:    Action 
 
SUMMARY:               The College issued $2,995,000 of General Obligation Bonds on 

September 24, 2013, which included a tax levy sufficient to pay the 
principal of and interest on the Bonds based on the maturity schedule.  
However, the Bond and Interest Fund will have funds available to meet 
the debt service, which will allow the College to abate the applicable 
2017 tax levy.  The funds are comprised of $100,000 to be received from 
the Foundation as a result of the donation from Mr. Julius W. Hegeler II 
and $27,287.50 of unspent 2013A bond proceeds.  Bond counsel has 
advised that the available funds from the unspent 2013A bond proceeds 
may be used to meet the debt service requirements of this bond issue.  
The amount of the levy to be abated is $127,287.50. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION May we ask the Board to consider approval of the Resolution 
REQUESTED: abating taxes heretofore levied for the year 2017 to pay debt service 
 on General Obligation Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of 
 Community College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, 
 Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois.   
 
 



Abatement Resolution 2017 
2210615 AV 10/23/2017 

MINUTES of a regular public meeting of the Board of Trustees of 
Community College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, 
Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois, held at Danville 
Area Community College, Hoopeston Higher Learning Center, Room 
101, 847 East Orange Street, Hoopeston, Illinois, in said Community 
College District at 5:30 o’clock P.M., on the 26th day of October, 
2017. 

 * * * 

The meeting was called to order by the Chairperson, and upon the roll being called, 

________________, the Chairperson, and the following Trustees were physically present at said 

location:  ______________________________________________________________________ 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

and __________________ (non-voting student trustee). 

The following Trustees were allowed by a majority of the Trustees in accordance with 

and to the extent allowed by rules adopted by the Board of Trustees to attend the meeting by 

video or audio conference: ________________________________________________________ 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

No Trustee was not permitted to attend the meeting by video or audio conference. 

The following Trustees were absent and did not participate in the meeting in any manner 

or to any extent whatsoever: _______________________________________________________ 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

The Chairperson announced that the next item of business before the Board of Trustees 

was the consideration of a resolution abating a portion of the taxes heretofore levied for the year 

2016 to pay debt service on the General Obligation Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of 

the District. 
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Whereupon Trustee _____________________ presented and the Secretary read by title a 

resolution as follows, a copy of which was provided to each Trustee prior to said meeting and to 

everyone in attendance at said meeting who requested a copy: 



 

RESOLUTION abating taxes heretofore levied for the year 2017 to 
pay debt service on General Obligation Community College 
Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 507, 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and 
State of Illinois. 

 * * * 

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees (the “Board”) of Community College District No. 507, 

Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois (the 

“District”), by resolution adopted on the 24th day of September, 2013 (the “Resolution”), did 

provide for the issue of $2,995,000 General Obligation Community College Bonds, Series 

2013A (the “Bonds”), and the levy of a direct annual tax sufficient to pay the principal of and 

interest on the Bonds; and 

WHEREAS, a duly certified copy of the Resolution was filed in the offices of the County 

Clerks of Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford, Illinois (the “County 

Clerks”); and 

WHEREAS, the Board has determined and does hereby determine that the District has 

available funds in the amount of $127,287.50 (the “Excess Funds”) in the District’s Bond and 

Interest Fund of 2013 (the “Bond Fund”) established pursuant to Section 9 of the Resolution for 

the purpose of paying the debt service on the Bonds; and 

WHEREAS, the Board has determined and does hereby determine that it is necessary and 

in the best interests of the District to correspondingly abate taxes heretofore levied to pay the 

principal of and interest on the Bonds: 

NOW, THEREFORE, Be It and It is Hereby Resolved by the Board of Trustees of 

Community College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and 

Ford and State of Illinois, as follows: 
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 Section 1. Incorporation of Preambles.  The Board hereby finds that all of the recitals 

contained in the preambles to this Resolution are full, true and correct and does incorporate them 

into this Resolution by this reference.  

 Section 2. Abatement of Tax.  A portion of the tax heretofore levied for the year 2017 

to pay the Bonds under the terms of the Resolution shall be abated by the amount of the Excess 

Funds, and the amount of the tax currently on file for the year 2017 to pay the principal of and 

interest on the Bonds, the amount of said tax to be abated for said year, and the remainder of the 

tax levied which is to be extended for said year to pay the principal of and interest on the Bonds 

are as follows: 

FOR THE 2013A BONDS 

 
LEVY 
YEAR 

 
AMOUNT 

CURRENTLY 
ON FILE 

 
AMOUNT TO 
BE ABATED 

REMAINDER OF TAX 

TO BE EXTENDED 

SUFFICIENT 

TO PRODUCE 

2017 $127,287.50 $127,287.50 $0.00 

 

 Section 3. Filing of Resolution.  Forthwith upon the adoption of this resolution, the 

Secretary of the Board shall file a certified copy hereof with the County Clerks, and it shall be 

the duty of the County Clerks to abate a portion of said tax levied for the year 2017 in 

accordance with the provisions hereof. 

 Section 4. Severability.  If any section, paragraph, clause or provision of this 

Resolution shall be held to be invalid or unenforceable for any reason, the invalidity or 

unenforceability of such section, paragraph, clause or provision shall not affect any of the 

remaining provisions of this Resolution. 
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 Section 5. Repeal.  All resolutions or parts thereof in conflict herewith be and the same 

are hereby repealed, and this Resolution shall be in full force and effect forthwith upon its 

adoption. 

Adopted October 26, 2017. 

_______________________________________ 
Chairperson, Board of Trustees 

_______________________________________ 
Secretary, Board of Trustees 

 



 

Trustee ________________________ moved and Trustee ________________________ 

seconded the motion that said resolution as presented and read by title be adopted. 

After a full discussion thereof, the Chairperson directed that the roll be called for a vote 

upon the motion to adopt said resolution. 

Upon the roll being called, the following Trustees voted AYE:   _____________________ 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

The following Trustees voted NAY:   __________________________________________ 

Whereupon the Chairperson declared the motion carried and said resolution adopted, 

approved and signed the same in open meeting and directed the Secretary to record the same in 

the records of the Board of Trustees of Community College District No. 507, Counties of 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois, which was done. 

Other business not pertinent to the adoption of said resolution was duly transacted at the 

meeting. 

Upon motion duly made, seconded and carried, the meeting was adjourned. 

_______________________________________ 
Secretary, Board of Trustees 

 



 

STATE OF ILLINOIS ) 
 )  SS 
COUNTY OF VERMILION ) 

CERTIFICATION OF RESOLUTION AND MINUTES 

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am the duly qualified and acting Secretary of 
the Board of Trustees (the “Board”) of Community College District No. 507, Counties of 
Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois (the “District”), and as 
such official I am the keeper of the records and files of the District and the Board. 

I do further certify that the foregoing constitutes a full, true and complete transcript of the 
minutes of the meeting of the Board held on the 26th day of October, 2017, insofar as same 
relates to the adoption of a resolution entitled: 

RESOLUTION abating taxes heretofore levied for the year 2017 to 
pay debt service on General Obligation Community College 
Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 507, 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and 
State of Illinois. 

a true, correct and complete copy of which said resolution as adopted at said meeting appears in 
the foregoing transcript of the minutes of said meeting. 

I do further certify that the deliberations of the Board on the adoption of said resolution 
were conducted openly, that the vote on the adoption of said resolution was taken openly, that 
said meeting was called and held at a specified time and place convenient to the public, that 
notice of said meeting was duly given to all of the news media requesting such notice, that an 
agenda for said meeting was posted at the location where said meeting was held and at the 
principal office of the Board at least 48 hours in advance of the holding of said meeting, that a 
true, correct and complete copy of said agenda as so posted is attached hereto as Exhibit A, that 
at least one copy of said agenda was continuously available for public review during the entire 
48-hour period preceding such meeting, that said meeting was called and held in strict 
compliance with the provisions of the Open Meetings Act of the State of Illinois, as amended, 
and with the provisions of the Public Community College Act of the State of Illinois, as 
amended, and that the Board has complied with all of the provisions of said Acts and with all of 
the procedural rules of the Board.   

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I hereunto affix my official signature, this 26th day of October, 
2017. 

_______________________________________ 
Secretary, Board of Trustees 



 

STATE OF ILLINOIS  ) 
  )  SS 
COUNTY OF VERMILION ) 

FILING CERTIFICATE 

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am the duly qualified and acting County Clerk 

of The County of Vermilion, Illinois, and as such official I do further certify that on the ___ day 

of ___________, 20__, there was filed in my office a duly certified copy of a resolution entitled: 

RESOLUTION abating taxes heretofore levied for the year 2017 to 
pay debt service on General Obligation Community College 
Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 507, 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and 
State of Illinois. 

duly adopted by the Board of Trustees of the Community College District No. 507, Counties of 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois, on the 26th day of 

October, 2017, and that the same has been deposited in the official files and records of my office. 

I do further certify that a portion of the tax heretofore levied for the year 2017 for the 

payment of the General Obligation Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of said 

Community College District as described in said resolution will be abated as provided in said 

resolution. 

IN WITNESS WHERETO, I hereunto affix my official signature and the seal of said County, 

this ____ day of _____________, 20___. 

_______________________________________ 
County Clerk 

 
(SEAL) 



 

STATE OF ILLINOIS ) 
 )  SS 
COUNTY OF EDGAR ) 

FILING CERTIFICATE 

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am the duly qualified and acting County Clerk 

of The County of Edgar, Illinois, and as such official I do further certify that on the ____ day of 

____________, 20___, there was filed in my office a duly certified copy of a resolution entitled: 

RESOLUTION abating taxes heretofore levied for the year 2017 to 
pay debt service on General Obligation Community College 
Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 507, 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and 
State of Illinois. 

duly adopted by the Board of Trustees of the Community College District No. 507, Counties of 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois, on the 26th day of 

October, 2017, and that the same has been deposited in the official files and records of my office. 

I do further certify that a portion of the tax heretofore levied for the year 2017 for the 

payment of the General Obligation Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of said 

Community College District as described in said resolution will be abated as provided in said 

resolution. 

IN WITNESS WHERETO, I hereunto affix my official signature and the seal of said County, 

this ____ day of ____________, 20___. 

_______________________________________ 
County Clerk 

(SEAL)



 

 
STATE OF ILLINOIS ) 
 )  SS 
COUNTY OF IROQUOIS ) 

FILING CERTIFICATE 

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am the duly qualified and acting County Clerk 

of The County of Iroquois, Illinois, and as such official I do further certify that on the ____ day 

of __________, 20___, there was filed in my office a duly certified copy of a resolution entitled: 

RESOLUTION abating taxes heretofore levied for the year 2017 to 
pay debt service on General Obligation Community College 
Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 507, 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and 
State of Illinois. 

duly adopted by the Board of Trustees of the Community College District No. 507, Counties of 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois, on the 26th day of 

October, 2017, and that the same has been deposited in the official files and records of my office. 

I do further certify that a portion of the tax heretofore levied for the year 2017 for the 

payment of the General Obligation Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of said 

Community College District as described in said resolution will be abated as provided in said 

resolution. 

IN WITNESS WHERETO, I hereunto affix my official signature and the seal of said County, 

this ____ day of ____________, 20___. 

_______________________________________ 
County Clerk 

(SEAL)



 

 
STATE OF ILLINOIS ) 
 )  SS 
COUNTY OF CHAMPAIGN ) 

FILING CERTIFICATE 

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am the duly qualified and acting County Clerk 

of The County of Champaign, Illinois, and as such official I do further certify that on the 

____ day of _____________, 20___, there was filed in my office a duly certified copy of a 

resolution entitled: 

RESOLUTION abating taxes heretofore levied for the year 2017 to 
pay debt service on General Obligation Community College 
Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 507, 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and 
State of Illinois. 

duly adopted by the Board of Trustees of the Community College District No. 507, Counties of 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois, on the 26th day of 

October, 2017, and that the same has been deposited in the official files and records of my office. 

I do further certify that a portion of the tax heretofore levied for the year 2017 for the 

payment of the General Obligation Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of said 

Community College District as described in said resolution will be abated as provided in said 

resolution. 

IN WITNESS WHERETO, I hereunto affix my official signature and the seal of said County, 

this ____ day of ____________, 20___. 
_______________________________________ 

County Clerk 
(SEAL) 
 



 

STATE OF ILLINOIS ) 
 )  SS 
COUNTY OF FORD ) 

FILING CERTIFICATE 

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am the duly qualified and acting County Clerk 

of The County of Ford, Illinois, and as such official I do further certify that on the ____ day of 

____________, 20___, there was filed in my office a duly certified copy of a resolution entitled: 

RESOLUTION abating taxes heretofore levied for the year 2017 to 
pay debt service on General Obligation Community College 
Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 507, 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and 
State of Illinois. 

duly adopted by the Board of Trustees of the Community College District No. 507, Counties of 

Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois, on the 26th day of 

October, 2017, and that the same has been deposited in the official files and records of my office. 

I do further certify that a portion of the tax heretofore levied for the year 2017 for the 

payment of the General Obligation Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of said 

Community College District as described in said resolution will be abated as provided in said 

resolution. 

IN WITNESS WHERETO, I hereunto affix my official signature and the seal of said County, 

this ____ day of ____________, 20___. 

_______________________________________ 
County Clerk 

(SEAL) 
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AGENDA ITEM: 13C 
 
AGENDA TITLE:      Board Consideration to Accept the Annual Post-Issuance Tax 
 Compliance Report for Danville Area Community College District 
 No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and  
 Ford and the State of Illinois. 
  
DATE:                        October 26, 2017 
 
RESOURCE:              Tammy Clark-Betancourt 
 
SUBMITTED FOR:   Action 
 
SUMMARY:              When the District issued Tax Advantaged Obligations (e.g. Tax- 

Exempt Bonds and/or Debt Certificates), the District covenanted 
generally to take all action necessary to comply with the applicable 
federal tax rules and regulations relating to those obligations, including 
covenants necessary to preserve the excludability of interest in those 
obligations from gross income for federal income taxation purposes. 

 
 A Bond Record-Keeping Policy was adopted by the Board of Trustees 

on December 14, 2010 and amended on September 23, 2014 as part of 
the resolution process for the issuance of certain Tax Advantaged 
Obligations.  This Bond-Record Keeping Policy designated the 
Treasurer as the Compliance Officer for Tax Advantaged Obligations 
compliance purposes.  Our bond counsel, Chapman and Cutler, LLP 
has recommended that the Compliance Officer prepare and submit an 
Annual Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report to ensure that the 
Board of Trustees is aware of the District’s compliance with Tax 
Advantaged Obligation covenants. 
 
Attached is the Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report which sets forth  
a summary demonstrating the District’s compliance with applicable 
covenants and expectations.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION May we ask the Board to accept the annual Post-Issuance 
REQUESTED: Tax Compliance Report for Danville Area Community 
 College District No. 507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar 
 Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and the State of Illinois. 
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AGENDA ITEM:  13D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR COMPUTER EQUIPMENT 
 
DATE:   October 26, 2017 
 
RESOURCE:  Mark Barnes, Dave Kietzmann, Mike Cunningham  
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the News Gazette (including the internet) for computer 

equipment approved on the FY18 Capital Equipment list.  Bids were requested 
for 75 Lenovo ThinkCentre M910 tower computers, 39 Lenovo ThinkVision 
LT1913P Monitors, and 100 Lenovo ThinkCentre M910 small form factor 
computers.  Bid packets were sent to the following suppliers and opened at 
11:00 AM on October 10, 2017 with the following results: 

 
$ 164,994.11  Strictly Technology, Fort Fauderdale, FL 

 $ 165,034.59  Connection, Merrimack, NH 
$ 166,181.00  DHE Computer Systems, Centennial, CO 
$ 168,434.73  Insight Public Sector, Tempe, AZ 
$ 169,943.00  Next Level Technology, Sioux Falls, SD 
$ 171,971.00  Arnolds, Danville, IL 
$ 172,193.06  CDW-G, Vernon Hills, IL 
$ 175,030.49  Frontier Technology, Tempe, AZ 
$ 176,284.25  IT Outlet, Sioux Falls, SD 
NO BID  MNB IT Services, Irving, TX 
NO BID  Direct Technology Group, Fort Lauderdale, FL 
NO BID  Alliance Technology Group, Chicago, IL 
NO BID  9 to 5 Computers, Jacksonville, FL 
NO BID  Ace Computers, Elk Grove, IL  
NO BID  Byte Speed, Moorhead, MN 
NO BID  HPI Technology Distributer, Lakewood, NJ 
NO BID  Microage, Glenview, IL 
NO BID  Pace Systems, Naperville, IL 
NO BID  Southern Computer Warehouse, Marietta, GA 

   
  

This equipment was approved on the FY-18 Capital Equipment List and 
funding will be through Technology/Equipment Bonds. 

 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from Strictly Technology in the 

amount of $164,994.11 to purchase Computer Equipment.   
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AGENDA ITEM: 13E 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF COLLEGE HEALTH INSURANCE 
 
MEETING DATE: October 26, 2017 
 
RESOURCE: Tammy Clark-Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Dr. Nacco, Insurance Committee 
     
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: As health insurance costs continue to rise, the College continues to 

experience increased costs in providing comprehensive, affordable health 
insurance for our employees and their families.  The health insurance 
industry continues to become more and more complex each year and the 
contributing factors to the increase in costs continue to expand and grow. 

 
 The College has been with CCIC (Community College Self-Insured 

Cooperative) for 15 years and membership has declined to only five (5) 
remaining members, DACC, Richland, Shawnee, Spoon River and the 
Illinois Community College Trustees Association (ICCTA).  DACC is 
now the largest member in CCIC.  Unfortunately, the College experienced 
a significant increase in premiums the last two years--on average 16% for 
calendar year 2016 and 28% for calendar year 2017.  These increases are 
the result of a combination of the College’s claims experience, current 
network utilization and the decrease in CCIC membership. 

  
 As a result of these large increases in premiums the last two years, 

combined with the complexities of the health insurance industry, the 
Board approved in February to enter into an agreement with ONI Risk 
Partners to provide consulting services to assist in evaluating all of the 
options available to the College to ensure we are providing health 
insurance for our employees that is financially sustainable to the College. 

 
 ONI obtained proposals for our health insurance coverage for calendar 

year 2018.  They received rates from both Health Alliance and Blue 
Cross/Blue Shield for fully insured plans and from Health Alliance for a 
self-insured plan.  The Insurance Committee reviewed these proposals, 
along with the renewal rates received from CCIC.   

 
A summary of the average rate percentage change from our 2017 rates is 
as follows: 

CCIC – 8.5% increase 
Health Alliance Fully-Insured – 23% decrease 
Blue Cross/Blue Shield Fully-Insured – 8.8% decrease 
Health Alliance Self-Insured – 4% increase 

 
 
 
 



 
The Health Alliance Fully-Insured plan would result in an overall savings 
to the College of over $600,000 from our current 2017 rates and over 
$830,000 from the 2018 CCIC renewal rates. 
 
ONI Risk Partners’ recommendation, based on all relevant data, plan 
design, facility and provider utilization by employees, etc. is to move from 
CCIC to the Health Alliance Fully-Insured plan.  The Insurance 
Committee by majority vote agreed with this recommendation. 

  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve Health Alliance as the College’s health 
insurance provider effective January 1, 2018. 
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