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Regular Meeting 
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Mission Statement  

 
Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 

quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences which 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 
          

  
 
        
 
 
         



 
 
 
  
  

Danville Area Community College will continue to be an active partner in building and maintaining 
academic excellence and economic vitality in the diverse communities it serves. This will be 
accomplished by: 

 
 Creating a learning culture where assessment of student academic achievement is valued and 

used across the institution, departments, and programs to improve learning; 
 Providing a friendly and dynamic environment in which to learn and grow; 
 Embracing the ever-changing world of technology; 
 Offering an affordable and convenient education for learners; 
 Promoting a global perspective of education; 
 Reflecting diversity and inclusiveness in our students, faculty, and staff; 
 Cultivating partnerships with the community to develop innovative and vital solutions to meet 

changing academic and economic needs; 
 Challenging students to explore their full potential through rigorous academics, diverse campus 

organizations, and innovative career experiences; and 
 Enhancing opportunities for student success through comprehensive services. 

 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, employees, 
community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 

Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 

Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual growth of those we 
serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing world.   
 

Vision Statement 



 

BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
Community College District No. 507 

Regular Meeting and Organizational Meeting 
DACC Board Room, Vermilion Hall 302 

Tuesday, April 25, 2017 
7:00 p.m. 

 

 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order 

2. Pledge of Allegiance 

3. Roll Call 

4. Adoption of Agenda 

5. Recognition of Visitors 

6. Recognition of Phi Theta Kappa 2017 All-Illinois Academic Team 

7. Recognition of DACC Athletic Director/Baseball Coach 

8. Report from DACC Players “Funny Girl” 

9. President’s Report 

10. Public Comment 

 

12.    Unfinished Business 

13.  Seating of Student Trustee 

 A.    Acceptance of Student Trustee Election Report 

 B.    Administration of Oath of Office 

14. Board Consideration of Documents of April 4, 2017 Consolidated Election for     

Community College District No. 507 Trustees 

 A.    Adoption of Resolution Declaring Results of Election 

 B.    Approval of Abstract of Votes 

15. Oath of Office Administered to Newly Elected Members 

16. Adjournment of Board Sine Die 

17. Roll Call – Reorganized Board 

 

 

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 
enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should 
so request before approval of the agenda. 
 

11. Consent Agenda  

A. Board Consideration of the Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting of                   

March 28, 2017 

B. Financial Report 

C. Human Resources Report 
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18. Appointment of Temporary Chairperson 

19. Appointment of Temporary Secretary 

20. Election of Officers and Appointments 

 A.    Election of Chair 

 B.    Election of Vice Chair 

 C.    Election of Secretary 

 D.    Appointment of ICCTA Representative 

 E.    Appointment of ICCTA Alternate Representative 

 F.    Appointment of Board Attorneys 

 G.    Appointment of College Treasurer 

21. Board Consideration of Setting Date, Time, and Place of Meetings 

22. Board Consideration of Adopting All Existing Policies 

23. New Business 

 A.    Board Consideration of Approval of Travel Expenditures for Trustees 

 B.    Board Consideration to Lease Two (2) 15-Passenger Minibuses 

 C.    Board Consideration of Vermilion County Honors 

 D.    Board Consideration of 2018 Strategic Plan Matrix 

 E.    Board Consideration of DACC Honorary Degrees  

24. Information 

 A. Communications 

   

  APRIL 2017 

  26 ICCTA Lobby Day, Springfield 

  27 DACC/College Express Exhibition 

  28 Ornamental Horticulture Plant Sale 

  28 Employee Recognition Reception, 2:00 p.m., Bremer 

   MAY 2017 

          3 TRIO Graduation and Recognition Ceremony, 4:00 p.m., Vermilion Hall 306 

          12-18 Final Exams 

  18 Nurse Pinning Ceremony, 3:00 p.m., Mary Miller 

  19 Commencement, 7:00 p.m., Mary Miller Gym 

  20 GED Graduation, 11:00 a.m., Bremer 

  22 Early Summer Classes Begin 

  26 Nursing Application Deadline for Fall Admission - Noon 

  23 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 7:00 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

  29 Memorial Day Holiday – College Closed 
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  JUNE 2017 

            2-3 ICCTA Annual Convention, Normal 

    9 DACC Foundation Donor Recognition, Danville Country Club, 6:00 p.m. 

  12 Regular Summer Classes Begin 

   JULY 2017 

    4 Independence Day Holiday – College Closed 

    7 DACC Golf Tournament, Turtle Run 

  AUGUST 2017 

         16-18 Staff In-Service Days 

  21 Fall Classes Begin 

25. Adjournment 
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Recognition of Phi Theta Kappa 2017  

All-Illinois Academic Team 
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Recognition of DACC Athletic Director/Baseball Coach 
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Report from DACC Players “Funny Girl” 
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President’s Report 
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Public Comment 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 11A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of the Minutes of the  
Regular Board Meeting of March 28, 2017 



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING of March 28, 2017 
On March 28, 2017, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall, Room 302 at Danville Area 
Community College.   
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Dave Harby called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
Ms. Avoree Switzer, Presidential Scholar, led the Board and those in attendance in reciting 
the Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag.     
 
ITEM 3: ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present:  Bill Black, Dick Cheney, Dave Harby, Tonya Hill, 
Dr. Ron Serfoss, John Spezia, Greg Wolfe, and Student Trustee Logan Haun.       
 
Others present:  President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave 
Kietzmann, Tammy Clark-Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Mike Cunningham, Lara Conklin, 
Stacy Ehmen, Jerry Davis, Terry Hill, Bruce Rape, Lisa Osborne, Todd Flessner, Stan 
Oglesby, Jeff Wise, Jesse Schmit, Andrew Delp, Warren Holden, Eurekia Glover, Michael 
Fogle, Cindy Nacco, Patricia Cheney, and Avoree Switzer.                                                                               
 
Media present:  Nicole Miller, WDAN/WDNL; Noelle McGee, News-Gazette; Carol 
Roehm, Commercial-News; and Neal Boyd, DACC Innovator.    
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Harby noted there were no changes requested to the agenda.  Upon motion by Mr. 
Cheney, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, the agenda was adopted.  The motion passed by 
unanimous voice vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
Dr. Nacco introduced the following members of the Administrative Council:  Dave 
Kietzmann, Vice President of Instruction and Student Services; Tammy Clark-Betancourt, 
Chief Financial Officer; Mike Cunningham, Director, Administrative Services; Jill 
Cranmore, Director, Human Resources; Lara Conklin, Director, Marketing and College 
Relations; and Stacy Ehmen, Dean, Student Services.  Also present:  Jerry Davis, Davis and 
Delanois; Terry Hill; Bruce Rape, Dean, Business and Technology; Lisa Osborne, 
Administrative Assistant, Business and Technology; Todd Flessner, Instructor, 
Manufacturing Engineering Technology; Stan Oglesby, Instructor, Biology; Jeff Wise, 
Instructor, Information Systems; Technology Club Students:  Jesse Schmit, Andrew Delp, 
Warren Holden, Eurekia Glover, and Michael Fogle; Cindy Nacco; Patricia Cheney; and 
Avoree Switzer, Presidential Scholar.                                           
 
Media present:  Nicole Miller, WDAN/WDNL; Noelle McGee, News-Gazette; Carol 
Roehm, Commercial-News; and Neal Boyd, DACC Innovator.   
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ITEM 6: RECOGNITION OF TRUSTEES   
The Board and Dr. Nacco recognized Mr. Logan Haun as this will be his last regular Board 
meeting as Student Trustee.  The Board commended Mr. Haun for his willingness to speak 
up and give a student’s perspective on issues.  They wished him well in his future 
endeavors.  Mr. Harby and Dr. Nacco presented Mr. Haun with a small token of 
appreciation. 
 
Mr. Haun expressed appreciation to the Board and Dr. Nacco for the experience he has 
gained while serving as a student representative.     
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco also recognized Mr. Cheney as this will be his last meeting as a 
Board member.  They each expressed appreciation for his 23 ½ years of service on the 
Board and for his calm perspective as a Board member.  An appreciation gift was presented 
to Mr. Cheney.   
 
Mr. Cheney thanked the Trustees as well.  He noted that he has a 56 year history with the 
college as a student, faculty, administrator, and trustee.   
 
ITEM 7: REPORT FROM TECHNOLOGY CLUB STUDENTS 
The Technology Club Students gave a presentation to the Board.  Mr. Jeff Wise introduced 
each of the students.  Mr. Jesse Schmit, Mr. Andrew Delp, Mr. Warren Holden, Mr. 
Eurekia Glover, and Mr. Michael Fogle shared their background as well as their 
experiences while attending DACC.   
 
Dr. Nacco and the Board expressed appreciation to Mr. Wise for attending the meeting and 
to the students for choosing DACC. 
 
ITEM 8: REPORT ON ICCTA SEMINAR AND BOARD OF  
  REPRESENTATIVES MEETING, MARCH 10, 2017 
Mr. Cheney and Mr. Harby attended the ICCTA meetings on March 10, 2017.  Each gave a 
report on the sessions attended.   
 
ITEM 9: PRESIDENT’S REPORT 
Dr. Nacco shared the DACC Flash with the Board and highlighted the article on the 
NJCAA tournament.  He expressed appreciation to all of the volunteers.     
 
ITEM 10: PUBLIC COMMENT 
There was no public comment.       
 
ITEM 11: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE 
REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF FEBRUARY 28, 2017 

B. FINANCIAL REPORT 
C. HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 
D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY REVISIONS 
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1. BOARD POLICY #4001 – ADDITIONAL EDUCATION 
2. BOARD POLICY #5002 – COMMUNITY USE OF COLLEGE 

FACILITIES 
3. BOARD POLICY #6005 – SUBMISSION OF GRANT 

PROPOSALS 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mrs. Hill, the items on the Consent Agenda 
were approved.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.    
 
ITEM 12: UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
ITEM 13: NEW BUSINESS 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION TO RESURFACE THE MARY 
MILLER COMPLEX PARKING LOT 

Bids were advertised to resurface the Mary Miller Complex parking lot.  This 56,760 square 
foot parking lot has numerous potholes, has been patched by DACC maintenance several 
times, and requires complete resurfacing.  Funding for the project will be provided by 
proceeds from Funding Bonds issued in February 2016 which were designated for facilities 
maintenance. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Spezia, and a second by Mr. Wolfe, the Board approved the bid from 
Open Road Paving in the amount of $116,792.50 to resurface the Mary Miller parking lot.  
The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.   
 

B. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF DUAL CREDIT WAIVERS 
Historically high school students who are also taking DACC credit courses would receive 
those courses tuition free.  If the course is taught at the high school with a high school 
instructor, fees are also waived.  If the course is taught with a college instructor, either at 
DACC or on-line, fees were not waived and the student was financially responsible to pay 
those fees.  This does not include the College Express or Middle College programs. 
 
The continued decrease in state funding has necessitated a review of all revenue streams, 
expenditures and waivers.  The College simply can no longer afford to waive this tuition 
while incurring expenditures (instructor salary, benefits, facilities costs, etc.)  In addition, it 
is inequitable to other full paying students and ultimately in order to cover the costs of 
instruction, regular tuition is increased in order to subsidize the dual credit students who 
have been receiving the courses tuition free. 
 
As a result, students who are enrolled in a dual credit course taught either at DACC or on-
line (excluding College Express and Middle College) will be charged 50% of the combined 
per-credit tuition and per-credit technology & activity fee.  Students who are eligible for 
free-and-reduced lunch will be charged 25% of this combined rate. 
 
Students would continue to be financially responsible for any special course fees and course 
materials. 
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Upon motion by Mr. Cheney, and a second by Mr. Haun, the Board approved charging dual 
credit students taught either at DACC or on-line 50% of the current tuition rate and those 
students who are eligible for free-and-reduced lunch 25% of the current tuition rate 
(excluding College Express and Middle College).  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 
yeas, 0 nays.   
 

C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF TUITION INCREASE 
Historically during the Spring semester, DACC considers the rate of tuition and universal 
fees in making projections for the budget for the upcoming fiscal year.  Making early 
budget projections for the next fiscal year are always challenging; however, with only a 
stop-gap state appropriation for FY2017 and the on-going budget impasse at the state, 
projecting FY2018 is an even greater challenge. 
 
A tuition increase of $10 is proposed.  This increase will provide funds to allow the College 
to continue to support student success initiatives, as well as to retain our talented faculty 
and staff.  The proposed increase would raise tuition from $125 per credit hour to $135.  
The technology & activity fee is recommended to remain at the same rate of $15 per credit 
hour.  In addition, we propose increasing the out-of-district, out-of-state and international 
rate from $220 to $235 in order to maintain compliance with Illinois State Statutes. 
 
With the proposed increase in tuition for FY2018, DACC’s tuition and fee rate will likely 
continue to be slightly above the FY2018 average tuition and fee rate for all Illinois 
community colleges.  An increase of $10 will generate approximately $400,000 of revenue. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved effective with 
the summer term a $10 per credit hour tuition increase and approved increasing the out-of-
district, out-of-state, and international rate to $235 per credit hour.  The motion passed by 
roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 14: INFORMATION 

A. COMMUNICATIONS 
 Certificate of Achievement for Excellence in Financial Reporting 

from the Government Finance Officers Association.  DACC has 
achieved the certificate for the past five years thanks to Ms. Tammy 
Clark-Betancourt and the Business Office.     
 

ITEM 15: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 8:47 p.m.        
 
 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
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     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  
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FINANCIAL REPORT 
April 25, 2017 
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Human Resources Report 

April 25, 2017 
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Human Resources 
 
(Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources processes 
being met.) 
 

1.  New Employees 
 

(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Walker, Anjunette – Driver, Vermilion County Works 
Effective Date: March 27, 2017 through May 19, 2017 
Rate of Pay: $10.00 per hour 
 
Westfahl, Hannah – College for Kids Instructor, Community Education 
Effective Date: July 10, 2017 through July 14, 2017 
Rate of Pay: $20.00 per hour 

 
 
      2.  Student Workers and Work Study Students 
 

(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Robinson, Esther – Student Employee, Business & Technology 
Effective Date: March 27, 2017 through June 30, 2017 
Rate of Pay: $8.25 per hour 

 
      3.  Promotion 
  
 Rush, Jeffrey – Coordinator, Instructional Media 
 Effective Date: May 1, 2017 through June 30, 2017 
 Rate of Pay:  $44,912.82 annually 
 
      4.  Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Spring Semester 2017 
 
      5. Authorization for Employment 
 
         



 
 

AUTHORIZATION FOR EMPLOYMENT  
April 25, 2017 

Name Position 
Beginning 

Date 
Ending 

Date 

Scheduled 
No. of Hours 

* 
Wage 

Green, Fran TRIO -
Professional 
Tutor 

3/23/17 06/30/17 4 $17.81/hr. 
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Unfinished Business 
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Seating of Student Trustee 

1. Acceptance of Student Trustee Election Report 

2. Administration of Oath of Office 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 
 

Report of Student Trustee Election 
 

April 11 and 12, 2017 
 

 
 
 
 
 
   
                       Total 
 Candidates            Votes Received 
 
 
 Sadie Edwards       24 
 
 Write ins                  0   

 
 
 
 
 
       Submitted by 
 
       Kerri Thurman 
                                                               Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 

for a one-year term of office 
April 15, 2017 to April 14, 2018 

24  Total Votes Cast



 
 

OATH OF OFFICE 
 
 
 
STATE OF ILLINOIS  } 
    } SS 
County of Vermilion } 
 
 
 

I,        Sadie Edwards         , having been duly elected to the Office of Student Member 

of the Board of Trustees of Community College District No. 507 (Danville Area 

Community College), Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford Counties, State 

of Illinois, aforesaid, do solemnly swear, that I will support the Constitution of the United 

States of America and the Constitution of the State of Illinois, and that I will faithfully 

discharge the duties of the Office of Student Member of the Board of Trustees 

according to the best of my ability. 
 
 
 
 

         _________________________________________ 
                      Signature 
 
Attest: 
 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
  Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
Dated: _____________________________ 
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Board Consideration of Documents of April 4, 2017 Consolidated 

Election for Community College District No. 507 Trustees 

 

1. Adoption of Resolution Declaring Results of Election 

2. Approval of Abstract of Votes 

 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



RESOLUTION DECLARING RESULTS OF ELECTION 
HELD ON APRIL 4, 2017 AND PROCLAIMING THE WINNERS 

 
 WHEREAS, on the 4th day of April, 2017 an election was held in Community College District 
No. 507 for purposes of electing three (3) members to the Board of Trustees of Community College 
District No. 507 for full terms of six (6) years each; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Election Authorities did transmit original Certificates of Results for each 
precinct to the Secretary of the Community College District No. 507, in accordance with statutes made 
and provided; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Secretary did transmit the Precinct Certificates of Results to the presiding 
officer of the Community College District No. 507, in accordance with statutes made and provided:  
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of Trustees of Community College 
District No. 507, Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford Counties, Illinois, that the results 
of said election be and are hereby declared as follows: 
 

Name of Candidate Votes Received 
David W. Harby 

Terry Hill 
John Spezia 

5,755 
5,756 
6,219 

  
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this Board of Trustees does hereby proclaim the winners to 
be: 

David W. Harby 
Terry Hill 

John Spezia 
  
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Secretary of this Board be and is hereby instructed to 
maintain on file copies of this resolution, together with all other documents reflecting the 
canvass/abstract of votes, as provided by law. 
 
 This resolution is duly passed on this 25th day of April, 2017 by _____ Ayes and _____ Nays. 
 
    BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
    COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT NO. 507 
    Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and  
    Ford Counties, Illinois 
             
    By______________________________________   
       Its Chair 
 
ATTEST: 
 
__________________________________ 
              Secretary       



 
 
 
 
 
 
State of Illinois  ) 
    )SS 
County of Vermilion ) 
 
 

CERTIFICATION OF RESULTS 
 
 

 I, Cathy Jenkins, Election Authority of Vermilion County, do hereby certify that the 
attached is a true and correct tabulation of the votes cast including Write-Ins, Provisional, 
Grace Period, and Vote by Mail Ballots post-marked by midnight April 4, 2017 at the 
Consolidated General Election held on the 4th day of April, A.D. 2017, for the persons and 
propositions herein set forth. 
 
 

       
     __________________________________________ 

                        Vermilion County Clerk and Election Authority 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  
                             April 18,2017  
              DATE 

 



 Statement of Votes Cast
 Vermilion County, IL
 Consolidated Election

 April 4, 2017
 SOVC For Jurisdiction Wide, All Counters, All Races

 OFFICIAL RESULTS

 Date:04/18/17
 Time:12:53:05

 Page:156 of 164

 Jurisdiction Wide
     BLOUNT 1
     BLOUNT 2
     BUTLER 1
     CARROLL 1
     CATLIN 1
     CATLIN 2
     CATLIN 3
     DANVILLE 1
     DANVILLE 2
     DANVILLE 3
     DANVILLE 4
     DANVILLE 5
     DANVILLE 6
     DANVILLE 7
     DANVILLE 8
     DANVILLE 9
     DANVILLE 10
     DANVILLE 11
     DANVILLE 13
     DANVILLE 14
     ELWOOD 1
     ELWOOD 2
     GEORGETOWN 1
     GEORGETOWN 2
     GEORGETOWN 3
     GEORGETOWN 4
     GEORGETOWN 5
     GEORGETOWN 6
     GEORGETOWN 7
     GEORGETOWN 8
     GRANT 1
     GRANT 2
     GRANT 3
     GRANT 4
     GRANT 5
     GRANT 6
     JAMAICA 1
     LOVE 1
     MCKENDREE 1
     MIDDLEFORK 1
     MIDDLEFORK 2
     NEWELL 1
     NEWELL 2
     NEWELL 3
     NEWELL 4
     OAKWOOD 1
     OAKWOOD 2
     OAKWOOD 3
     OAKWOOD 5
     PILOT 1
     ROSS 1
     ROSS 2
     SIDELL 1
     SOUTH ROSS 1
     VANCE 1
     Total

 Reg. Voters  Times 
 Counted

 Total Votes  DAVID W. HARBY  TERRY HILL  JOHN SPEZIA

 DACC 507 TRUSTEES

 797  77 177 60 33.90% 58 32.77% 59 33.33%
 786  117 246 81 32.93% 77 31.30% 88 35.77%
 515  176 347 116 33.43% 117 33.72% 114 32.85%
 324  61 137 46 33.58% 45 32.85% 46 33.58%
 805  134 290 110 37.93% 88 30.34% 92 31.72%
 735  118 251 93 37.05% 77 30.68% 81 32.27%
 754  105 228 93 40.79% 66 28.95% 69 30.26%
 584  19 36 12 33.33% 12 33.33% 12 33.33%
 499  41 75 22 29.33% 24 32.00% 29 38.67%
 519  91 178 53 29.78% 57 32.02% 68 38.20%
 438  24 47 15 31.91% 17 36.17% 15 31.91%
 395  36 93 28 30.11% 29 31.18% 36 38.71%
 611  58 111 38 34.23% 38 34.23% 35 31.53%
 620  39 68 21 30.88% 21 30.88% 26 38.24%
 578  32 66 22 33.33% 21 31.82% 23 34.85%
 541  44 95 31 32.63% 31 32.63% 33 34.74%
 397  26 54 18 33.33% 16 29.63% 20 37.04%
 361  23 43 14 32.56% 13 30.23% 16 37.21%
 357  40 73 26 35.62% 23 31.51% 24 32.88%
 458  16 25 7 28.00% 9 36.00% 9 36.00%
 534  62 145 48 33.10% 46 31.72% 51 35.17%
 393  46 123 41 33.33% 40 32.52% 42 34.15%
 714  233 452 141 31.19% 144 31.86% 167 36.95%
 644  204 401 129 32.17% 122 30.42% 150 37.41%
 642  173 346 112 32.37% 112 32.37% 122 35.26%
 378  84 166 57 34.34% 55 33.13% 54 32.53%
 700  223 382 114 29.84% 118 30.89% 150 39.27%
 595  196 356 112 31.46% 98 27.53% 146 41.01%
 638  216 410 127 30.98% 127 30.98% 156 38.05%
 532  171 333 99 29.73% 104 31.23% 130 39.04%
 481  74 175 56 32.00% 59 33.71% 60 34.29%
 485  55 119 37 31.09% 40 33.61% 42 35.29%
 536  133 260 83 31.92% 85 32.69% 92 35.38%
 471  98 209 67 32.06% 70 33.49% 72 34.45%
 678  119 249 82 32.93% 82 32.93% 85 34.14%
 633  167 360 117 32.50% 119 33.06% 124 34.44%
 132  41 85 32 37.65% 25 29.41% 28 32.94%
 161  67 139 44 31.65% 44 31.65% 51 36.69%
 541  187 374 118 31.55% 122 32.62% 134 35.83%
 661  105 223 73 32.74% 71 31.84% 79 35.43%
 266  33 65 23 35.38% 19 29.23% 23 35.38%
 645  111 270 82 30.37% 88 32.59% 100 37.04%
 875  248 582 188 32.30% 187 32.13% 207 35.57%
 915  117 281 88 31.32% 97 34.52% 96 34.16%
 188  18 40 12 30.00% 15 37.50% 13 32.50%
 674  143 306 101 33.01% 112 36.60% 93 30.39%
 709  151 307 106 34.53% 101 32.90% 100 32.57%
 318  90 178 63 35.39% 59 33.15% 56 31.46%
 609  134 285 92 32.28% 101 35.44% 92 32.28%
 416  65 133 52 39.10% 40 30.08% 41 30.83%
 683  289 561 170 30.30% 183 32.62% 208 37.08%
 340  144 280 86 30.71% 89 31.79% 105 37.50%
 389  227 436 154 35.32% 139 31.88% 143 32.80%
 660  224 408 131 32.11% 129 31.62% 148 36.27%
 605  116 226 82 36.28% 69 30.53% 75 33.19%

 29915  6041 12305 4025 32.71% 3950 32.10%  4330 35.19%

City of Danville             1145        1202   1279
Iroquois County          303           314      327
Champaign County           61              65       61 

        5755 total      5756 total  6219 total

Edgar County       220        224   222

Ford County           1           1     0



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 15 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Oath of Office Administered to Newly Elected Members 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



OATH OF OFFICE 
 
 
STATE OF ILLINOIS } 
    } SS 
County of Vermilion  } 
 
 
 
I, _______David W. Harby___________________, having been duly elected to the 

Office of Member of the Board of Trustees of Community College District No. 507 

(Danville Area Community College), Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford 

Counties, State of Illinois, aforesaid, do solemnly swear, that I will support the 

Constitution of the United States of America and the Constitution of the State of Illinois, 

and that I will faithfully discharge the duties of the Office of Member of the Board of 

Trustees according to the best of my ability. 

 
 
 
 
      _____________________________________ 
                                    Signature 
 
 
 
Attest: 
 
 
 
______________________________________ 
              Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
Dated: ________________________________ 



OATH OF OFFICE 
 
 
STATE OF ILLINOIS } 
    } SS 
County of Vermilion  } 
 
 
 
I, _______Terry T. Hill___________________, having been duly elected to the Office of 

Member of the Board of Trustees of Community College District No. 507 (Danville Area 

Community College), Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford Counties, State 

of Illinois, aforesaid, do solemnly swear, that I will support the Constitution of the United 

States of America and the Constitution of the State of Illinois, and that I will faithfully 

discharge the duties of the Office of Member of the Board of Trustees according to the 

best of my ability. 

 
 
 
 
      _____________________________________ 
                                    Signature 
 
 
 
Attest: 
 
 
 
______________________________________ 
              Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
Dated: ________________________________ 



OATH OF OFFICE 
 
 
STATE OF ILLINOIS } 
    } SS 
County of Vermilion  } 
 
 
 
I, _______John Spezia___________________, having been duly elected to the Office 

of Member of the Board of Trustees of Community College District No. 507 (Danville 

Area Community College), Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford Counties, 

State of Illinois, aforesaid, do solemnly swear, that I will support the Constitution of the 

United States of America and the Constitution of the State of Illinois, and that I will 

faithfully discharge the duties of the Office of Member of the Board of Trustees 

according to the best of my ability. 

 
 
 
 
      _____________________________________ 
                                    Signature 
 
 
 
Attest: 
 
 
 
______________________________________ 
              Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 
Dated: ________________________________ 
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Adjournment of Board Sine Die 
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Roll Call – Reorganized Board 
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Appointment of Temporary Chairperson 
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Appointment of Temporary Secretary 
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Election of Officers and Appointments 
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A. Election of Chair 
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B. Election of Vice Chair 
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C.      Election of Secretary 
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D. Appointment of ICCTA Representative 
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E. Appointment of ICCTA Alternate Representative 
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F.       Appointment of Board Attorneys 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



Agenda Item:  20F 
 
Agenda Title: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPOINTMENT OF  
 BOARD ATTORNEYS 
 
Meeting Date: April 25, 2017 
 
Resource:  Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
Submitted for: Action 
 
Summary:  A recommendation is being made to appoint the following to serve 

as legal counsel for the DACC Board of Trustees and the College:  
the law firm of Davis and Delanois. 

 
 
   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
Recommendation: May we ask the Board to appoint the law firm of Davis and 

Delanois to serve as legal counsel for the DACC Board of Trustees 
and the College. 
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G.       Appointment of College Treasurer 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



Agenda Item:  20G 
 
Agenda Title: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPOINTMENT OF  
 COLLEGE TREASURER 
 
Meeting Date: April 25, 2017 
 
Resource:  Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
Submitted for: Action 
 
Summary:  A recommendation is being made to appoint Mrs. Tammy Clark-

Betancourt as the College Treasurer until the next reorganization 
meeting of the Board. 

 
 
   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
Recommendation: May we ask the Board to appoint Mrs. Tammy Clark-Betancourt 

as the College Treasurer until the next reorganization meeting of 
the Board. 
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Board Consideration of Setting Date, Time,  

and Place of Meetings 

 
 
 
 
 

 



Danville Area Community College 
Board of Trustees 

PROPOSED Calendar of Scheduled Meetings 
DACC Vermilion Hall 302 – 5:30 p.m. 

 

June 22, 2017 
 

                                       July 20, 2017         (Third Thursday) 
 

August 24, 2017 
 

September 28, 2017 
 

                                     October 26, 2017       (Hoopeston HLC) 
 

                                    November 16, 2017       (Third Thursday) 
 

             December 14, 2017       (Second Thursday) 
 

January 25, 2018 
 

February 22, 2018 
 

                                     March 15, 2018      (Third Thursday) 
 

April 26, 2018 
 

May 24, 2018 
 

June 28, 2018 
 

July 26, 2018 
 

August 23, 2018   
 

September 27, 2018 
 

                                         October 25, 2018          (Hoopeston HLC) 
 

                                       November 15, 2018        (Third Thursday) 
 

                                December 13, 2018       (Second Thursday) 
 

January 24, 2019 
 

February 28, 2019 
 

March 28, 2019         
 

April 25, 2019 
 

May 23, 2019 
       

                                                                                                Approved:           
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Board Consideration of Adopting All Existing Policies 
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New Business 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 23A 

 
 
 
 
 

  
Board Consideration of Approval of  

Travel Expenditures for Trustees 
 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 23A 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 

EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 
 
MEETING DATE: April 25, 2017 
 
RESOURCE: Dr. Stephen Nacco 
     
SUBMITTED FOR: APPROVAL 
 
SUMMARY: Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel 

Expense Control Act,” travel expenses for members of the Board of 
Trustees must be approved at an open meeting of the Board.   

 
A total of $200.00 was expended in the month of March 2017 for the 
ICCTA Seminar at Harper College on March 10, 2017.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve the travel expenses as listed above.       



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 23B 

 
 
 
 
 

  
Board Consideration to Lease Two (2)  

15-Passenger Minibuses 
 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 23B 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION TO LEASE TWO (2) 15-PASSENGER 

MINIBUSES. 
 
RESOURCE:  Mike Cunningham 
 
MEETING DATE: April 25, 2017 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the News Gazette (including on the internet) and 

submitted to Bus Service, Canal Winchester, OH, Courtesy Motors, Danville, 
IL, Midwest Transit Equipment, Kankakee, IL, Southern Bus & Mobility, 
Breese, IL, Central States Bus Sales, Fenton, MO, Master’s Transportation, 
Grandview, MO, and Best Bus Sales, Des Plaines, IL and for leasing two (2) 
2017 15-passenger minibuses.  These 15-passenger minibuses are on the FY-
17 Capital Equipment list.   

 
 Bids were opened at 11:00 AM Tuesday April 11, 2017 with the following 

results. 
       
  $    806.00 Midwest Transit Equipment, Kankakee, IL 
  $ 1,094.00 Central States Bus Sales, Fenton, MO 
  $ 1,109.00 Master’s Transportation, Grandview, MO 
            $ 1,145.00 Master’s Transportation, Grandview, MO 

$ 1,317.50 Best Bus Sales, Des Plaines, IL 
NO BID Bus Service, Canal Winchester, OH 
NO BID Southern Bus & Mobility, Breese, IL 

 NO BID Courtesy Motors, Danville, IL 
 NO BID Merchants Fleet Management, Hooksett, NH 

  
             
 These vehicles will replace two mini buses that have a lease expiring in 

August.  The cost of this expiring lease agreement is $758.00 per vehicle per 
month. It was determined that a three-year replacement cycle for leased 
minibuses promotes a safe method of transportation with a lower risk of 
mechanical failure. 
   
 

 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to consider the low bid from Midwest Transit 

Equipment in the amount of $806.00 per month per vehicle to lease two (2) 
15-passenger minibuses. 
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Board Consideration of Vermilion County Honors 

 
 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 23C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF VERMILION COUNTY HONORS 
 
RESOURCE:  Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
MEETING DATE: April 25, 2017 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Vermilion County Honors is a new, selective honors program at Danville 

Area Community College.  It is designed for Vermilion County’s top students 
who are pursuing a bachelor’s degree and are able to take a full-time course 
load in one of DACC’s associate of arts or associate of science programs.   

 
 Students accepted into Vermilion County Honors meet with an Honors Coach 

and select five “Goal” universities from a list of 100 DACC partner 
institutions.  The Honors Coach will map out the student’s success plan for 
each of the five Goal universities.  Once a student commits to being a 
Vermilion County Honors students, he or she embarks on a two-year 
adventure leading to graduation from DACC and an associate degree.   

 
 Students admitted into the Vermilion County Honors at DACC will take a 

full-time course schedule and pay the same tuition as other students.  
Admission would require an additional $250 honors fee each semester.  
Students who have met all targets for the two-year plan but still are not 
accepted into one of their “Goal” universities will receive a full refund of the 
honors fee.   

 
 

   
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approval the Vermilion County Honors program.   
 

 
 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 23D 

 
 
 
 
 

  
Board Consideration of Strategic Plan Matrix 

 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 23D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF 2018 STRATEGIC PLAN MATRIX 
 
RESOURCE:  Bob Mattson, Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
MEETING DATE: April 25, 2017 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: DACC’s Strategic Planning Matrix (attached) provides an overview of the 

College’s strategic priorities over the course of an academic year.  It is 
essential that the Matrix contain priority strategies that generate institutional 
buy-in among all constituencies throughout the College.  From these 
strategies and tactics, individual departments are able to derive more detailed 
annual goals.  As the Matrix corresponds to the College’s institutional 
priorities for an academic year, the document plays a crucial role in laying 
the groundwork for the budgeting process. 

 
  
 

   
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approval the 2018 Strategic Plan Matrix.   
 

 
 



Danville Area Community College 2017-18 Strategic Planning Matrix – final draft 
“Danville Area Community College is committed to providing quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences  
which meet the lifelong academic, cultural and economic needs of our diverse communities and the world we share.” 

 

I. I. Student Learning II. II. Student Success III. III. Institutional Excellence IV. Organizational Advancement 
A. A. Curriculum 
1. 1. Explore ideas to encourage innovative 

pedagogy 
2. 2. Implement curricular changes to increase 

student retention and persistence 
3. 3. Evaluate recent assessment and outcome 

update to programs and courses 
4. 4. Evaluate Danville Dept. of Corrections 

course schedule and faculty staffing 
5. 5. Investigate the use of more 8 week courses 
6.  
B. B. Transfer Programs 
1. 1. Expand 3+1 bachelor’s articulation 

programs 
2. 2. Explore additional ideas for pathway 

programs with senior institutions 
3. 3. Develop and implement a plan to grow 

dual credit with no financial loss 
4. 4. Investigate an Honors program for current 

DACC and county high school students 
5.  
C. C. Developmental Skills 
1. 1. Assess the implementation of Accuplacer 
2. 2. Meet with high schools to discuss testing 

and college preparedness 
3.  
D. D. Career and Technical 
1. 1. Explore new and review current curriculum 

offerings for alignment with community 
needs 

2. 2. Explore innovative ways to increase 
enrollment through stackable credentials and 
short term certificates 

3. 3. Research reopening the CDC toddler 
classroom for changing education 
requirements 

4. 4. Infuse drone technology into existing or 
new courses 

A. A. Student Engagement 
1. 1. Promote the use of reporting 

systems for timely student 
interventions 

2. 2. Assess and expand student activities 
to improve retention 

3. 3. Investigate the expansion of campus 
tutoring services and infrastructure 

4. 4. Research recruiting and retention 
methods focused on students from 
underrepresented groups 

5.  
B. B. Access and Affordability 
1. 1. Review the Master Course Schedule 

for effectiveness 
2. 2. Study the inclusion of textbooks into 

the student payment plan 
3. 3. Assess the Bonus Course strategy for 

additional course taking 
4. 4. Implement strategies to reduce 

textbook costs 
5. 5. Assess the success of the “Second 

Chance” scholarship 
6. 6. Review the tuition and fee structure 

for improved transparency 
7.  
C. C. Guided Pathways/Career 

Development 
1. 1. Research “Goals” program for 

degree/certificate seeking students 
2. 2. Track, monitor and provide 

assistance to keep students on track for 
graduation within three years 

3. 3. Assess effectiveness of multiple-
measure strategies for initial course 
placement 

4. 4. Review mentoring program 

A.   Budget 
1. Maintain essential spending guidelines 
2. Identify and apply for grant opportunities in support of teaching and learning that fund 
equipment and facilities 
3. Explore strategies to increase Assessment Center staffing, service, and space to meet 
student and community demand 
4. Investigate more cost effective health insurance 
 
B. Infrastructure Renewal and Expansion 
1. Assess recent changes to improve energy efficiency 
2. Investigate future expansion of campus facilities 
3. Assess the SBDC and Community Ed location moves 
4. Establish continuation of operation plans to prepare for short and long term calamities 
5. Investigate upgrades to campus building HVAC units 
 

D. C. Technological Enhancements 
E. 1. Assess improved methods for student test-taking in Assessment Center 
F. 2. Investigate scanning software and electronic form capabilities 

3. Evaluate online tutorials 
4. 4. Investigate improvements to television production and studio 
5. 5. Investigate online Financial Aid accessibility for students 
6.  
G. D. 2019 Accreditation 
1. 1. Produce previously missing evidence for the Assurance Argument 

2. Provide ”closing the loop” examples of assessment for departments 
3. Assess the coordination of the planning processes (budget, strategic, assessment and 
other plans) 
4. Evaluate HLC Mandatory Advisement Quality Project 
 

E. E. Professional Development 
1. 1. Develop succession plans 
1. 2. Train and implement staff and faculty on intrusive advisement strategies and 

embedded advisement 
1. 3. Assess and enhance emergency planning by holding “table top” drills 
1. 4. Evaluate faculty training on the development of a culture of learning and awareness of 

DACC student services 
2. 5. Continue to recruit and retain a diverse workforce 
3. 6. Evaluate the summer work schedule 

A. A. New Revenue Streams 
B. 1. Evaluate and revise a facility rental plan 
C. 2. Investigate grants or alternative funding 

opportunities with existing business partners 
D. 3. Plan for a Foundation fundraising campaign 
E. 4. Implement strategies to build a revitalized 

Alumni Association 
F. 5. Implement an entrepreneurial approach to 

Community Education 
G. 6. Research a CDC partnership 
H. 7. Research expanded class offerings at Danville 

Housing 
 
B. Brand Marketing 
1. Institutionalize the ‘Power of 3’ branding 
2. Evaluate marketing to millennials 
3. Evaluate the use of student and alumni 
testimonials in recent marketing 
4. Market 3 + 1 bachelor programs 
 
C. Community Relations 
1. Market degree completion to dual credit 
students 
2. Update marketing dual enrollment to K-12 
families 
3. Enhance relationships with public officials 
4. Continue College participation in Danville’s 
East/Main corridor development 
5. Continue sustainability initiatives 
6. Explore enhancement to services, usage and 
purpose of the Hoopeston Learning Center 
 
D. Corporate Education/Workforce 
1. Implement a regionalized workforce 
development system through AJC and WIOA 
2. Continue to increase community linkages with 
Corporate Education 
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Board Consideration of DACC Honorary Degrees 

 
 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 23E 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF DACC HONORARY DEGREES 
 
RESOURCE:  Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
MEETING DATE: April 25, 2017 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: DACC’s Graduation Committee received several nominations for an 

honorary Associate degree during the 2017 commencement ceremony.  At 
the May 19, 2017 ceremony, Honorary Degrees will be bestowed to two 
individuals who have exhibited exemplary achievement to DACC. 

 
  
 

 
 
 
   
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve the DACC Honorary Degrees.     
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Information 
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Communications 
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