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Mission Statement  
 

Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 
quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences that 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 
 
 

Non-Discrimination Statement 
Danville Area Community College does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, disability 

or age in its programs and activities.  Inquiries may be directed to Jill A. Cranmore, Vice President, Human 
Resources, Affirmative Action Officer, Title IX Coordinator, and Section 504/ADA Coordinator, Danville Area 
Community College, 2000 E. Main St., Martin Luther King Memorial Way, Danville, IL  61832-5199, 217-443-

8756, or jcranmore@dacc.edu. 
      
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
  
  

 
 
Danville Area Community College will continue to be nationally recognized leader in student 
success and an active partner in building and maintaining academic excellence and the 
economic vitality of the communities it serves. 

 
 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, 
employees, community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 
Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 
Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual 
growth of those we serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing 
world.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Vision Statement 



PLEASE NOTE:  If a person would like to publicly comment, please send an email to 
kthurman@dacc.edu before 3:00 p.m. on Thursday, October 22, 2020.   

The comments will be read during Public Comment at the Board meeting at 5:30 p.m.   
A person may also call 1-866-906-9888 and enter 8580758# to participate in the meeting.     

 
BOARD OF TRUSTEES 

Community College District No. 507 
Regular Meeting 

Danville Area Community College 
Vermilion Hall Room 302 

Thursday, October 22, 2020 
5:30 p.m. 

 
 

AGENDA 
1. Call to Order 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 
3. Roll Call 
4. Adoption of Agenda 
5. Recognition of Visitors 
6. Business and Technology Report 
7. Financial Update 
8. President’s Report 
9. Public Comment 

 
11.    Unfinished Business 
12.  New Business 
 A. Board Consideration of Tenure Recommendation 
   1.  R.J. Rowland, Instructor, Welding 
 

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 
enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should so 
request before approval of the agenda. 
 

10. Consent Agenda  
A. Board Consideration of the Minutes of the Public Hearing of September 24, 2020;        

and Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting of September 24, 2020 
B. Financial Report 
C. Clery Security Report 
D. Board Consideration of Board Policy Revisions 

                  1.  Board Policy #4003.1 – Anti-Harassment in Employment 
                  2.  Board Policy #4003.2 – Anti-Harassment in Education (delete)   
                  3.  Board Policy #4003.3 – Title IX Prohibiting Discrimination on the Basis of Gender 

(delete) 
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 B. Board Consideration of Revised Notice of Filing Petitions for Membership on                

the Board of Trustees of Community College District Number 507 
 C. Board Consideration of Human Resources Report 
 D. Board Consideration of Bids for Computer Equipment 
  
13. Information 
 A. Communications 
14. Adjournment 
 
NOVEMBER 2020 
      3 Election Day – College Closed 
      6 Spring/Winter ONLINE Registration Begins 
      9 Spring/Winter ON-CAMPUS Registration Begins 
     11 Veterans Day Holiday – College Closed 
     19 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 
 26-27 Thanksgiving Holidays – College Closed 
DECEMBER 2020 
     14 Study Day or Makeup Day 
 15-18 Final Exams 
     17 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting, 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 
     21 Winter Term Begins 
 24-31 Holiday Break – College Closed 
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Financial Update 



     

FY21 FY20
OPERATING FUNDS TENTATIVE YTD % YTD YTD

(EDUCATION; OPERATIONS & MAINTENANCE) PROP BUDG 9/30/2020 OF TOTAL 9/30/2019 %

REVENUES

1   Property Tax Revenue 5,116,000 1,277,250 25 % (A) 1,233,750 25%
2   Personal Property Replacement Tax (PPRT) 600,000 153,045 26 % (B) 10,956 2%
3   ICCB Base Operating Grants 1,584,538 0 0 % (C) 316,464 20%
4   ICCB Equalization Grant 2,531,835 0 0 % (C) 406,422 17%
5   CTE Vocational Cr Hr Reimbursement 170,605 0 0 % (C) 0 0%
6   Tuition 6,600,000 3,476,978 53 % (D) 3,979,403 52%
7   Fees 1,750,000 814,242 47 % (D) 820,524 52%
8   Less:  Institutional Scholarships/Waivers (2,725,000) (1,773,187) 65 % (D) (1,187,735) 46%
9   Interest Income 6,000 500 8 % (E) 11,675 33%

10   Transfers from Other Funds 1,382,684 14,784 1 % (E) 15,681 3%
11   Facility Rent Revenue/Chargebacks/Other 145,000 13,389 9 % (E) 83,885 42%

12 TOTAL OPERATING REVENUES 17,161,662 3,977,001 23 % 5,691,025 33%

EXPENDITURES BY OBJECT

13   Salaries 11,484,669 2,473,076 22 % 2,470,735 22%
14   Employee Benefits 1,941,318 512,839 26 % 556,159 24%
15   Contractual Services 562,116 139,125 25 % (F) 94,603 15%
16   Materials & Supplies 1,659,033 747,547 45 % (G) 812,675 49%
17   Meetings, Travel, Conferences 173,000 10,087 6 % (E) 21,118 7%
18   Fixed Charges 205,526 159,947 78 % (H) 144,396 70%
19   Utilities 780,000 152,845 20 % (I) 211,840 26%
20   Capital Outlay 0 22,157 0 % (E) 80,144 0%
21   Transfers to other Funds/Other 356,000 11,288 3 % (E) 6,060 12%

22 TOTAL OPERATING EXPENDITURES 17,161,662 4,228,911 25 % 4,397,730 26%

23 NET REVENUE/(EXPENDITURE) 0 (251,910) 1,293,295

NOTES:

(A) Amounts are recorded quarterly at the end of each quarter.
(B) Majority of revenue is received in the second half of the fiscal year.
(C) Amounts received from ICCB will not be even.
(D) Revenue is primarily received at the beginning of each semester and institutional waivers/scholarships are awarded

    near the beginning of the semester; based on comparison to prior year, it appears that waivers are likely under budgeted.
(E) This revenue or expense item does not occur evenly over the year.
(F) Includes amounts that will likely be covered by MIS reserves at the end of the year.
(G) Instructional material and supply spending is accelerated prior to the beginning of each semester.
(H) The allocation between Property & Liability in the FY20 premium was incorrect, causing the budget amounts to be incorrect for FY21.

    The FY21 budgeted amount in the L,P,S Fund is overbudgeted while in O&M it's underbudgeted.
(I) Payments on utility bills are approximately two months in arrears.  Invoice for July service has a

DANVILLE AREA COMMUNITY COLLEGE

FINANCIAL STATEMENT OF REVENUE AND EXPENDITURES
FOR  THE OPERATING FUNDS

       FY21 - Year to Date - July 1, 2020 - September 30, 2020

Target - 25%
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Public Comment 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 10A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of the Minutes of the  
Public Hearing of September 24, 2020; and  

Regular Board Meeting of September 24, 2020 
 



MINUTES OF PUBLIC HEARING of September 24, 2020  
On September 24, 2020, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in the 
Board Room, Vermilion Hall Room 302 at Danville Area Community College in order to 
conduct a Public Hearing on the 2021 Fiscal Year Budget.  
 
CALL TO ORDER  
Chairperson Harby called the meeting to order at 5:36 p.m.  
 
Trustees present: Tracy Cherry, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, Dr. Ron Serfoss, John Spezia, Greg 
Wolfe, and Student Trustee Holley Hambleton. Trustee absent: Bill Black 
 
Others present: President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Tammy 
Betancourt, Dr. Natalie Page, Stacy Ehmen, Lara Conklin, Jill Cranmore and Jerry Davis, were 
physically present. Mark Barnes, Eric Levy, Chris McLaren and Alex Johnson were present via 
phone. 
 
Media present:  Ross Brown, WDAN-WDNL 
 
On August 20, 2020, the Board approved making the FY2021 budget available for public 
inspection with appropriate notification provided to the public. The Budget has been available 
for public inspection in the President’s Office and also via the DACC website for the past 30 
days.  
 
PUBLIC COMMENT 
There were no comments, written testimony, or oral testimony from the public regarding the 
FY2021 Budget. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Public Hearing was adjourned at 
5:38 p.m. The motion passed by roll call vote: 7 yeas, 0 nays.  
 
 

__________________________________________  
Chairperson, Board of Trustees  
 
 
__________________________________________ 
 Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
 

 Approved: __________________________________ 



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING of September 24, 2020 
On September 24, 2020, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall Room 302, at Danville Area 
Community College.       
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Dave Harby called the meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
The Board and those in attendance recited the Pledge of Allegiance.   
 
ITEM 3: ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present: Tracy Cherry, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, Dr. Ron 
Serfoss, John Spezia, and Student Trustee Holley Hambleton. Trustee absent: Bill Black 
and Greg Wolfe (arrived at 5:32). 
 
Others present:  President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Tammy 
Betancourt, Dr. Natalie Page, Stacy Ehmen, Lara Conklin, Jill Cranmore and Jerry Davis,   
were physically present. Mark Barnes, Eric Levy, Chris McLaren and Alex Johnson were 
present via phone. 
 
Media present:  Ross Brown, WDAN-WDNL  
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Harby asked if there were any changes requested to the agenda.  With no changes 
requested, upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, the agenda was approved 
as presented.  The motion passed by unanimous voice vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
The following members of the College Cabinet were present: Tammy Betancourt, Vice 
President, Finance and Chief Financial Officer; Dr. Natalie Page, Vice President, Academic 
Affairs; Stacy Ehmen, Vice President, Student Services; Jill Cranmore, Vice President, 
Human Resources; and Lara Conklin, Executive Director, College Relations. Also present: 
Jerry Davis, Davis and Delanois. The following were present via phone:  Mark Barnes, 
Director, Information Technology; Eric Levy, Account Executive, Ellucian; Chris 
McLaren, Account Executive, Cloud Services; and Alex Johnson, Account Executive, 
Cloud Services.  
    
Media present:  Ross Brown, WDAN-WDNL  
 
PUBLIC HEARING 
Mr. Harby recessed the regular meeting at 5:36 p.m. for the purpose of conducting a Public 
Hearing on the FY2021 Budget.  
 
RECONVENE  
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Dr. Serfoss, upon completion of the Public Hearing, moved that the Board reconvene in 
regular session. The motion was seconded by Mr. Spezia and passed by roll call vote: 7 
yeas, 0 nays. Mr. Harby reconvened the Regular Board Meeting at 5:38 p.m. 
 
ITEM 6: REPORT ON ICCTA MEETINGS, SEPTEMBER 11, 2020 
Mr. Wolfe attended the ICCTA Meeting on September 11, 2020. He shared highlights from 
the meeting. 
 
ITEM 7: FINANCIAL UPDATE 
Vice President Betancourt provided a financial update to the Board. The Financial 
Statement of Revenue and Expenditures ending August 31, 2020 was included in the Board 
agenda book.   
 
ITEM 8: PRESIDENT’S REPORT 
Dr. Nacco shared the DACC Flash with the Board and highlighted the events from the last 
month.   
 
ITEM 9: PUBLIC COMMENT 
 
ITEM 10: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE 
REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF AUGUST 20, 2020 

B. FINANCIAL REPORT 
C. HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 
D. CLERY SECURITY REPORT 
E. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY  REVISIONS 

1. BOARD POLICY #3024 – PREVENTING SEXUAL 
VIOLENCE POLICY 

2. BOARD POLICY #6013 – PURCHASING 
3. BOARD POLICY #6015 – PURCHASE ORDERS 
4. BOARD POLICY #6016 – SOLE SOURCE PURCHASES 

Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved the items on the 
Consent Agenda.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.    
 
ITEM 11: UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
ITEM 12: NEW BUSINESS 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF ELLUCIAN CLOUD SERVICES 
ORDER FORM, WHICH AMENDS THE GENERAL TERMS 
AND CONDITIONS AGREEMENT WITH ELLUCIAN 
COMPANY, L.P. 

The “Cloud” has become the new norm for many entities to store data.  Moving to the 
Cloud is a matter of when, not if.  The Cloud refers to servers that are accessed over the 
internet, and the software and databases that run on those servers.  Cloud servers are located 
in data centers all over the world.  By using Cloud computing, users and organizations 
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don’t have to manage physical servers themselves or run software applications on their own 
machines. 
 
Currently, our Ellucian Colleague Student Information System (SIS)/Enterprise Resource 
Planning System (ERP) runs on an IBM P550 server which is approximately 15 years old.  
Various drives have been replaced within the server when needed, however, it is essentially 
not a stable environment for our SIS/ERP and will need to be replaced.  In addition, the 
operating system that runs the server (AIX) is becoming an outdated programming 
language.  As a result, not only is in-house support experience limited, it is also becoming 
more difficult to obtain outside support.  A change to a new operating system (LINUX) will 
be needed.   
 
This is the only server that houses the Colleague application software, as well as all of our 
data.  Backups of data are routinely created and stored off-site, however, should there be a 
disaster on the campus that detrimentally impacts Vermilion Hall, the Colleague system 
would not be available for weeks.  To maintain another server off-site with the Colleague 
application software would be a significant investment. 
 
Given the significant future investment to add updated equipment, operating systems 
software, encryption software, additional cyber security services, related consulting services 
and the addition of IT personnel, a team of staff investigated the possibility of 
implementing a Cloud based system with Ellucian as an alternative.  The team consisted of 
Tammy Betancourt, Kerri Thurman, Mark Barnes, Jessica Miles and Brian Pollitt.   
 
The team unanimously agreed that moving to the Cloud is in the best interest of the College 
and any individual with data stored in Colleague (students, employees, etc.).  Not only will 
moving to the Cloud eliminate the investments needed above and provide a backup location 
in the event of a campus disaster (only a personnel relocation with internet access is all that 
is required), it will provide a “Global Information Security Program” that is aligned with 
industry standards and provides 24x7 monitoring for breaches.  All data is encrypted 
whether it is at rest on the server or in-transit.  It would be a significant cost to the College 
to purchase and maintain encryption software to achieve this high level of security.   
 
The Ellucian Cloud is hosted by Amazon Web Services (AWS), which is an industry 
benchmark for high reliability and availability.  AWS is utilized by entities such as the CIA, 
FBI, DOD, FDA, Formula One, Expedia, Shell, Verizon, Capital One and millions more.  
AWS has 77 availability zones within 24 geographic regions around the world.  This 
provides multiple locations of physical servers, which provide the College access to 
Colleague in the event of an Ellucian or AWS outage (within 24 hours). 
 
Ellucian is required annually to undergo System and Organization Controls (SOC) 
attestation engagement with a Certified Public Accounting (CPA) Firm.  The CPA firm 
attests that the description of the controls is presented fairly, the controls are designed 
effectively and the controls operate as intended over a period of time.  The most recent 
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SOC engagements were performed by Ernst & Young for the period April 1, 2019 to March 
31, 2020 with unmodified opinions. 
 
In accordance with the College’s information security plan and procedures, as referred to in 
Board Policy 6033.0, “Securing and Safeguarding Information”, the Information Security 
Team has evaluated the addition of these services from Ellucian without exception.  The 
addition of Cloud services from Ellucian, hosted by AWS, meets the requirements of the 
College’s information security policy, plan and procedures. 
 
The cost of Cloud services is $13,238 per month or $158,856 annually for five years, with 
no escalation for that time period.  This annual cost will be offset by approximately $60,000 
of savings in the first year and approximately $68,000 in years two through five.  These 
savings are a result of not hiring an additional staff member in MIS (which will be needed 
if we don’t migrate to the Cloud), as well as other hardware maintenance service costs and 
backup costs.  Therefore, the impact to the operating budget is $98,856 in year one and 
$90,351 in years two through five. 
 
There is also a one-time implementation fee of $115,000 payable in two equal annual 
installments.  This fee would be funded with amounts available in the MIS Reserves 
account in the Board Restricted Reserves fund.   
 
In addition, by moving to the Cloud, the College avoids utilizing at least $30,000 of 
Technology/Equipment Bond Funds by not needing to purchase a new server.  If we would 
purchase another server to keep off-site for disaster recovery, that savings doubles to 
$60,000. 
 
Of perhaps more importance is the avoidance of future costs as a result of a security breach 
or productivity due to a natural disaster or other unplanned downtime.  Ellucian’s formulaic 
calculations utilizing industry data values the decreased risk of a data breach/security 
incident at $2.3 million, increased productivity due to improved disaster recovery time at 
$52,000 and increased productivity due to unplanned downtime at $80,000. 
 
In summary, due to the needed expense of updating or adding servers, the need for an 
additional MIS staff person, a more accessible system in the event of a natural disaster and 
to provide a much more secure environment for our SIS/ERP system, it is our 
recommendation to enter into this Cloud services agreement with Ellucian and migrate our 
SIS/ERP system to the Cloud. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, the Board approved the Ellucian 
Cloud Services Order Form, which amends the general terms and conditions agreement 
with Ellucian Company, L.P. The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

B. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION TO ADOPT 
FY2021 BUDGET AND RESOLUTION TO APPROVE TAX LEVY 
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At the August Board of Trustees meeting the Board approved placing the tentative FY2021 
Budget on display for the required 30 days.  The September 24 Board of Trustees meeting 
was also established as the date for the required Public Hearing.   
 
The budget presentation at the August meeting recommended an operational budget of 
$17,161,662.  This is approximately 0.3% higher than the FY20 Operating budget.  With 
the adoption of a FY21 budget at the state level, including an increase of over $100,000 in 
our operating and equalization grants, as well as continued increases in local property taxes 
as a result of an increasing Equalized Assessed Valuation, the College will be able to move 
forward by investing in Human Resources to maintain quality student service, provide 
training needed to meet the employment demands of the community, provide training 
needed for assessment of student learning outcomes, cover software increases in Colleague 
and Blackboard, and add new student mobile app software. 
 
Depending on the fluctuation in the Equalized Assessed Valuation, the tax levy rate is 
anticipated to be approximately 60.86 cents.  The current rate is 61.15 cents. 
 
Expenditures in the Board Restricted Fund support contingencies for one-time expenditures 
that may occur.   
 
Included in the Board packet is a Resolution to Adopt the Budget, a Resolution Approving 
the Tax Levy, and a Truth in Taxation Certificate of Compliance 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Ms. Cherry, the Board approved the FY2021 
Budget and the Resolution Approving the Tax Levy. The motion passed by signature vote:  
7 yeas, 0 nays. 

 
C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION APPROVING 

THE TIMING OF RECOGNITION OF PROPERTY TAX 
REVENUE 

Governmental Accounting Standards Board (GASB) Statement #33 addresses accounting 
and financial reporting for nonexchange transactions. Revenue from property tax levies fall 
into this category. Since property tax levies are approved for a calendar year and the actual 
receipt of funds occur in more than one fiscal year, this GASB Statement #33 requires 
certain recognition guidelines to be followed, unless a resolution is approved by the Board 
stating what fiscal year the revenue should be allocated. 
 
This Resolution is asking the Board to recognize 100% of the 2020 levy revenue in Fiscal 
Year 2021. If approved, this action will formally allocate property tax revenue that is 
consistent with our past practice. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the Resolution 
recognizing 100% of the 2020 levy revenue in Fiscal Year 2021. The motion passed by 
signature vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
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D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION ABATING 
TAXES    HERETOFORE LEVIED FOR THE YEAR 2020 TO 
PAY DEBT SERVICE ON GENERAL OBLIGATION 
COMMUNITY COLLEGE BONDS, SERIES 2013A, OF 
COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT NO. 507, COUNTIES OF 
VERMILION, EDGAR, IROQUOIS, CHAMPAIGN AND FORD 
AND STATE OF ILLINOIS 

The College issued $2,995,000 of General Obligation Bonds on September 24, 2013, which 
included a tax levy sufficient to pay the principal of and interest on the Bonds based on the 
maturity schedule.  However, the Bond and Interest Fund will have funds available to meet 
the debt service, which will allow the College to abate the applicable 2020 tax levy.  The 
funds are comprised of unspent 2013A bond proceeds.  Bond counsel has advised that the 
available funds from the unspent 2013A bond proceeds may be used to meet the debt 
service requirements of this bond issue.  The amount of the levy to be abated is 
$127,287.50. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Ms. Cherry, the Board approved the Resolution 
Abating Taxes Heretofore Levied for the Year 2020 to Pay Debt Service on General 
Obligation Community College Bonds, Series 2013A, of Community College District No. 
507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and State of Illinois. The 
motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

E. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 
EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 

Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel Expense Control Act,” 
travel expenses for members of the Board of Trustees must be approved at an open meeting 
of the Board.   
 
A total of $386.60 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over the last month.  
Expenses included $100.80 for the ICCTA Executive Committee Retreat on August 14-15, 
2020 for Mr. Greg Wolfe and $285.80 for the ICCTA Meeting on September 11, 2020 for 
Mr. Greg Wolfe.         
 
Upon motion by Ms. Cherry, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved the travel 
expenditures for Trustees. The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
    

F. BOARD CONSIDERATION TO LEASE TWO (2) 15-PASSENGER 
MINIBUSES 

Bids were advertised for leasing two (2) 2020 minibuses. These 15-passenger minibuses are 
on the FY-21 Capital Equipment List.  
       
These vehicles will replace two mini-buses that have a lease expiring in December 2020.  
The cost of the expiring lease agreement is $806.00 per vehicle per month. The cost 
presented to the Board in April 2020 for two minibuses was $1,061.00 per bus. It was 
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determined that a three-year replacement cycle for leased minibuses promotes a safe 
method of transportation with a lower risk of mechanical failure. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the lease of two 
(2) 15-passenger minibuses in the amount of $981.00 a month from Midwest Transit 
Equipment of Kankakee, IL. The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 

 
G. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR SEMI-TRUCK 

DRIVING SIMULATOR 
 
The Tractor Trailer Driving Program has a semi-truck driving simulator that is outdated and 
beyond repair.  A simulator is a very important part of training as it not only protects our 
semi tractors from damage, but it provides a safer experience for both the instructor and the 
student when the actual driving training begins.   
 
The semi-truck driving simulator is on the FY21 Capital Equipment List and will be funded 
by the Perkins Grant. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Dr. Serfoss, the Board approved the bid of 
$49,900.00 from Doron Precision Systems of Binghamton, NY for the semi-truck driving 
simulator for the Tractor Trailer Program. The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 
nays. 
 

H. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF NOTICE OF FILING PETITIONS 
FOR MEMBERSHIP ON THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF 
COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT #507 

A Resolution for Community College Election is included for the purpose of electing two 
members for a full term of six years to the College Board of Trustees.  The election will be 
held on Tuesday, April 6, 2021.  A “Notice of Filing Petitions for Membership on the 
Board of Trustees of Community College District #507” needs to be publicized at least ten 
(10) days before the first day for filing petitions.   
 
Nominating petitions for the April 6, 2021 election shall be filed between the hours of 8:00 
a.m. and 5:00 p.m. on December 14, 15, 16, 17, 20, or 21, 2020.  Nominating petitions 
along with applicable documents may be picked up in the Office of the Board Secretary.   
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved the Notice of 
Filing Petitions for Membership on the Board of Trustees of Community College District 
#507. The motion passed by signature vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
    

I. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF SETTING DATE, TIME, AND 
PLACE OF BOARD ORGANIZATIONAL MEETING 

The date for the April 2021 regular meeting has been established as April 22, 2021.  The 
date for the organizational meeting needs to be established.     
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Election law requires that following each election, the new Board shall hold its 
organizational meeting on or before the 28th day after the election.  The last day for 
community college boards to conduct organizational meetings is May 4, 2021.  The election 
date is April 6, 2021 and the last day for the county clerk or board of election commissions 
to canvass the election results is April 27, 2021; therefore, the regular meeting date of April 
22, 2021 will not be appropriate for the organizational meeting.  We are recommending that 
the organizational meeting occur on Tuesday, May 4, 2021 at 8:00 a.m.   
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Ms. Cherry, the Board approved setting the 
date, time, and place of the Board Organizational Meeting as May 4, 2021 at 8:00 a.m. in 
VH302. The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

J. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF CHANGING THE LOCATION 
OF THE NOVEMBER 19, 2020 REGULAR BOARD MEETING 

The scheduled date of the November 2020 Board meeting is Thursday, November 19, 2020 
at 5:30 p.m. at the DACC Hoopeston Higher Learning Center.  Since it is difficult to social 
distance in the Hoopeston Higher Learning Center, it is recommended that the location be 
changed to Vermilion Hall Room 302 at DACC.  If approved, appropriate notifications will 
be sent.   

 
Upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Spezia, the Board approved changing the 
location of the November 19, 2020 Regular Board Meeting at Hoopeston Higher Learning 
Center to Vermilion Hall Room 302 at DACC. The motion passed by roll call vote:  7 yeas, 
0 nays. 
 
ITEM 12: INFORMATION 

A. COMMUNICATIONS 
 
ITEM 13: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 6:41 p.m. 
       
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 10B 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Financial Report 
October 22, 2020 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
  
 
  























































































 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 10C 
 
 
 
 
 
  

Board Consideration of Clery Security Report 
October 22, 2020 

 
 

 
  

     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  10C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF CLERY SECURITY REPORT 
 
DATE:   October 22, 2020 
 
RESOURCE:  Jill Cranmore, Stacy Ehmen 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: The College received no Clery crime reports for Danville Area Community 

College’s main campus in the past month.        
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION:   May we ask the Board to approve the Clery Security Report above.           



 BOARD AGENDA ITEM 10D 
 
 
 
 
 
  

Board Consideration of Board Policy Revisions   
1. Board Policy #4003.1 – Anti-Harassment in Employment 

2. Board Policy #4003.2 – Anti-Harassment in Education (delete) 
3. Board Policy #4003.3 – Title IX Prohibiting Discrimination  

    on the Basis of Gender (delete) 
 

  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  10D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY REVISIONS 

1. Board Policy #4003.1 – Anti-Harassment in Employment 
2. Board Policy #4003.2 – Anti-Harassment in Education (delete) 
3. Board Policy #4003.3 – Title IX Prohibiting Discrimination on the Basis 

of Gender (delete) 
 
DATE:   October 22, 2020 
 
RESOURCE:  Jill Cranmore, Stacy Ehmen, Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Board Policy #4003.1 – Anti-Harassment in Employment 
 Board Policy #4003.2 – Anti-Harassment in Education (delete) 

Board Policy #4003.3 – Title IX Prohibiting Discrimination on the Basis of 
Gender (delete) 

 
To comply with recent federal laws, Robbins-Schwartz has reviewed all of 
the College’s student and employment policies regarding Title IX and have 
suggested the revision to Board Policy #4003.1 and the deletion of Board 
Policy #4003.2 and Board Policy #4003.3.     

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
RECOMMENDATION:   May we ask the Board to approve the revision to Board Policy  

#4003.1–Anti-Harassment in Employment; and the deletion of Board 
Policy #4003.2 – Anti-Harassment in Education and Board Policy 
#4003.3 – Title IX Prohibiting Discrimination on the Basis of Gender.         
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Anti-Harassment in Employment Policy  Non-Discrimination and Harassment Policy 4003.1 

 

Danville Area Community College is committed to maintaining providing an educational and 

workplace work environment that is free of from harassment and discrimination.  In keeping 

with this commitment, the College prohibits and will not tolerate discrimination or harassment 

of any person because of race, color, age, sex, national origin, disability, religion, sexual 

orientation, gender identity or expression, marital status, military or veteran status, genetic 

information, ancestry, citizenship, pregnancy or any other status protected by law.  College 

employees or of any employees performing services for the College by anyone, including its 

president or any administrator, or any supervisor, manager, employee, vendor, client, or 

customer of the College or any third party.  This policy applies to all College employees, 

students, visitors and third-parties in connection with employment with the College and 

any College program or activity, whether on or off campus. 

 

Any person found to have engaged in any form of harassment or discrimination may be 

subject to discipline, including expulsion, termination and/or exclusion from the College 

and any College events or activities.  Any person who has been subjected to sexual 

harassment or any other form of sex-based misconduct is encouraged to make a report 

with the College’s Title IX Coordinator.  For additional information regarding sex-based 

misconduct, see the College’s Sex-Based Misconduct Policy and Procedures 3024, which 

can be found at the following link:  https://www.dacc.edu/board/policies?search=3024.0.  

Any person who has been subjected to discrimination or harassment based on a category or 

categories other than sex is encouraged to make a report with the Title IX Coordinator, Jill 

Cranmore, 217-443-8756, 2000 East Main Street, Danville, IL 61832.   

 

Harassment consists of unwelcome conduct, whether verbal, physical, or visual, that is based 

upon a person’s status, such as sex, color, race, religion, creed, ancestry, national origin, age, 

physical or mental disability, marital status, veteran status, sexual orientation or other legally 

protected statuses.  Danville Area Community College will not tolerate harassing conduct that 

affects tangible job benefits, that interferes unreasonably with an individual’s work performance, 

or that creates an intimidating, hostile, or offensive working environment.  Such harassment may 

include, for example, jokes about another person’s protected status, kidding, teasing or practical 

jokes directed at a person based on his or her protected status. 

 

Sexual harassment deserves special mention.  Unwelcome sexual advances, requests for sexual 

favors, and other physical, verbal, or visual conduct based on sex constitute sexual harassment 

when (1) submission to the conduct is an explicit or implicit term or condition of employment, 

http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?
http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?section=6000
https://www.dacc.edu/board/policies?search=3024.0


(2) submission to or rejection of the conduct is used as the basis for an employment decision, or 

(3) the conduct has the purpose or effect of unreasonably interfering with an individual’s work 

performance or creating an intimidating, hostile, or offensive working environment.  Sexual 

harassment is conduct based on sex, whether directed towards a person of the opposite or same 

sex, and may include explicit sexual propositions, sexual innuendo, suggestive comments, 

sexually oriented “kidding” or “teasing”, “practical jokes,” jokes about obscene printed or visual 

material, and physical contact such as patting, pinching, or brushing against another person’s 

body. 

 

Danville Area Community College is committed to maintaining a work environment that is free 

of discrimination and will post, in accordance with Public Act 96-574, in prominent and 

accessible areas, information outlining sexual harassment laws and policies. 

 

All College employees are responsible to help assure that we avoid harassment, regardless of 

whether the harassment has yet reached a severe or pervasive level that is considered a violation 

of the law.  If any supervisor or employee of the College feels that he/she has experienced or 

witnessed harassment, he/she is to notify the College’s Affirmative Action Officer, Jill 

Cranmore, Director of Human Resources, 217.443.8756, Dave Kietzmann, Vice President for 

Instruction and Student Services, 217.443.8771, or Dr. Stephen Nacco, President, 217.443.8848.  

If any WIOA/VCW employee feels that he/she has experienced or witnessed harassment, he/she 

is to notify Jonathan Jett, Assistant Director, VCW/WIOA, WIOA/EEO Officer, at 442-3044, 

Ext. 239.  Danville Area Community College forbids retaliation against anyone for reporting 

harassment, assisting in reporting harassment, or cooperating in a harassment investigation.  If 

any supervisor or employee of the College feels that he/she has been retaliated against, he/she is 

to notify the College’s Affirmative Action Officer, Jill Cranmore, Director of Human Resources, 

217.443.8756, Dave Kietzmann, Vice President for Instruction and Student Services, 

217.443.8771, or Dr. Stephen Nacco, President, 217.443.8848.  If any WIOA/VCW employee 

feels that he/she has been retaliated against, he/she is to notify Jonathan Jett, Assistant Director, 

VCW/WIOA, WIOA/EEO Officer, at 442-3044, Ext. 239. 

 

Retaliation Prohibited 

 

Any form of retaliation, including intimidation, threats, harassment, bullying and other 

adverse action taken or threatened against any complainant or person reporting 

discrimination or harassment or against any person cooperating in the investigation of 

allegations of discrimination or harassment (including assisting or participating in any 

manner in an investigation), is strictly prohibited.  A person reporting allegations of 

retaliation may be protected under state or federal law, including but not limited to, the 

Illinois Whistleblower Act, the Illinois Human Rights Act, and the State Officials and 

Employees Ethics Act. 

 

Any person found to have engaged in retaliation may be subject to discipline, up to and 

including expulsion, termination and/or exclusion from the College and its events and 

activities.  Reports of retaliation should be directed to the Title IX Coordinator, Jill 

Cranmore, 217-443-8756, 2000 East Main Street, Danville, IL 61832. 

 



False Reports 

 

Any person who knowingly makes a false report under this policy may be subject to 

discipline including termination from employment and exclusion from the College. 

 

Implementing Procedures; Complaints 

 

The procedures implementing this policy can be found at https://www.dacc.edu/titleix.  

Inquiries may also be made to the U.S. Department of Education, Office of Civil Rights, 

500 W. Madison Street, Suite 1475, Chicago, IL 60661-4544 or (312) 730-1560, 

OCR.Chicago@ed.gov. 

 

Danville Area Community College’s policy is to investigate all complaints made under this 

policy impartially, thoroughly and promptly.  To the fullest extent possible, Danville Area 

Community College will keep harassment complaints, records related to harassment complaints, 

and the terms of the resolution confidential.  If any investigation confirms that a violation of the 

policy has occurred, Danville Area Community College will take appropriate corrective action to 

stop the harassment and to ensure that the harassment does not reoccur.  Such corrective action 

may include training of harasser, monitoring of harasser and/or discipline of the harasser 

proportional to the offense, up to and including discharge. 

 

If you believe that you have been the subject of unlawful discrimination, harassment or 

retaliation for complaining about unlawful harassment, you also have the right to file a charge of 

civil rights violations with the Illinois Department of Human Rights. and, if substantial evidence 

to support the College is found to exist, to have such an opportunity as is provided by law and 

applicable regulations to engage in conciliation with the College and/or to have the charge heard 

in a public hearing before an Administrative Law Judge of the Illinois Human Rights 

Commission.  For further information, you may call or write to the Illinois Department of 

Human Rights, 222 S. College Street, Springfield, Illinois 62701, 217.785.5100, of the Illinois 

Human Rights Commission, Stratton Office Building, Springfield, Illinois 62701, 217.785.4350. 

 

Adopted:  7-28-92; Revised (from Sexual Harassment Policy 4053) 9-26-00; Revised 3-23-04; 

Revised 11-15-05; Revised 1-26-10; Revised 8-23-11; Revised 9-27-16; Revised   

__________________________________ 

 
 

https://www.dacc.edu/titleix
mailto:OCR.Chicago@ed.gov
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Anti-Harassment in Education Policy 4003.2 

 

Danville Area Community College is committed to providing its students with an educational 

environment that is free of discrimination.  Accordingly, the College will not tolerate harassment 

of Danville Area Community College students by anyone, including its president, or any 

administrator, any (full, part-time, and/or visiting) faculty or staff member, including any 

graduate assistant, any other College students, or any third party. 

 

Harassment consists of unwelcome conduct, whether verbal, physical, or visual, that is based 

upon a person’s protected status, such as sex, color, race, religion, creed, ancestry, national 

origin, age, physical or mental disability, marital status, sexual orientation, or legally protected 

statuses.  The College will not tolerate harassing conduct that affects tangible benefits of 

education, that interferes unreasonably with an individual’s educational performance, or that 

creates an intimidating, hostile, or offensive educational environment.  Such harassment may 

include, for example, jokes about another person’s protected status, kidding, teasing or practical 

jokes directed at a person based on his or her protected status. 

 

Sexual harassment deserves special mention.  Sexual harassment is conduct based on sex, 

whether directed towards a person of the opposite or same sex, and may include explicit sexual 

propositions, sexual innuendo, suggestive comments, sexually oriented “kidding” or “teasing,” 

“practical jokes,” jokes about obscene printed or visual material, and physical contact such as 

patting, pinching, or brushing against another person’s body.  Unwelcome sexual advances, 

requests for sexual favors, and other physical, verbal, or visual conduct based on sex constitute 

sexual harassment when: 

 

1) the student’s submission to such conduct is either explicitly or implicitly made a term or 

condition of receiving an education; 

 

2) the student’s submission to or rejection of such conduct is used to influence the student’s 

educational development or participation in any College activity or program, including 

but not limited to:  whether the student will be admitted to the College; the educational 

performance required or expected of the student; the attendance or assignment 

requirements applicable to the student; the courses, fields of study or programs (including 

honors and graduate programs) to which the student will be admitted; what placement or 

course proficiency requirements are applicable to the student; the quality of instruction 

the student will receive; what tuition or fees are required of the student; what scholarship 

opportunities are available to the student; what extracurricular teams the student will be a 

http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?
http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?section=6000


member of or in what competitions the student will participate; any grade the student will 

receive in any examination, course or program of instruction; the progress of the student 

toward successful completion of a course or program or graduation; what degree, if any, 

the student will receive; or 

 

3) the conduct has the purpose or effect of unreasonably interfering with an individual’s 

educational performance or creating an intimidating, hostile, or offensive educational 

environment. 

 

Danville Area Community College is committed to maintaining a work environment that is free 

of discrimination and will post, in accordance with Public Act 96-574, in prominent and 

accessible areas, information outlining sexual harassment laws and policies. 

 

All College students and employees are responsible to help assure that we avoid harassment 

regardless of whether the harassment has yet reached a severe or pervasive level that is 

considered a violation of the law.  If any student of the College feels that he/she has experienced 

or witnessed harassment, he/she is required to notify the College’s Affirmative Action Officer, 

Jill Cranmore, Director of Human Resources, 217.443.8756, the College’s Dean, Student 

Services, Stacy Ehmen, 217.443.8746 or the President, Dr. Stephen Nacco, 217.443.8848.  If any 

WIOA/VCW participant feels that he/she has experienced or witnessed harassment, he/she is to 

notify Jonathan Jett, Assistant Director, VCW/WIOA, WIOA/EEO Officer, at 442-3044, Ext. 

239.  The College forbids retaliation against anyone for reporting harassment, assisting in 

reporting harassment or cooperating in a harassment investigation.  If any student feels that 

he/she has been retaliated against, he/she is to notify the College’s Affirmative Action Officer, 

Jill Cranmore, Director of Human Resources, 217.443.8756, or the Dean, Student Services, 

Stacy Ehmen, 217.443.8746.  If any WIOA/VCW participant feels that he/she has been retaliated 

against, he/she is to notify Jonathan Jett, Assistant Director, VCW/WIOA, WIOA/EEO Officer, 

at 442-3044, Ext. 239. 

 

The College’s policy is to investigate all harassment complaints made under this policy 

impartially, thoroughly and promptly.  To the fullest extent possible, the College will keep 

harassment complaints, records related to harassment complaints, and the terms of the 

complaint’s resolution confidential.  If an investigation confirms that a violation of the policy has 

occurred, Danville Area Community College will take appropriate corrective action to stop the 

harassment and to ensure that the harassment does not reoccur.  Such corrective action may 

include training of harasser, monitoring of harasser and/or academic or job-related discipline of 

the harasser proportional to the offense, up to and including expulsion or discharge. 

 

 

Adopted:  7-28-92; Revised (from Sexual Harassment Policy 4053) 9-26-00; Revised 3-23-04; 

Revised 5-24-05; Revised 11-15-05; Revised 1-26-10; Revised 12-14-10; Revised 8-23-11; 

Revised:  11-26-13; Revised:  9-27-16; Revised:   

__________________________________ 
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Title IX – Prohibiting Discrimination on the Basis of Gender 4003.3 

(including Sexual Harassment) 

 

Title IX of the Education Amendments of 1972, is a Federal civil rights law that prohibits 

discrimination on the basis of sex in education programs and activities.  Danville Area Community 

College does not tolerate discrimination of any kind.  Under Title IX, discrimination on the basis of 

sex can include sexual harassment or sexual violence, such as rape, sexual assault, sexual battery, 

stalking and sexual coercion.  These behaviors are harmful to the well-being of our students, 

community members and employees. 

 

All forms of prohibited conduct under this policy are regarded as serious College offenses, and 

violations will result in discipline, including the possibility of separation from the College.  The 

College will respond to complaints or reports about prohibited conduct with measures designed to stop 

the behavior.  The College must conduct an investigation regardless of how it was brought to the 

College’s attention.  All investigations will be conducted independent of police investigations, if 

applicable.  Danville Area Community College forbids any form of retaliation against anyone for 

reporting, assisting in reporting or cooperating in an investigation.  This policy also ensures that the 

Violence Against Women Act (VAWA), Pregnancy Act and Clery Act are properly enforced. 

 

The College has designated a Title IX Coordinator who is responsible for coordinating the College’s 

compliance with Title IX.  Questions or concerns may be addressed to: 

 

Jill Cranmore, Director of Human Resources 

Title IX Coordinator/Affirmative Action Officer 

 

Danville Area Community College, Human Resources Department 

2000 East Main Street 

Vermilion Hall, Room 211 

Danville, IL  61832 

 

Phone: 217-443-8756 

Fax: 217-443-8560 

Email: jcranmore@dacc.edu 

 

You may also contact the Office of Civil Rights at 1-800-421-3481 or ocr@ed.gov. 

 

Title IX prohibits any sex-based harassment by peers, students, employees or third parties, including 

harassment that is sufficiently serious to deny or limit a student’s ability to participate in or benefit 

from the recipient’s education programs and activities, also known as creating a hostile environment. 

http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?
http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?section=6000
mailto:jcranmore@dacc.edu
mailto:ocr@ed.gov


 

Title IX prohibits several types of sex-based harassment.  Sexual harassment is unwelcome conduct of 

a sexual nature, such as unwelcome sexual advances, requests for sexual favors, and other verbal, 

nonverbal or physical conduct of a sexual nature.  Gender-based harassment is another form of sex-

based harassment.  Consideration for employment, promotion or termination based upon gender or 

gender-related issues such as pregnancy will be prohibited.  The failure to provide equal opportunity in 

athletics and the discrimination based upon pregnancy involving any student will be prohibited.  Title 

IX protects all students and employees, regardless of the gender of all parties involved. 

 

The procedures follow the College’s Complaints/Grievances and Resolution Procedures. 

 

Any complaint of a sexual nature should be immediately reported to the Title IX Coordinator, Jill 

Cranmore, Director of Human Resources, or any administrator at the College, such as Dave 

Kietzmann, Vice President of Instruction, or Dr. Stephen Nacco, President.  Any Vermilion County 

Works students may notify Jonathan Jett at the Vermilion County Works office. 

Adopted:  10-27-15; Revised:  9-27-16; Revised:   

__________________________________ 
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Board Consideration of Tenure Recommendation 
1. R.J. Rowland, Instructor, Welding 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Agenda Item:  12A 
 
Agenda Title: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF TENURE RECOMMENDATION 

1. R.J. Rowland, Instructor, Welding 
 
Meeting Date: October 22, 2020 
 
Resource: Terri Cummings, Dr. Natalie Page, Dr. Stephen Nacco 
   
Submitted for: Action 
 
Summary: Full-time faculty members completing their third academic year of probation must be 

granted tenure, extended another year of probation, or dismissed. Attached is the 
recommendation for approval of tenure status for the individual listed above. Dr. Natalie 
Page and the respective supervisor have evaluated his performance and personnel files to 
ensure that his credentials are in order. This outstanding faculty member is an asset to the 
instructional programs at Danville Area Community College. It is our honor and privilege 
to recommend so many newer and talented faculty members for tenure status. This 
individual is a superior classroom teacher who will serve DACC well into the future.  

 
 
 
 

 
. 
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Board Consideration of Revised Notice of  
Filing Petitions for Membership on the Board of  

Trustees of Community College District Number 507 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  12B 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF REVISED NOTICE OF FILING 

PETITIONS FOR MEMBERSHIP ON THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF 
COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT NUMBER 507 

 
DATE:   October 22, 2020 
 
RESOURCE:  Kerri Thurman, Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: At the September 24, 2020 meeting, the Board approved a Resolution for 

Community College Election which included a Notice of Filing Petitions for 
Membership on the Board of Trustees of Community College District 
Number 507.  The Notice of Filing Petitions had an incorrect date of 
December 20 versus December 18.  The Notice of Filing Petitions with the 
corrected date has been sent to the local newspapers for publication so that 
prospective candidates have sufficient time to pick up petitions before the 
December filing dates. 
 
 

 
 



 
 

NOTICE OF FILING PETITIONS 
FOR MEMBERSHIP ON THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF 

COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT NUMBER 507 
 
 

 Notice is hereby given that all petitions for the 
nomination of two board members for full terms of six 
years on the Board of Trustees of Community College 
District Number 507 (Danville Area Community College), 
Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford Counties, 
Illinois shall be filed not earlier than December 14, 2020 nor 
later than December 21, 2020; at the Office of the Board 
Secretary in Vermilion Hall, Room 202, Danville Area 
Community College, 2000 East Main Street, Danville, 
Illinois with Secretary of the Board of Trustees of said 
District. 
 Nominating petitions shall be filed between the hours 
of 8 a.m. and 5 p.m. on December 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, or 21, 
2020. 
 Prospective candidates may pick up Nominating 
Petitions along with applicable documents in the Office of 
the Board Secretary or her designee at the address stated 
above. 
 Dated at Danville, Illinois this 24th day of September, 
2020. 
 
    David W. Harby, Chairperson 
    Kerri Thurman, Board Secretary   
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Board Consideration of  
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AGENDA ITEM:  12C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 
 
DATE:   October 22, 2020 
 
RESOURCE:  Jill Cranmore, Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human 

Resources processes being met.   
 
        

1. New Employees – Full-Time 
  

None 
  
2. New Employees – Part-Time 
 

(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 

Marruffo, Adrian – TRIO Professional Tutor, TRIO/Student Success 
Center 
Effective Date:  September 8, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $19.47 per hour 

 
Nasser, Dawn – Co-Chair, Governance, President’s Office 
Effective Date:  September 1, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $2,000.00 annually 

 
Pate, Rena – TRIO Professional Tutor, TRIO/Student Success Center 
Effective Date:  September 29, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $19.47 per hour 

 
Snider, Hannah – Substitute Teacher, Child Development Center 
Effective Date:  September 14, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $15.56 per hour 

 
Student Workers 

 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contracts) 

  
Blodgett, Peyton – Student Employee, Security Checkpoint 
Effective Date:  September 15, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 



  
Foster, Jessica – Student Employee, Library 
Effective Date:  September 21, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Gifford, Hailee - Student Employee, Security Checkpoint 
Effective Date:  September 28, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Hill, Macallister – Student Employee, Security Checkpoint 
Effective Date:  October 5, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Humblet, Patience – Student Employee, Liberal Arts 
Effective Date:  September 28, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Jackson, Lillian Mae – Student Employee, Security Checkpoint 
Effective Date:  September 22, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Johnson, Linda – Student Employee, Security Checkpoint 
Effective Date:  September 14, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
McClyde, Tre’von – Student Employee, Security Checkpoint 
Effective Date:  September 17, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
McTagertt, Ashlynn – Student Employee, Child Development Center 
Effective Date:  September 22, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Phebus, Brianna – Student Employee, Security Checkpoint 
Effective Date:  September 21, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Walder, Joanna – Student Employee, Hoopeston Higher Learning Center 
Effective Date:  September 21, 2020 through June 30, 2021 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
3. Resignations 
 

Connor, Brandice – Literacy Coordinator, Adult Education 
Effective Date:  October 7, 2020 

 



Nichols, Carol – Director, Small Business Development Center 
Effective Date:  December 31, 2020 

 
4. Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Fall Semester 2020 (see 

following pages) 
 
 
 
 

 
 

















































































 BOARD AGENDA ITEM 12D 
 
 
 
 
 
  

Board Consideration of Bids for Computer Equipment 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  12D  
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR COMPUTER EQUIPMENT 
 
DATE:   October 22, 2020 
 
RESOURCE:  Mark Barnes, Tammy Betancourt, Carl Lewis, Kerri Thurman  
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised in the News Gazette and Commercial News (including the 

internet) for computer equipment approved on the FY21 Capital Equipment 
list.  Bids were requested for 200 NEC MultiSync E245WMi-BK LED 
monitors 24", 50 Lenovo Tower Computers, 33 Lenovo Small Form Factor 
Computers, 15 Lenovo Thinkpad P1 (3rd Gen) – 15.6” –  Core i7, and 25 
Lenovo M920q - tiny - Corei7 8700T 2.4GHz. Bid packets were sent to the 
following suppliers and opened at 10:00 AM on October 14, 2020 with the 
following results: 

 
$ 170,233.00  Y&S Technologies, Lone Tree, CO 
$ 180,374.60  ACP CreativIT LLC, Buffalo Grove, IL 
$ 168,796.45*  CDW-G, Vernon Hills, IL 

 $ 161,551.00*  Staples, Deerfield Beach, FL 
$   48,728.00**  Microage, Glenview, IL 
$   84,388.35**  Pro Tech Computer Systems, Castle Rock, CO 
NO BID  DHE Computer Systems, Centennial, CO 
NO BID***  ByteSpeed, Moorhead, MN 
NO BID  Connection, Merrimak, NH 
NO BID  JPC IT Solutions, Sioux Fall, SD 
NO BID***  Arnold’s Office Supply, Danville, IL 
NO BID  Strictly Technology, Fort Lauderdale, FL 
NO BID  Zones, Inc, Auburn, WA 
NO BID  Deltek, Seattle, WA 
NO BID  TBF Computing, Inc., Kennesaw, GA 
NO BID  Firefly Computers, St. Paul, MN 
NO BID  Education Intelligence, Inc., Nashville, TN  
 
*      Did not meet bid specifications. 
**    Did not quote all items. 
***  Declined to bid. 

   
This equipment was approved on the FY-21 Capital Equipment List and funding 
will be through Technology/Equipment Bonds. 
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