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Mission Statement  
 

Danville Area Community College is committed to providing 
quality, innovative, and accessible learning experiences which 
meet the life-long academic, cultural, and economic needs of 

our diverse communities and the world we share. 
 
 

Non-Discrimination Statement 
Danville Area Community College does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, disability 

or age in its programs and activities.  Inquiries may be directed to Jill A. Cranmore, Vice President, Human 
Resources, Affirmative Action Officer, Title IX Coordinator, and Section 504/ADA Coordinator, Danville Area 
Community College, 2000 E. Main St., Martin Luther King Memorial Way, Danville, IL  61832-5199, 217-443-

8756, or jcranmore@dacc.edu. 

      
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
  

 
 
Danville Area Community College will continue to be nationally recognized leader in student 
success and an active partner in building and maintaining academic excellence and the 
economic vitality of the communities it serves. 

 
 

Core Values 

Integrity     
Trusting relationships and an ethical reputation with those we serve (students, faculty, 
employees, community, business, other educational institutions, government). 

Excellence 
Consistently achieving exceptional results that delight those we serve. 

Communication 
Positive and productive relationships and environment for those we serve. 

Adaptability 
Continuously meeting the changing needs of those we serve. 

Diversity 
Providing a safe and secure learning environment for the personal and intellectual 
growth of those we serve, preparing them to participate in an increasingly changing 
world.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Vision Statement 
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BOARD OF TRUSTEES 

Community College District No. 507 
Regular Meeting 
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5:30 p.m. 
 

 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order 

2. Pledge of Allegiance 

3. Roll Call 

4. Adoption of Agenda 

5. Recognition of Visitors 

6. Recognition of Men’s and Women’s Cross Country Teams 

7. Continuing Education Report 

8. Financial Update 

9. President’s Report 

10. Public Comment 

 

12. Unfinished Business 

13.    New Business 

 A. Board Consideration of Approval of Travel Expenditures for Trustees 

 B. Board Consideration of Workers Compensation Insurance  

 C. Board Consideration of Bids for Bremer Theater Sound System Replacement 

 D. Board Consideration of Revising Fees in the Child Development Center 

14. Information 

 A. Communications 

 

Consent Agenda Items are considered to be routine, non-controversial matters and will be considered together and 
enacted by one motion and one roll call.  Any Trustee desiring to remove an item for separate consideration should so 
request before approval of the agenda. 
 

11. Consent Agenda  

A. Board Consideration of the Minutes of the Special Board Meeting of November              

7, 2018; and the Regular Board Meeting of November 15, 2018 

B. Financial Report 

C. Human Resources Report 

D. Board Consideration of Board Policy Revisions 

1. Board Policy #2004 – Institutional Accreditation 

2. Board Policy #2007 – Graduation Requirements 

3. Board Policy #3025 – Tuition Waivers  
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DECEMBER 2018 

   17 Winter Term Begins 

          24-25 Christmas Holiday – College Closed 

          26-31 Holiday Break – All Offices Closed 

JANUARY 2019 

     1 New Year’s Day Holiday – College Closed 

     4 Winter Term Ends 

  9-10 Faculty/Staff In-Service Days 

    11 Faculty Preparation Day 

    14 Spring Classes Begin 

    21 M.L. King’s Birthday Holiday – College Closed 

    24 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting; 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

FEBRUARY 2019 

    18 Presidents’ Holiday – College Closed 

    28 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting; 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

     MARCH 2019 

 19-23 NJCAA Division II Men’s Basketball National Tournament 

 25-29 Semester Break – No Classes, Offices Open 

    28 DACC Board of Trustees Meeting; 5:30 p.m., Vermilion Hall Room 302 

15. Closed Session for Discussion of the Purchase or Lease of Real Property for the Use of the 

Public Body 

16. Adjournment 
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Recognition of Men’s and Women’s  

Cross Country Teams 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 7 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Continuing Education Report 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 8 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Financial Update 



     

FY19 FY18
OPERATING FUNDS FULL YR YTD % YTD YTD

(EDUCATION; OPERATIONS & MAINTENANCE) PROP BUDG 11/30/2018 OF TOTAL 11/30/2017 %

REVENUES

1   Property Tax Revenue 4,698,000 1,186,637 25 % (A) 1,149,491 25%
2   Personal Property Replacement Tax (PPRT) 525,000 87,929 17 % (B) 71,758 12%
3   ICCB Base Operating Grants 1,542,760 488,248 32 % (C) 1,331,634 56%
4   ICCB Equalization Grant 2,052,760 342,126 17 % (C) 1,380,412 48%
5   CTE Vocational Cr Hr Reimbursement 170,000 0 0 % (C) 195,820 54%
6   Tuition 7,200,000 5,815,365 81 % (D) 5,960,518 85%
7   Fees 1,500,000 1,067,068 71 % (D) 1,179,291 78%
8   Less:  Institutional Scholarships/Waivers (1,705,000) (1,394,586) 82 % (D) (1,179,211) 91%
9   Interest Income 11,000 20,434 186 % (E) 6,507 118%

10   Transfers from Other Funds 430,000 13,118 3 % (E) 14,600 3%
11   Facility Rent Revenue/Chargebacks/Other 212,100 37,416 18 % (E) 44,457 20%

12 TOTAL OPERATING REVENUES 16,636,620 7,663,755 46 % 10,155,277 54%

EXPENDITURES BY OBJECT

13   Salaries 10,797,599 4,434,900 41 % 4,204,822 41%
14   Employee Benefits 2,341,705 945,464 40 % 1,084,752 44%
15   Contractual Services 592,345 222,780 38 % 156,948 29%
16   Materials & Supplies 1,507,653 945,896 63 % (F) 878,544 63%
17   Meetings, Travel, Conferences 242,441 45,503 19 % (E) 49,622 23%
18   Fixed Charges 248,377 160,519 65 % (E) 137,232 63%
19   Utilities 810,000 294,043 36 % (G) 302,048 37%
20   Capital Outlay 24,500 13,500 55 % (E) 28,799 82%
21   Transfers to other Funds/Other 72,000 13,918 19 % (E) 32,486 39%

22 TOTAL OPERATING EXPENDITURES 16,636,620 7,076,523 43 % 6,875,253 43%

23 NET REVENUE/(EXPENDITURE) 0 587,232 3,280,024

NOTES:

(A) Amounts are recorded quarterly at the end of each quarter.
(B) Majority of revenue is received in the second half of the fiscal year.
(C) Amounts received from ICCB will not be even.  Base Operating includes Performance Based Funding.
(D) Revenue is primarily received at the beginning of each semester and institutional waivers/scholarships are awarded

    near the beginning of the semester.
(E) This revenue or expense item does not occur evenly over the year; interest rates are higher than expected.
(F) Instructional material and supply spending is accelerated prior to the beginning of each semester.
(G) Payments on utility bills are approximately two months in arrears.  Invoice for July service has a

   billing date of August and a payment due date of September.

DANVILLE AREA COMMUNITY COLLEGE

FINANCIAL STATEMENT OF REVENUE AND EXPENDITURES
FOR  THE OPERATING FUNDS

       FY19 - Year to Date - July 1, 2018 - November 30, 2018
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President’s Report 



 
 
    BOARD AGENDA ITEM 10 
 
 
 
 
 
  

 
Public Comment 



 CONSENT AGENDA ITEM 11A    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Board Consideration of the Minutes of the  
Special Board Meeting of November 7, 2018; and  

the Regular Board Meeting of November 15, 2018 



 
 
 
 
MINUTES OF SPECIAL MEETING – November 7, 2018 
On November 7, 2018, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford, in the State of Illinois, met in 
special session at 24 North Jackson Street, Danville, Illinois.     
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
The meeting was called to order at 6:04 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: ROLL CALL 
Roll was called.  Trustees present:  Bill Black, Tracy Cherry, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, Dr. Ron 
Serfoss, John Spezia, Greg Wolfe, and Student Trustee Addison Wise.     
 
Others present:  President Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, John Kraft and 
Robert Bogue.     
 
Media present:   None 
 
ITEM 3: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the agenda was adopted.  The motion 
passed by unanimous voice vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 4: PUBLIC COMMENT 
Mr. John Kraft and Mr. Robert Bogue addressed the Board members and then left the meeting at 
6:10 p.m. 
 
ITEM 5: MOTION FOR CLOSED SESSION 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Black, the following resolution was adopted 
by unanimous roll call vote (8 yeas, 0 nays): 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 120/2 of the Open Meetings 
Act, the Board of Trustees of Community College District #507 shall enter a Closed Session for 
purposes specified in Paragraph (c)(1) and (c)(21), specifically matters pertaining to the annual 
evaluation of the President and approval of the written Closed Session Minutes of August 29, 
2018.   
 
ITEM 6: CLOSED SESSION TO DISCUSS THE ANNUAL EVALUATION OF THE 

PRESIDENT AND APPROVAL OF THE WRITTEN CLOSED SESSION 
MINUTES DATED AUGUST 29, 2018   

The meeting went into Closed Session at 6:14 p.m.   
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board entered into Open Session at 
8:16 p.m.  The motion passed by unanimous voice vote (8 yeas, 0 nays).   
 
ITEM 7: DISCUSSION OF BOARD SELF-EVALUATION 
Dr. Nacco noted that at the January retreat, there are plans to update the Board on the upcoming 
HLC visit.  The Trustees discussed each of the statements on the evaluation tool in detail.   
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The Trustees also discussed how to share ideas with the President; the need for an athletic report; 
the need for a better understanding of the Matrix and the accomplishments and progress; that the 
Trustees hire the President to run the College; that the Board is a well-rounded diverse group that 
is focused on the mission of the College; and that they recognize that they are a governance 
board, not an operating board.  Additionally, there was concern expressed regarding the 
attendees of the agenda review prior to the regular Board meeting.           
 
ITEM 8: ADJOURNMENT   
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 9:02 p.m.                       
      

 
    
      _____________________________________ 
      Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
       
 
      _____________________________________ 
      Secretary, Board of Trustees      _
 
 
Approved: ___________________________                                                           



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING of November 15, 2018 
On November 15, 2018, the Board of Trustees of Community College District 507, in the 
Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign, and Ford in the State of Illinois, met in 
regular session in the Board Room, Vermilion Hall Room 302 at Danville Area Community 
College.       
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER 
Chairman Dave Harby called the meeting to order at 5:30 p.m. 
 
ITEM 2: PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
Ms. Lynette Fuiten, Business Administrative Technology Student, led the Board and those 
in attendance in reciting the Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag.     
 
ITEM 3: ROLL CALL 
The roll was called.  Trustees present:  Bill Black, Tracy Cherry, Dave Harby, Terry Hill, 
Dr. Ron Serfoss, Greg Wolfe, and Student Trustee Addison Wise.  Trustees absent:  John 
Spezia (arrived at 5:32 p.m.)   
 
Others present:  President Dr. Stephen Nacco, Board Secretary Kerri Thurman, Dave 
Kietzmann, Tammy Betancourt, Jill Cranmore, Mike Cunningham, Lara Conklin, Brian 
Hensgen, Andrew Mudd, Mark Barnes, Dr. Penny McConnell, Terri Cummings, Shanay 
Wright, Doug Hunter, Ashley Hargrove, Arthur Cronkhite, John Kraft, Rob Bogue, 
Lynnette Fuiten, Jared Cox, Michelle Allen, Hallie Lock, Alek Cummings, Jennifer 
Banaszak, and Erika Solis.                                                                                                            
 
Media present:  None.    
 
ITEM 4: ADOPTION OF AGENDA 
Mr. Harby asked if there were any changes requested to the agenda.  With no changes 
requested, upon motion by Mr. Hill, and a second by Mr. Black, the agenda was approved 
as presented.  The motion passed by unanimous voice vote:  7 yeas, 0 nays.   
 
ITEM 5: RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 
Dr. Nacco introduced the following members of the Administrative Council:  Dave 
Kietzmann, Executive Vice President of Instruction and Student Services; Tammy 
Betancourt, Vice President, Finance/Chief Financial Officer; Jill Cranmore, Vice President, 
Human Resources; Mike Cunningham, Vice President, Administrative Services; Lara 
Conklin, Executive Director, College Relations; and Brian Hensgen, Executive Director, 
Workforce Development.  Also present:  Andrew Mudd, Davis & Delanois; Mark Barnes, 
Director, Computer Networking and End User Services; Dr. Penny McConnell, Dean, 
Liberal Arts and Library Services; Terri Cummings, Dean, Business & Technology; Shanay 
Wright, Director, TRIO and Student Success Center; Doug Hunter, Instructor, 
Mechatronics; Ashley Hargrove, Instructor, Business Administrative Technology; Arthur 
Cronkhite; John Kraft; Rob Bogue; and Students Lynnette Fuiten, Jared Cox, Michelle 
Allen, Hallie Lock, Alek Cummings, Jennifer Banaszak, and Erika Solis.       
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Media present:  None.   
 
ITEM 6: SECOND CHANCE PROGRAM REPORT 
Ms. Tammy Betancourt, Mr. Brian Hensgen, and Ms. Erika Solis provided an update on the 
Second Chance Program.  Committee Member Ms. Betancourt reported the program was 
created in January of 2016 as a way to assist students with account balances to return to 
complete their education.  The program has evolved over time with revisions being made as 
needed to make the program what it is currently.  There have been five completers of the 
program with a total write-off of $6,441; however, 126 additional credit hours have been 
generated with approximately $20,000 being collected in tuition and fees and 
approximately $10,000 in reimbursement from ICCB.  Students have accumulated an 
average GPA of 3.0. 
 
Currently there are 9 participants in the program with 11 applications submitted for Spring 
2019.   
 
Mr. Brian Hensgen is also a member of the Second Chance team and is a mentor to Ms. 
Erika Solis.  As a member of the team, Mr. Hensgen is able to share resources that are 
available to the participants in the area of supportive services.  He introduced Ms. Solis 
who shared her experience in the Second Chance Program. 
 
Other committee members are:  Debbie Knight, Chuck Jones, Stacy Ehmen, Timothy 
Morgan, Shanay Wright, Janet Ingargiola, and Candace McNeal. 
 
The Board and Dr. Nacco thanked Ms. Betancourt, Mr. Hensgen, and Ms. Solis for their 
reports. 
 
ITEM 7: RECOGNITION OF BUSINESS ADMINISTRATIVE TECHNOLOGY 
STUDENTS 
Business Administrative Technology Instructor Ms. Ashley Hargrove introduced the 
following students:  Lynnette Fuiten, Jared Cox, Michelle Allen, Hallie Lock, Alek 
Cummings, and Jennifer Banaszak.   
 
ITEM 8: REPORT ON ACCT ANNUAL LEADERSHIP CONGRESS, 
OCTOBER 24-27, 2018 
Mr. Harby attended the ACCT Annual Leadership Congress in October.  He shared a 
written report and highlights of the conference. 
 
ITEM 9: REPORT ON ICCTA SEMINAR AND BOARD OF 
REPRESENTATIVES MEETING, NOVEMBER 9-10, 2018 
Mr. Wolfe attended the ICCTA Seminar and Board of Representatives meeting last week.  
He also shared a written report and highlights of the meetings.   
 
ITEM 10: FINANCIAL UPDATE 
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Ms. Tammy Betancourt gave a financial update to the Board.  The Financial Statement of 
Revenue and Expenditures ending October 31, 2018 was included in the Board agenda 
book. 
 
ITEM 11: PRESIDENT’S REPORT 
Dr. Nacco shared the DACC Flash with the Board and highlighted the events from the 
month since the last meeting.       
 
ITEM 12: PUBLIC COMMENT 
Mr. Arthur Cronkhite, Mr. John Kraft and Mr. Robert Bogue addressed the Board during 
public comment.       
 
ITEM 13: CONSENT AGENDA 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF THE MINUTES OF THE 
REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF OCTOBER 25, 2018 

B. FINANCIAL REPORT 
C. HUMAN RESOURCES REPORT 
D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY REVISIONS 

1. BOARD POLICY #2009 – CURRICULUM/INSTRUCTION 
COMPLAINTS 

2. BOARD POLICY #5001 – PUBLIC COMMUNICATION 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the items on the 
Consent Agenda.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.    
 
ITEM 14: UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
ITEM 15: NEW BUSINESS 

A. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF MAKING WRITTEN CLOSED 
SESSION MINUTES OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 

Public Act 85-1355 requires community college boards to review the written minutes of 
closed sessions in order to determine which written minutes may be, in whole or in part, 
made a part of the public record.  The following minutes were reviewed:  March 24, 1987; 
September 26, 2000; October 24, 2000; April 26, 2005; May 24, 2005; May 23, 2006; April 
26, 2011; January 25, 2018; April 26, 2018; May 24, 2018; August 29, 2018; and 
November 7, 2018.   
 
The following minutes are being recommended to remain closed to the public:  March 24, 
1987; September 26, 2000; October 24, 2000; April 26, 2005; May 24, 2005; May 23, 
2006; April 26, 2011; and November 7, 2018.  (The November 7, 2018 minutes have not 
been approved by the Board.)  The following minutes are being recommended to be made 
open to the public:  January 25, 2018; April 26, 2018; May 24, 2018; and August 29, 2018. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Wolfe, the Board approved the written 
minutes so noted to remain closed to the public and the written minutes so noted to be 
opened to the public.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
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B. BOARD DISCUSSION OF ARCHITECTURAL SERVICES FOR 
UNSPECIFIED FUTURE PROJECTS 

A Request for Qualifications (RFQ) for architectural services was advertised for 
unspecified future projects.  A committee consisting of Dr. Stephen Nacco, Mike 
Cunningham, Doug Adams, and Kerri Thurman individually reviewed all submissions, 
ranked the architectural firms, and then met to discuss the firms.  Twelve firms requested 
the RFQ with six firms responding.   
 
Based on professional qualifications, familiarity with DACC, previous work for Illinois 
colleges, and being CDB pre-qualified for State financed projects, the committee ranked 
Walton & Associates as the best qualified firm to perform architectural services at DACC.  
The committee also recommends we review this process every three (3) years in order to 
maintain continuity between the architect and the College and to afford the College an 
opportunity to periodically review other architectural firms. 
 
No action was taken as item was for discussion only. 
 

C. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF CONTINUATION OF 
OPERATIONS PLAN 

A draft copy of the proposed Continuation of Operations Plan was included in the agenda 
book.  ICCB has always had the requirement that an academic year must contain 150 days 
of instruction excluding final exam and in-service days.  The new requirement is that 
Colleges must ensure that 150 days of instruction happen each year. 
 
A flexible plan has been developed and approved by all groups across the campus.  
Although the plan could not identify every possible situation, it focuses on flexibility, 
changes to the academic calendar, and strategies for short-term and long-term closures.  
The College needs to adopt and share our plan as soon as possible. 
 
Upon motion by Dr. Serfoss, and a second by Mr. Wolfe, the Board approved the College’s 
Continuation of Operations Plan.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.   
 

D. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF ADOPTION OF REVISED 
MISSION RELATED DOCUMENTS 

The Criterion One Committee of our Higher Learning Commission Leadership Team has 
been conducting an extensive review of the College’s mission related documents.  These 
documents were last revised ten years ago.  The group has met with numerous internal and 
external stakeholders to seek input on the College’s mission documents.  The Criterion One 
Committee is recommending revisions to the Vision Statement and the General Education 
Outcomes.  The Committee feels that these changes more appropriately reflect the 
initiatives and priorities of the College at this time. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the revisions to 
the Vision Statement and the General Education Outcomes.  The motion passed by roll call 
vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays.   
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E. BOARD CONSIDERATION TO ACCEPT THE ANNUAL POST-

ISSUANCE TAX COMPLIANCE REPORT FOR DANVILLE 
AREA COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT NO. 507, 
COUNTIES OF VERMILION, EDGAR, IROQUOIS, 
CHAMPAIGN AND FORD AND THE STATE OF ILLINOIS 

When the District issued Tax Advantaged Obligations (e.g. Tax-Exempt Bonds and/or Debt 
Certificates), the District covenanted generally to take all action necessary to comply with 
the applicable federal tax rules and regulations relating to those obligations, including 
covenants necessary to preserve the excludability of interest in those obligations from gross 
income for federal income taxation purposes.   
 
A Bond Record-Keeping Policy was adopted by the Board of Trustees on December 14, 
2010 and amended on September 23, 2014 as part of the resolution process for the issuance 
of certain Tax Advantaged Obligations.  This Bond-Record Keeping Policy designated the 
Treasurer as the Compliance Officer for Tax Advantaged Obligations compliance purposes.  
Our bond counsel, Chapman and Cutler, LLP has recommended that the Compliance 
Officer prepare and submit an Annual Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report to ensure that 
the Board of Trustees is aware of the District’s compliance with Tax Advantaged 
Obligation covenants. 
 
Included in the agenda book is the Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report which sets forth a 
summary demonstrating the District’s compliance with applicable covenants and 
expectations.  Also included are expenditures for the fiscal year 2018 from the various bond 
issuances.  All of the expenditures were previously approved by the Board either through 
the bid process when required or via the normal monthly disbursement approval process.   
 
Upon motion by Mr. Black, and a second by Ms. Cherry, the Board accepted the annual 
Post-Issuance Tax Compliance Report for Danville Area Community College District No. 
507, Counties of Vermilion, Edgar, Iroquois, Champaign and Ford and the State of Illinois.  
The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 

F. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS TO REPLACE THE 
CHILLER UNIT SERVING THE TECHNOLOGY CENTER 

Bids were advertised to replace the chiller unit serving the Technology Center.  As 
approved by the Board on August 23, 2016 Protection, Health and Safety (PHS) funds will 
be utilized for replacing the Technology Center Chiller Unit.  The approved budget for this 
portion of the project was $119,000.  The project is scheduled for completion by March 30, 
2019. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Black, and a second by Mr. Wolfe, the Board approved the low bid 
from Venture Mechanical in the amount of $83,857.00 to replace the Technology Center 
Chiller Unit using PHS funds.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
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G. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS TO INSTALL 
ELECTRICAL SUPPLY TO 28 WELD BOOTHS IN THE TECH 
CENTER WELD SHOP 

Bids were advertised to furnish all materials and labor necessary to supply electricity to 28 
weld booths in the Tech Center Weld Shop.  This project will supply electricity to the new 
welders approved for purchase at the July 19, 2018 Board meeting.  Funding will be 
through the Perkins grant and Tech Bonds. 
 
Upon motion by Mr. Black, and a second by Mr. Hill, the Board approved the low bid of 
$93,920.91 from Anderson Electric to install electricity to 28 weld booths in the Tech 
Center Weld Shop.  The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
  

H. BOARD CONSIDERATION OF RETIREMENT 
1. JEFFERY RUSH, COORDINATOR, INSTRUCTIONAL 

MEDIA 
Mr. Jeffery Rush, Coordinator, Instructional Media, has requested that his retirement date 
be changed to December 31, 2018 from January 2, 2019.   
 
Upon motion by Mr. Wolfe, and a second by Ms. Cherry, the Board approved the revision 
of the retirement date for Mr. Jeffery Rush from January 2, 2019 to December 31, 2018.   
The motion passed by roll call vote:  8 yeas, 0 nays. 
 
ITEM 16: INFORMATION 

A. COMMUNICATIONS 
 
ITEM 17: ADJOURNMENT 
There being no further business to discuss, Mr. Harby adjourned the meeting at 7:00 p.m.        
 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Chairperson, Board of Trustees 
 
 
     __________________________________________ 
     Secretary, Board of Trustees 
 
 
Approved:  __________________________________  
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Human Resources 
(Recommendations of Employment are conditional upon all Human Resources 
processes being met.) 

 
1. New Employees 
  

 (Notice of Full-Time Probationary Faculty Contracts) 
 
 Nicely, Amy – Chemistry Instructor, Math, Science and Health Professions 
 Effective Date:  January 9, 2019 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $54,300.00 annually. 

 
(Notice of Full-Time Classified Staff Contracts) 
 
Appelman, Tamara –Building Services Attendant, Building Services 
Effective Date:  December 3, 2018 through June 30, 2019 
Rate of Pay:  $27,299.00 annually. 
 
Jenkins, Jess – Building Services Attendant, Building Services 
Effective Date:  November 26, 2018 through June 30, 2019 
Rate of Pay:  $27,299.00 annually. 
 

   2. Student Workers 
 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Ahmed, Halima - Student Employee, Child Development Center 

 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 
 

Aquino, Jessica - Student Employee, Child Development Center 
 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Beckett, Robin - Student Employee, Child Development Center 

 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Drews, Kahler - Student Employee, Child Development Center 

 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Harris, Jacob – Student Employee, Counseling 

 Effective Date:  December 3, 2018 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
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 Student Workers (cont.) 

 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Hernandez, Brycen – Student Employee, Campus Services 

 Effective Date:  November 19, 2018 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 

Hoskins, Ta’Kavion - Student Employee, Child Development Center 
 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Hunt, Alyssa - Student Employee, Child Development Center 

 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Limon, Alejandra – Student Employee, Child Development Center 

 Effective Date:  November 5, 2018 through November 30, 2018  
 Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 

 
Limon, Alejandra – Student Employee, Child Development Center 

 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Potter, Kayla – Student Employee, Math, Science & Health Professions 
Effective Date:  November 12, 2018 through June 30, 2019 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Samet, Elizabeth – Student Employee, Child Development Center 
Effective Date:  November 15, 2018 through November 30, 2018 
Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 
Samet, Elizabeth – Student Employee, Child Development Center 
Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019 
Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 
 
Stalcup, Chloe – Student Employee, Admissions & Records 

 Effective Date:  November 20, 2018 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 
 

Vaughn, Kara - Student Employee, Child Development Center 
 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 
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Student Workers (cont.) 
 
(Notice of Temporary Employment Contract) 
 
Vogel, Kylie - Student Employee, Child Development Center 

 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 

 
Wallace, Stephen - Student Employee, Child Development Center 

 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 
 

Wilson, Jasmine – Student Employee, Child Development Center 
 Effective Date:  November 20, 2018 through November 30, 2018 
 Rate of Pay:  $8.25 per hour 

 
Wilson, Jasmine – Student Employee, Child Development Center 

 Effective Date:  December 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019  
 Rate of Pay:  $10.00 per hour 
 
3. Promotion 
 
 Miles, Jessica – Programmer/Systems Administrator, Finance 
 Effective Date:  December 17, 2018 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $54,000.00 annually. 
 

Scott, Stephen – Office Specialist, Records and Admissions 
 Effective Date: December 3, 2018 through June 30, 2019 
 Rate of Pay:  $32,977.00 annually.  
 
4. Part-time and Additional Instructor Salaries, Fall Semester 2018 
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5. Authorization for Employment 

 
 

AUTHORIZATION FOR EMPLOYMENT 
December 13, 2018 

Name Position Beginning 
Date 

Ending 
Date 

Scheduled 
No. of Hours 

* 

Wage 

Hargrove, 
Ashley 

Liberal Arts / 
Writing Center

11/13/2018 6/30/19 10 18.53 
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Board Consideration of Board Policy Revisions 

1.   Board Policy #2004 – Institutional Accreditation 
2. Board Policy #2007 – Graduation Requirements 

3. Board Policy #3025 – Tuition Waivers 
 
 

  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:  11D 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BOARD POLICY REVISIONS 

1. Board Policy #2004 – Institutional Accreditation 
2. Board Policy #2007 – Graduation Requirements 
3. Board Policy #3025 – Tuition Waivers 

 
DATE:   December 13, 2018 
 
RESOURCE:  Dr. Stephen Nacco 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: 1. Board Policy #2004 – Institutional Accreditation 
 

The proposed revision removes “North Central Association of Colleges and 
Secondary Schools” and replaces it with the “Higher Learning Commission.”     
 
2. Board Policy #2007 – Graduation Requirements 
 
The proposed revision creates more generic verbiage regarding the degrees 
and certificates granted by the College.  The revision also eliminates the need 
to revise the policy every time a degree is added.        

 
 
   3.  Board Policy #3025 – Tuition Waivers 
 

The proposed revision updates the language in the Bonus Courses section and 
adds a new section for engineering students.  Incoming engineering students 
who identify themselves as engineering students AND who pass MATH120 
with a B or higher will receive a tuition waiver for MATH130 and PHYS106.  
The revision also updates the athletic waivers chart to include the addition of 
the waivers for Men’s and Women’s Golf.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
RECOMMENDATION:   May we ask the Board to approve the revisions of Board Policy #2004 

– Institutional Accreditation, Board Policy #2007 – Graduation 
Requirements, and Board Policy #3025 – Tuition Waivers.   



 
 

Board Policies and Procedures Manual  

 

Index | Section 2000 – Academic Services 

Institutional Accreditation            2004 

 

To ensure quality instructional programs, it shall be the policy of the Board of Trustees that the 

College maintain accreditation membership in the Higher Learning Commission North Central 

Association of Colleges and Secondary Schools, and recognition status of the Illinois Community 

College Board.  Specialized accreditation of individual programs will be sought upon approval of the 

Board of Trustees. 

 

 

Adopted:  7-28-92; Revised:   

 

__________________________________ 
 

http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?
http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?section=6000


 
 

Board Policies and Procedures Manual  

 

Index | Section 2000 – Academic Services 

Graduation Requirements            2007 

 

Danville Area Community College is authorized to grant associate degrees, including transfer and 

career, and career certificates the following degrees to students who successfully complete the 

requirements of certain prescribed curricula developed by the College.: 

Associate in Arts 

Associate in Applies Science 

Associate in Science 

 

The requirements for each degree and certificate will be recommended by the faculty and approved by 

the President.  The requirements shall be based upon the needs and interests of the students and of the 

community, and shall reflect requirements of the State Board, transfer institutions, and/or accrediting 

associations. 

 

 

Adopted:  7-28-92; Revised:   

 

__________________________________ 
 

http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?
http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?section=6000


 
 

Board Policies and Procedures Manual  

 

Index | Section 3000 – Student Personnel  

Tuition Waivers 3025 

 

 

7-County Indiana Area 

Tuition for out-of-state Indiana students residing within a specially designated 7 county area (counties 

include: Vermillion, Parke, Fountain, Warren, Tippecanoe, Benton and Montgomery) shall be waived 

so that the amount charged is equal to 150% of the in-district tuition rate.  All fees are excluded from 

this waiver (technology/activity fees, on-line fees, course fees, includED fees, etc.) and will be charged 

at 100% as applicable. 

 

Out of State 

In accordance with Section 6-4 of the Illinois Community College Act [110 ILCS 805/6-4] the College 

may charge in-district tuition to a student who is an out-of-state resident but who is employed for at 

least 35 hours per week by an entity located in the district or is enrolled in a course that is being 

provided under terms of a contract for services between the employing entity and the College.   

 

For dependents of those individuals, tuition shall be waived so that the amount charged is the in-

district tuition rate.   

 

Senior Citizens 

Tuition for credit courses is waived for in-district students age 60 or older.  The waiver does not 

include technology/activity fees, course fees.  Offerings of Corporate and Community Education are 

exempted from this provision as are all noncredit courses. 

Dual Credit 

Illinois and Indiana high school students who are enrolled in a dual credit course taught either at 

DACC or on-line (excluding College Express and Middle College) will be charged 50% of the 

combined per-credit tuition and per-credit technology and activity fee.  Students who are eligible for 

free-and-reduced lunch will be charged 25% of this combined rate.  In addition, the on-line course fee 

is waived.  However, students continue to be financially responsible for any special course fees and 

course materials. 

All tuition and fees for high school students who are enrolled in a dual credit course taught at the high 

school shall be waived at 100%. 

http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?
http://www.dacc.edu/board/policies/index.php?section=6000


College Express 

High schools will be charged 50% of the in-district tuition rate for high school students who are 

enrolled in a College Express course resulting in a waiver of 50% of the in-district tuition rate.  All 

fees are excluded from this waiver (technology/activity fees, course fees, etc.) and will be charged at 

100% as applicable. 

Middle College 

Middle College program graduates are eligible to receive a one-time $1,000 waiver that covers tuition, 

fees and required books and materials.  This waiver must be utilized within one year of graduation 

from the Middle College program and may be used towards credit courses only. 

Bonus Courses 

Full-time students enrolled in 12 or more credit hours (without the bonus course) may take 1 additional 

course or up to 3 credit hours from the applicable bonus course options for that applicable semester 

and the advertised waiver will be applied toward the bonus course’s tuition and fees the tuition 

and technology/activity fees will be waived.  Students must maintain full-time status “without the 

bonus course” and if the student drops below full-time during the refund period, the waiver will be 

forfeited.  Bonus courses cannot put the student into 20+ credit hours without special permission from 

the Dean of Student Services.  This waiver is for tuition, technology/activity fees and course fees only.  

Students are still financially responsible for books, includED fees, course materials, etc. at 100%.  

Benefits may be restricted for students with other waivers. 

Adult Education Courses 

All tuition and fees for adult education courses shall be waived at 100%. 

 

Athletics 

Athletic waivers may be offered to athletes at the discretion of the applicable head coach, with 

approval by the Athletic Director.  Waivers must follow NJCAA rules and requirements.  While the 

NJCAA allows a maximum number of waivers for each sport, DACC will allow waivers by sport as 

follows:  

Sport DACC Tuition 

Waivers 

NJCAA Div II 

Maximum 

Men’s Basketball 13 15 

Women’s Basketball 13 15 

Men’s Baseball 18 24 

Women’s Softball 18 24 

Men’s Cross Country 7 10 

Women’s Cross Country 7  10 

Men’s Golf 6 10 

Women’s Golf 6 10 

Total 76 88 98 118 

 



 

In order to increase the number of graduates from high schools within District 507 who attend DACC, 

all tuition and fees for athletic-scholarship recipients who are eligible for in-district tuition rates and 

have graduated from an in-district high school will be waived.  Out-of-district athletic scholarship 

recipients will be eligible for a tuition waiver.   

For all second year students receiving athletic scholarships, tuition and all fees will be waived for 

student-athletes under the following conditions: 

 Full-time attendance at DACC the previous year and participation as a scholarship 

athlete. 

 Completion of at least 24 academic credits in accordance with NJCAA definition. 

 A minimum Grade Point Average of 3.0 and be in good standing in accordance with 

NJCAA definition. 

 Recommendation for eligibility for this waiver by both the Athletic Director and by the 

Executive Vice President of Instruction and Student Services. 

 

Cheerleading Squad and Music Ensembles 

 

All tuition and fees for members of the Cheerleading Squad and Music Ensembles who are eligible for 

in-district tuition rates and have graduated from an in-district high school will be waived for the spring 

semester.  Out-of-district members of the Cheerleading Squad and Music Ensembles will be eligible 

for a tuition waiver. 

 

For second year members of the Cheerleading Squad and Music Ensembles, students will be required 

to be full-time (12 or more credits per semester), full-tuition-and-fees paying students during the Fall 

semester, and maintain a 3.0 GPA (according to NJCAA standards) in order to receive the Spring 

semester waiver.  Students will be eligible for this waiver for no more than two (2) years.     

 

The maximum number of annual waivers for the Cheerleading Squad is twelve (12).  In order for the 

cheerleaders to earn the waiver of tuition and fees, cheerleaders will need to continue to meet the 

performance conditions currently prescribed by the coach, which includes representing DACC at 

parades and performances during men’s home basketball games.  During divisional games that DACC 

hosts in which the men’s and women’s teams are both playing, the cheerleaders would be obligated to 

perform during the second half of the women’s game and all or part of the men’s game.     

 

The maximum number of annual waivers for the Music Ensembles is thirty (30).  During the Fall, 

under the Music Ensembles’ Director(s), Music Ensembles members would audition and, pending 

acceptance, attend rehearsals.  During the Spring semester, up to 30 students selected for the ensembles 

would be eligible for last-dollar tuition and fee waivers. 

 

To fulfill their obligation as members of the Music Ensembles, members would be responsible for 

providing a minimum of five performance blocks during the course of the Spring semester.  The nature 

of these blocks will vary, based on the performer’s talent and will be determined at the sole discretion 

of the Ensembles’ Director(s).  Any of the following may qualify as a single performance block: 

 

 Pep Band for a Saturday home basketball game (both men’s and women’s games) 

 Pep Band for DACC (men’s and women’s) home basketball game vs. Parkland 



 Pep Band for three (same day) NJCAA Championship Tournament games 

 Concert Instrumental Ensemble performance 

 College Singers performance or any performance by a DACC choral ensemble 

 Orchestral support for a DACC musical 

 DACC Commencement 

 Other special-event performance 

 

Engineering Waiver 

 

In order to increase enrollment in the Engineering Program in a fashion that does not negatively 

affect completion, incoming engineering students who identify themselves as engineering 

students AND who pass MATH120 with a B or higher, will receive a tuition waiver for 

MATH130 and PHYS106.   

 

Tuition waivers for MATH130 and PHYS106 (9 hours) would be enough savings to attract 

students to our transfer program, while requiring successful completion of MATH120 

guarantees that high performing students are receiving the benefit and thus likely to complete 

the program.  MATH120 and PHYS106 are traditionally the challenging pre-requisite courses 

for the engineering program.  Students who successfully complete these two courses are likely to 

complete the program ensuring dollars earned for the second year of the program. 

 

Employees and Employee Dependents (Board Policy 4001.1) 

 

Full-time employees are eligible to enroll and have the standard in-district tuition rate, 

technology/activity fees, and course fees waived for any Danville Area Community College credit 

course for which they are qualified. Continuing part-time employees are eligible to enroll and have the 

standard in-district tuition rate, technology/activity fees, and course fees waived up to six (6) credit 

hours per semester. Part-time faculty who are teaching at least three credit hours are eligible to enroll 

and have the standard in-district tuition rate, technology/activity fees, and course fees waived up to six 

(6) credit hours per semester during the semester in which the part-time faculty member is teaching.  

As part of the College Wellness program, full-time and continuing part-time employees are eligible to 

have the Fitness Center and Group Fitness continuing education course fees waived after the employee 

has completed the required corresponding four-course credit sequence.  Retirees are also eligible to 

have the Fitness Center and Group Fitness tuition and fees waived. Some courses carry higher tuition 

rates but tuition waivers for those courses are limited to the standard in-district tuition rate. Additional 

costs such as books, IncludEd fees, etc. are not eligible for tuition waivers. 

 

A spouse and dependents of full-time employees are eligible to enroll and have the standard in-district 

tuition rate waived for any Danville Area Community College credit course for which they are 

qualified. A dependent child is defined as the natural or adopted child of the employee or the 

employee's spouse and 26 years of age or under. Course fees are NOT waived for dependents. Where 

courses carry higher tuition rates, tuition waivers for those courses are limited to the standard in-

district tuition rate. Additional costs such as books, IncludEd, fees, etc. are not eligible for tuition 

waivers. 

 

In the event of the death of a full-time employee, the employee’s spouse and/or dependents are eligible 

to enroll and have the standard in-district tuition waived for any DACC credit course for which they 



are qualified. This benefit may continue for up to three (3) academic years following the death of the 

employee. Additional costs such as books, IncludEd fees, etc. are not eligible for tuition waivers. 

 

Tuition waiver forms, which are available in the Human Resources Office and on the DACC website, 

must be completed before the class begins. 

 

Degree credit classes taken through the Corporate and Continuing Education Department are eligible 

for tuition waiver at the discretion of the Executive Vice President for Instruction and Student 

Services. 

 

The Tractor/Trailer Driver Training and CDL programs are not eligible for tuition waivers. 

 

 

Adopted:  3-15-18; Revised:  6-28-18; Revised:  7-19-18; Revised:  9-27-18; Revised:                  
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Board Consideration of Approval of  

Travel Expenditures for Trustees 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 13A 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF TRAVEL 

EXPENDITURES FOR TRUSTEES 
 
MEETING DATE: December 13, 2018 
 
RESOURCE: Dr. Stephen Nacco 
     
SUBMITTED FOR: APPROVAL 
 
SUMMARY: Per Public Law 99-0604, known as the “Local Government Travel 

Expense Control Act,” travel expenses for members of the Board of 
Trustees must be approved at an open meeting of the Board.   

 
A total of $509.03 was expended for travel expenditures for trustees over 
the last month for the ICCTA Seminar for Mr. Greg Wolfe and for the 
AFP Awards Ceremony for Mr. Dave Harby.             
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to approve the travel expenses as listed above.       
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Board Consideration of Workers  

Compensation Insurance 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



 

 

AGENDA ITEM:  13B 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF WORKERS COMPENSATION 

INSURANCE  
 
DATE:   December 13, 2018 
 
RESOURCE: Mike Cunningham 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Our annual Workers Compensation Insurance is scheduled to expire 

December 31, 2018.  Premiums for this insurance are determined by our 
estimated annual payroll, experience mod rate, and Foreign Terrorism and 
Domestic Terrorism coverage.   
 
The January 1, 2018 to December 31, 2018 premium to Zenith Insurance 
for Worker’s Compensation Insurance was $52,886.00.  On behalf of 
Danville Area Community College, ONI Risk Partners requested quotes 
from other insurance underwriters with the following results.   

 
 $ 52,361.00 Zenith Insurance, Springfield, IL 
 $ 78,181.00 Berkshire Hathaway, San Francisco, CA 
 Declined to quote Markel, Omaha, NE 
 
    
  
 Workers Compensation Insurance premiums are paid using Tort Funds.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION 
REQUESTED: May we ask the Board to approve the quote from Zenith Insurance in the 

amount of $52,361.00 for Workers Compensation Insurance for coverage 
from January 1, 2019 through December 31, 2019. 
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Board Consideration of Bids for Bremer Theater  

Sound System Replacement 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



AGENDA ITEM: 13C 
 
AGENDA TITLE: BOARD CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR BREMER THEATER SOUND 

SYSTEM REPLACEMENT 
 
RESOURCE:  Mike Cunningham, Mark Barnes 
 
MEETING DATE: December 13, 2018 
 
SUBMITTED FOR: ACTION 
 
SUMMARY: Bids were advertised for the replacement of the Bremer Theater Sound System. 

This project consists of furnishing all materials, components, and labor 
necessary to provide a complete and operational system.  A pre-bid meeting was 
held November 20, 2018 at 1:00 PM in the Bremer Theater.   

 
 Bids were opened at 10:00 AM November 29, 2018 with the following results. 
 

$ 43,750.00 Thompson Electronics, Peoria, IL 
$ 57,409.00 C.V. Lloyd, Urbana, IL 
$ 74,361.00 Advanced Systems Group, Fort Wayne, IN 
NO BID Audio Revolution, Danville, IL 
NO BID CTI Conference Technologies, East Peoria, IL 
NO BID CIM Technology Solutions, Columbus, IN 
NO BID Encompass AV, Elk Grove Village, IL 
NO BID Senergy Electric, Williamsville, IL 
NO BID CDW-G, Vernon Hills, IL 
NO BID Education Intelligence, Nashville, TN 
 
  
 
This project was approved on the FY-19 Capital Equipment List and funding 
will be through Tech Equipment Bonds. 

 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ACTION: May we ask the Board to consider the low base bid of $43,750.00 from 

Thompson Electronics to replace the Bremer Theater sound system. 
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Agenda Item:   13D 
 
Agenda Title: Board Consideration of Revising Fees in the Child Development Center 
 
Meeting Date December 13, 2018 
 
Resource: Tammy Betancourt, Vice President, Finance and Chief Financial Officer 
 Stacy Ehmen, Dean of Student Services 
 Ana Nasser, Director, Child Development Center 
  
Submitted for: Action 

 
Summary: Our Child Development Center continues to be a center of excellence for 

social, emotional, physical, and intellectual development of a child.  The 
Center recently received the Silver Circle of Quality designation from 
ExceleRate Illinois for the third time—a three-year honor that they have 
earned for seven straight years.  This is not only a distinguished award that 
recognizes the excellent quality of care the Center provides, it qualifies the 
Center to receive a “quality add-on if serving children through IDHS 
Child Care Assistance Program (CCAP).”   

 
The Center also provides an environment for observation and training for 
our DACC students enrolled in Early Childhood Education, Education 
Transfer classes, Nursing, and College Express programs.   Maintaining 
this level of quality service requires staffing and supply resources which 
continue to increase in cost.   

 
Therefore, we are proposing that the rates be increased effective January 
1, 2019 to help offset rising costs related to wages, benefits, food costs, 
and instructional supplies.  The last fee rate increase was 4 1/2 years ago 
in July of 2014.  With these rate changes, the Center remains competitive 
with other providers in the area. 
 
Listed below are the new proposed rates. 
 
DACC Proposed Rates: 

  
 Student 

Weekly 
Rate 

Regular 
Weekly 

Rate 

Daily 
Rate 

    
15 – 23 Months Old $155.00 $170.00 $39.00 
24 Months – 35 months Old $135.00 $150.00 $33.00 
3 Years – 5 Years Old $120.00 $135.00 $31.00 
School Age, 6-12 Years Old $125.00 $130.00 $31.00 

 
 
 
 



 
Registration/Art Fee yearly rate for all                              $ 50.00 

   DACC employees receive a 20% discount from the regular weekly rates. 
 
 
 
Recommendation: May we ask the Board to approve the request to revise the fees in the 

Child Development Center, effective January 1, 2019. 
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Closed Session for Discussion of the Purchase or  

Lease of Real Property for the Use of the Public Body
     
 
 
  
 
  
 
 
 
 
  
 
 



 
 
 
 
 

AGENDA ITEM 15 
 

MOTION FOR CLOSED SESSION 
 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 120/2(c 5) of the 
Open Meetings Act, the Board of Trustees of Community College District #507 shall 
enter a Closed Session for discussion of the purchase or lease of real property for the use 
of the public body.           
 
Dated this 13th day of December, 2018. 
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